MEMORANDUM

TO: Village President and Board of Trustees

FROM: Robert O. Barber, Village Administrator ‘

DATE: Friday, May 11, 2018

RE: VILLAGE ADMINISTRATOR MATERIALS FOR VILLAGE BOARD MEETING

BOARD MEETING DATE: Monday, May 14, 2018 at 7:00 p.m.

AGENDA
I. PLEDGE TO THE FLAG
II. ROLL CALL
III. APPROVAL OF MINUTES
IV. RECOGNITION OF AUDIENCE
V. REPORTS OF VILLAGE COMMISSIONS
1. BEAUTIFICATION COMMISSION - Harold Cowger
2. FOURTH OF JULY COMMISSION - Marcy Meyer/Greg Szymanski
3. YOUTH COMMISSION - Stacy Mazurek
4. RIBBON OF HOPE COMMISSION - Frank Basile

5. HISTORIC PRESERVATION COMMISSION - Scott Wehling



VI. CONSIDER A MOTION APPROVING THE TREASURER’S REPORT AND THE
REPORT OF FINANCIAL ACTIVITY IN THE PRIOR MONTH. - Frank Basile

VII. VARIANCE REPORTS FOR THE PRECEDING MONTH are enclosed for your review -
Frank Basile.

VIII. APPROVAL OF BILLS FOR THE PRIOR MONTH - Frank Basile

IX. (Trustee Mazurek) CONSIDER A MOTION OF NON-OBJECTION TO WILL COUNTY:
PROPOSED SOLAR FARM ON 17 ACRES ON THE NORTH SIDE OF CORNING 1/2 MILE
EAST OF DIXIE HIGHWAY (COMMUNITY POWER GROUP). This farm is located east of
the new church on the north side of Corning. After a review of the enclosed materials and
hearing a power point presentation from the petitioner, the PZC recommended unanimously to
not object to the project. An objection would invoke a 3/4 majority vote of the Will County
Board for passage.

X. (Trustee Meyer) CONSIDER A PROPOSAL FROM TESKA AND ASSOCIATES IN AN
AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $20,000 FOR THE DRAFTING OF A TAX INCREMENT
FINANCING DISTRICT STUDY. Please see the enclosed proposal. Since this process takes
several months we want to get the ball rolling now.

XI. (Trustee Mazurek) CONSIDER AN ORDINANCE UPDATING THE BUILDING AND
ELECTRICAL CODES FOR THE VILLAGE OF BEECHER. The Plumbing Code is under the
jurisdiction of the State but the Village from time to time needs to review its codes for electrical
and building standards. The current codes are from 2005 and 2006 and Safebuilt, our building
department contractor, is recommending we adopt the 2015 codes without a sprinkler
requirement for single family. There are also some other deviations to the code that are
recommended an our building inspector will be at the meeting to explain this new code and the
recommended amendments.

XII. CONSIDER APPOINTMENTS OF THE VILLAGE PRESIDENT. There are two terms
which expire on the PZC and some other appointments the Village President wishes to make.
This list will be provided at the meeting.

XIII. (Trustee Basile) CONSIDER A RESOLUTION ADOPTING AN UPDATED
PERSONNEL MANUAL FOR VILLAGE EMPLOYEES. This is a process we conduct every
four years reviewing our policies and procedures for employee conduct, discipline, payroll,
benefits and other procedural matters. Most of our employees are covered by collective
bargaining agreements so this manual covers those items which are not contained in these
agreements but are important enough to be spelled out. The Village’s labor attorney has
reviewed this agreement and recommends it for approval and he will be presenting it at the
meeting on Monday night. It is recommended that this manual be approved. This is a project we
have been working on for the past few months. Also enclosed is a memo outlining each and
every change that was made to the manual.



XIV. (Trustee Kypuros, Public Works) CONSIDER A MOTION AUTHORIZING THE
PURCHASE OF A 2019 F-250 XL. 4X4 SD SUPER CAB 6.75' BOX 148" WB SRW IN THE
AMOUNT OF $40,641.00 FROM CURRIE MOTORS OF FRANKFORT. This vehicle is part
of the Suburban Purchase Cooperative bid process. It includes the plow upfitting by Lindco so
this truck will be ready to roll once it is delivered to Currie. We are anticipating delivery in the
Fall but need approval to order. Please see the enclosed material.

XV. (Trustee Kypuros, Public Works) CONSIDER AN AGREEMENT WITH HR GREEN IN
THE AMOUNT OF $30,270.00 TO CONDUCT THE FEASIBILITY STUDY AND PERMIT
PROCESS FOR A QUIET ZONE FROM EAGLE LAKE ROAD SOUTH TO INDIANA
AVENUE. This is the first step in getting our quiet zone approved by the Federal Railroad
Administration and the process will take several months. This project is in the approved budget.
It should be noted that this proposal is about $3,000 more than the one quoted to us two years
ago.

XVI. (Trustee Mazurek) CONSIDER AN INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT WITH
THE CHICAGO METROPOLITAN AGENCY FOR PLANNING (CMAP) FOR THE
IMPLEMENTATION OF AN L.T.A. GRANT FOR AN UPDATE OF THE VILLAGE’S
COMPREHENSIVE PLAN. This the agreement that begins the process. Teska is the approved
consulting firm after a lengthy RFP process that was narrowed down to three candidates. Once
this agreement is approved the planning process will begin immediately. Staff recommends
approval of the agreement which is either enclosed for your review or will be provided at the
meeting. CMAP is working feverishly to get this project approved Monday night so work can
begin.

XVIL (Trustee Kraus) REQUEST FOR EXECUTIVE SESSION TO REVIEW TERMS OF A
COLLECTIVE BARGAINNING AGREEMENT WITH TEAMSTERS LOCAL #700. The
union has ratified a tentative agreement between the Village and the police officers and Tim
Guare, the Village’s labor attorney will be asked to attend this session to explain the new
agreement. We will then go back into open session to vote on an oprdinance authorizing the
Village President and Clerk to sign an agreement.

XVIII. OLD BUSINESS
XIX. NEW BUSINESS

XX. ADJOURNMENT

Committee reports will be made at the June 11™ meeting. There is no second meeting in May.



MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING OF THE PRESIDENT
& BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE VILLAGE OF BEECHER
HELD AT THE BEECHER VILLAGE HALL,

625 DIXIE HIGHWAY, BEECHER, ILLINOIS
April 23,2018 -- 7:00 P.M.

All present joined in the Pledge to the Flag.
President Szymanski called the meeting to order.

ROLL CALL

PRESENT: President Szymanski and Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.
ABSENT: Trustee Wehling.

STAFF PRESENT: Clerk Janett Conner, Administrator Robert Barber, Public Works Crew
Leader Matt Conner and Chief Greg Smith.

GUEST: George Schuitema, Sherry Murray, Bill Alexander and Pastor Ron Rock.

President Szymanski asked for consideration of the minutes of the April 9, 2018 Board meeting.

Trustee Meyer made a motion to approve the minutes as written. Trustee Basile seconded the
motion.

AYES: (5) Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.
NAYS: (0) None.

Motion Carried.

CLERK’S REPORT

1) A report on income received since the last meeting was provided. 2) Clerk Conner read aloud a
thank you note from the family of Noel Biery.

RECOGNITION OF AUDIENCE

Pastor Rock of Zion Lutheran Church addressed the Board regarding the Comcast public access
channel. He learned the local Villages are considering discontinuing the channel and said his
church airs their services on the channel along with other local churches. He asked the Board to
be aware of this in making a decision on this channel, which is being discussed later in the meeting.
The church pays $300 per year for airing on the channel. President Szymanski said it was changed
from a public access channel to a government access channel which could increase the Village’s
liability on what is aired. He also said that with changing technology, the channel is not being used
as widely. The Village has created a YouTube channel to put our meetings on to make the meetings
more widely accessible at less cost since the Village was paying WPAL a yearly fee. Trustee
Meyer commented that we have videotaped our meetings since approximately 2000 and make it

Village of Beecher -- Minutes of 4-23-18 Board Meeting



available to the residents. Pastor Rock said their congregation has taken advantage of this channel
over the years and asked that the Village take that into consideration. He also said many of those
watching the channel are not tech savvy and don’t have the internet.

A. FINANCE AND ADMINISTRATION COMMITTEE

Trustee Basile made a motion to open a Public Hearing at 7:12 p.m. to consider a proposed budget
and appropriation ordinance for the year beginning May 1, 2018 and ending April 30, 2019.
Trustee Kraus seconded the motion.

AYES: (5) Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion Carried.

A Public Hearing was held to consider a proposed budget and appropriation ordinance for the year

beginning May 1, 2018 and ending April 30, 2019. Administrator Barber provided a summary of
the budget and explanation of the process.

Board members and the audience were asked if there were any questions or input.

When there was no further discussion, Trustee Kypuros made a motion to close the Public Hearing
at 7:22 p.m. Trustee Mazurek seconded the motion.

AYES: (5) Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion Carried.

RESOLUTION #2018-04 — A Resolution adopting a budget for fiscal year 2018/2019. Trustee
Basile made a motion to adopt Resolution #2018-04. Trustee Meyer seconded the motion.

AYES: (5) Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion Carried.

ORDINANCE #1283 — An Ordinance of appropriation for fiscal year 2018/2019. Trustee Basile
made a motion to approve Ordinance #1283. Trustee Meyer seconded the motion.

AYES: (5) Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion Carried.

RESOLUTION #2018-05 — A Resolution authorizing the expenditure of Motor Fuel Tax funds for
fiscal year 2018/2019. Trustee Basile made a motion to adopt Resolution #2018-05. Trustee
Mazurek seconded the motion.

AYES: (5) Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion Carried.

Village of Beecher -- Minutes of 4-23-18 Board Meeting



ORDINANCE #1284 — An Ordinance of supplemental appropriation for fiscal year 2017/2018
(current year). It was explained that the supplemental appropriation was because during the
course of last year the Village Board approved the purchase of a used dump truck for $45,000 and
received $15,000 in unanticipated grant funds from CSX Railroad ($10,000) and IPRF ($5,000)
for the installation of a portable generator to power the entire police station and this revenue was
received this year. Trustee Basile made a motion to approve Ordinance #1284. Trustee Kypuros
seconded the motion.

AYES: (5) Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion Carried.

Trustee Basile reported that Lauterbach and Amen conducted a pre-audit conference with Village
staff the previous week.

An Eastern Will County Benefits Council health insurance update was provided. Eastern Will
County’s pool fund balance is $888,281 and Beecher’s portion of this balance is $104,725 --
$31,154 of which is unrestricted. Beecher’s insurance rate dropped by 2.6% for the coming year.

B. PUBLIC BUILDINGS AND PROPERTIES, PARKS AND RECREATION
COMMITTEE

Trustee Kraus reported that Firemen’s Park will be used extensively this year with activities
planned in the Park.

An update on ballfield lights for Firemen’s field #2 was provided. Beecher Recreation didn’t let
the Village know that the poles have been put up.

Trustee Kraus reported on the proposed tot lot for Firemen’s Park. Crew Leader Conner said the

equipment needs to be installed at a different location due to existing underground pipes and
utilities.

The condition of Welton Stedt Park infield was provided. Crew Leader Conner said Public Works
has the park looking pretty good and is going to do more work this week.

It was reported that a new generator for the police station was obtained from the U.S. Military
Surplus Program. $10,000 was granted by the CSX Railroad and $5,000 from the Village’s
insurance carrier (IPRF) to have the necessary electrical work done to provide the entire building
with back-up power. The Chief worked out a plan. Electrical work hasn’t begun, but the
generator has been mounted on a trailer.

C. PLANNING, BUILDING AND ZONING COMMITTEE

The Building Department monthly report was provided in the packet for review.

A Planning and Zoning Commission (PZC) meeting is scheduled for Thursday, April 26, 2018.
The Gould Vault has requested an expansion of a special use to extend their outdoor seating area

Village of Beecher -- Minutes of 4-23-18 Board Meeting



further west. Another solar farm proposal from Community Power Group, LLC, has been received,
which is in our 1.5 mile planning area. The solar farm is proposed for the north side of Corning
Road, east of Dixie Highway, just east of the new church.

A CMAP Comprehensive Plan grant update was provided by Trustee Mazurek. Three proposals
were received and interviews were held the previous week with the selection committee. Work
will begin in May and full involvement by the PZC will begin this summer. Community
involvement will begin in the fall, if not sooner. The project cost was estimated at around
$130,000 with the Village’s portion of the cost being 10% upon completion. Administrator
Barber reported three firms were interviewed. PZC Commissioner Schuitema was present for the
selection and felt Teska Associates provided the best presentation and would do the best job.
CMAP agreed to select Teska Associates.

D. PUBLIC SAFETY COMMITTEE

The Police Department monthly report was provided for review.
The EMA monthly report was provided in the packet for review.

Trustee Kraus requested an executive session be held to discuss a list of candidates to be hired as
full-time police officers.

E. PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE

The Water and Sewer Department monthly reports were included in the packet for review.

Trustee Kypuros provided a wastewater treatment plant rehab update. The pre-con meeting will
be held on May 1* at 9 a.m. at the Village Hall. Baxter and Woodman will provide drawings and
complete paperwork for the first draw on the loan.

A Dunbar Street watermain replacement project update was provided. All field work has been

completed and design is in full swing. A permit is being applied for from both the IEPA and the

Will County Highway Department. A meeting is scheduled for Wednesday at 1 p.m. with Baxter
and Woodman to discuss the project.

Trustee Kypuros reported that the Chestnut Street lights have been hooked up and are working.
The residents are happy with the completion of the lighting.

Spring hydrant flushing occurred the previous week.
Street sweeping began on Friday and will be completed by this Friday.

Public Works is creating a list of repairs needed to curbs and sidewalks. Public Works Crew

Leader Conner said Fox Hound Trail is first on the list. He is still working on a list for the rest of
the repairs.

Village of Beecher -- Minutes of 4-23-18 Board Meeting



A report was provided on the Public Works part-time hiring process. Two part-timers were hired
and will start working between now and around Memorial Day.

An update was provided on the Public Works full-time hiring process. Applications for both the
MMI and Class 1 Operator positions are being taken until Friday, May 4". The Committee and
staff will then sift through the applications and decide how to proceed.

Trustee Kypuros made a motion authorizing the Village President to sign an agreement with the
[llinois Department of Transportation (IDOT) regarding improving sidewalk ramps at Pasadena
and Dixie. Trustee Mazurek seconded the motion.

AYES: (5) Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion Carried.

The Board considered approval of payment for two tandem-axle trailers. One is for the new
generator at the Police Department and the other will be used for a landscaping crew trailer for
Public Works. Trustee Kypuros made a motion to approve payment for two tandem-axle trailers
to Funk Trailers of Morris, IL, in the amount of $5,853.00. Trustee Kraus seconded the motion.
AYES: (5) Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion Carried.

F. ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT AND COMMUNITY RELATIONS COMMITTEE

A draft of the spring newsletter was emailed to the Board on Friday and should be mailed to
residents later in the week or early next week.

Trustee Meyer provided a Facebook page update. The page has 680 likes and 710 followers so
far.

The Board discussed repealing Ordinance #1163 creating the Tri-Town Cable Commission. This
Commission was never formed and the relevance of such a commission is no longer valid. Legal
counsel has advised to repeal the ordinance to remove the Village from any future liability.
Trustee Kypuros said that our meetings using WPAL only goes to Comcast customers and not
people who use satellite, etc. He felt there was misinformation on the WPAL Facebook page
regarding the costs to the Village of taking this over.

ORDINANCE #1285 — An Ordinance repealing Ordinance #1163 creating the Tri-Town Cable
Commission. Trustee Meyer made a motion to approve Ordinance #1285. Trustee Kypuros
seconded the motion.

AYES: (5) Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion Carried.

Village of Beecher -- Minutes of 4-23-18 Board Meeting



The Board discussed the creation of a Sesquicentennial Book Committee to publish a new chapter
for the quasquicentennial book covering the last 25 years and making it an insert into the back of
the 1995 book. Funds would have to be raised to pay for the publishing and printing costs.
Trustee Meyer would serve as the commiittee liaison. There were no objections by the Board.

Trustee Meyer made a motion to authorize an award of bid to Dralle Chevrolet in the amount of
$24,826 for a 2018 Chevy Camaro as the Fourth of July raffle car. Trustee Kypuros seconded the
motion.

AYES: (5) Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion Carried.

G. VILLAGE PRESIDENT’S REPORT

President Szymanski read a paragraph of a proclamation declaring Village Clerk’s week and
recognizing Janett Conner as Village Clerk since May, 1993. Trustee Kraus made a motion in
support of the Proclamation. Trustee Basile seconded the motion.

AYES: (5) Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion Carried.

President Szymanski reported that the Illinois Municipal League/Illinois Clerks/South Suburban
Mayors and Managers Lobby Day is scheduled for Wednesday, April 25" in Springfield.

A Crete/CSX intermodal update was provided. Currently, there is no new information. All
information has gone dark, according to President Szymanski.

The Board was reminded about the South Suburban Mayors and Managers dinner meeting to be
held on May 17" at Bult Field, which Beecher is hosting.

Trustee Kypuros made a motion to cancel the May 28" Board meeting, due to the Memorial Day
holiday. Trustee Meyer seconded the motion.

AYES: (5) Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion Carried.

Trustee Kraus made a motion to adjourn into Executive Session at 7:56 p.m. to discuss the hiring
of new police officers. Trustee Meyer seconded the motion.

AYES: (5) Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion Carried.

Village of Beecher -- Minutes of 4-23-18 Board Meeting



Trustee Kraus made a motion to return from Executive Session at 8:19 p.m. Trustee Meyer
seconded the motion.

AYES: (5) Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion Carried.

Trustee Kraus made a motion to validate the Police Department full-timing hiring list dated
November 28, 2017, which ends April 30, 2019. Trustee Basile seconded the motion.

AYES: (5) Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion Carried.

There being no further business, President Szymanski asked for a motion to adjourn. Trustee
Meyer made a motion to adjourn the meeting. Trustee Basile seconded the motion.

AYES: (5) Trustees Basile, Meyer, Kraus, Mazurek and Kypuros.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion Carried.

Meeting adjourned at 8:20 p.m.

Respectfully submitted by:

Janett Conner
Village Clerk

Village of Beecher -- Minutes of 4-23-18 Board Meeting



(sZ'52¢'9L)

86°¢vLL

(00°922°t)
0Ll
LGGLLT

(6¥°v59°L)
9¥'z0L

(€0°cLs‘L)
90
££°00Z
8¢
92'909'6

(£2°890'¥8)

Sh'v
¥Z'0

(s zvz'sl)
zTeoz'Ll
(zervoz'z)
90°00L'v
¥Z°192'sS
(v9'89¢°‘661)
8£'808'svL
(91°896°¢)
(2900¢'vL)
(6v°028°2)

abuey)

& LR I B S R R T Y &

LR A AR A - T T Y

98°66€29v'C

98°96¥'561

S1'9€0°L
76'588've
2.088'C
vTv.8'8S
£5°18L°LL
z8'0.9°CL
v£°860°C
ev'5L9°L
09PLL'LL
60°6€L'ES

8ioz/ocly

00°€06°992°2

9¢g°esL 0z
Lv'260°L
¥6'6.8'629
08°529'€8e
Z5°€L0C
28°22v's9
20°€65'v8Y
6€°61.66
16°9€5°99P
16°199°LY
£9°298°69
€2°6€£'96

810ZI0ErY

LA A e Y A T A T Yo

LL'G2L8E5°T

88°¢6.'281

§L'29LT
vz 8.8've
12’591
€2°82509
20°620°LL
sgegl'vl
88°260°C
oLsiIy'L
z80LL'LL
£8'2es‘ey

8ioc/Lele

€2°126°05€°C

16°8¥1L°0C
£2°260'L
8v°'zZ1'50L
86°ZeY'TLe
ya'viL'el
9.°22¢19
YA TAN T4 4
£0'¥80'662
£6°82LL1E
L0°0£9'SY
0¢'¢91'08
2.°502°'66

g8Loc/LEle

81'09¢'510'C  $ 05°6£8°191L°C
L¥'989'881 ¢ gz'zee'osl
L' 1L66'S $ LY6SE'Y
Z9°618'vE $ SE61L8'vE
vy'Sv6‘lL $ 68'96£'C
12°Z¥8'29 $ 05'¥£8'29
vLOLL'LL $ 8E'SLL'LL
ov's9v'6 $ 66°0c0°LL
L2965 $ ¥1°96S
SL'8eL'e $ 9L/lEL'e
Z6'LELLL ¢ zZ86zL'LL
LE6E9 LY ¢ 80916°C¢
Z10Z/0Elv Z1oziiere
L1°€29°928°L $ 2ZZ'L0S'L86'L
66'619°L¢ $ €6°0L9'.¢
Z8'1L80°L $ 69°180°L
£9°2Z1°€ES ¢ 62°092'059
v 189°LT ¢ g8c0v8'0ee
YANA A A4 ¢ €8'88z'02
9v26'29 $ 66¢5.'V9
LL'816°GZE $ ¥.'695'seZ
90°299'v. $ €.6CL'26C
S8'v€1‘882 $ Lb'€65°961
LL'¥96°LE ¢ 05'Z8L‘8E
6v'sCLL9 $ 6888¢'cL
62°£80°9¥1 $ 9.008'spl
Z10Z/0EIY Z10Z/1LEIE
S3IONVIVE LNNOJOV

H¥3HO339 40 AOVTIIA

B hHHHH YD &*

&

L A A A - - Y N Y

6561000€Y %D
168591 MO
G¥/ES1 MO
€0EESL MO
PrL6L1 %D
G68GEL MO
¢G/6.1 MO
PEBOEL MO
29G0€L D
686201 ™0

equinN

981191 MO
6¥9051 MO
8006 ™D
2001 O
81929 MO
609. ™MD
€70291 MO
0lLz6 ™MD
689201 MO
L#00L O
26965 MO
9106 ™MD

TaquinN

ejol |1

s)29y 2adg @ uoISSIWWOD

adoH jo uoqqry
‘pu| 0Ll mouds3
Jan8|smaN

MO042ST JayonjueN
pung s191yg
uoISSIUWOo) YINOoA
ad @inj|ap04 Jassy
uonesynneag
MO012S] s1ap|ing
Anpe yp

S100Yy 2adg @ UOISSIWWOY
sjunoooy abej|IA (1Y

punpjuisdinbgzded
uondwapay puog
‘}9 |elauag
ajnjonJyseqju|
jenuad

lended S/M
aoe|day utely S/M
'k {o]

192Q S/M

1ang juitop

asnjay

e

junoosay



gl 8l 8l Ll Ll Ll Ll Ll FA" Ll Ll Ll Ll 9l gl al gl 9l gl 9l
gLidy ey ge4 uer 08Q AON /L10 dag Bny Anp aunp Aew 2L idy iepy g4 uep 28Q AON gL10Q deg Bny  Anp sunr Aew gi idy
' L i 1 L 1l ! 1 1 ] i L [l [ SIUTRI O%

i} I

L L 1 1 e | PRSI Ay —

000'002$

000'00v$

8CT'EES 9TE'LTS

000'009%

088°629

000°'008$

000'000°L$

o -——{ 000'002'L$

= puj-yiuojpn-je-pung-jeisusn 000'00V'L$
795'0EL'T \
. - 000°009°L$

L9928’
000°'008'L$

000'000°2$

3 s wo e

-3 ——| 000'002'C$

- 000'00v'2$

00v'z9v'T < < 000'009'2$
s 000'008'¢$

000'000'€$

pu3 YIuoA e sjunoddy ase|Ia




Commission Bills / Non AP Payments

Date Account Num
4/5/2018 4th July,ck102989 3281
4/5/2018 4th July,ck102985 3282
4/5/2018 4th July,ck102989 3283
4/5/2018 4th July,ck102989 3284

4/19/2018 4th July,ck102989 3285
4/19/2018 4th July,ck102989 3286
4/19/2018 4th July,ck102989 3287
4/19/2018 4th july,ck102989 3288
4th July,ck102989 Total
4/2/2018 Central_ck62618 EFT
4/4/2018 Central_ck62618 EFT
4/18/2018 Central_ck62618 EFT

Central_ck62618 Total
4/1/2018 General,ck3008

4/2/2018 General,ckS008 23992
4/4/2018 General,ck9008 EFT
4/6/2018 General,ck3008 EFT
4/6/2018 General,ck9008 EFT
4/9/2018 General,ck9008 23993
4/9/2018 General,ck9008 23994
4/9/2018 General,ck9008 23995
4/10/2018 General,ck9008 EFT
4/18/2018 General,ck3008 EFT
4/19/2018 General,ck5008 23996
4/20/2018 General,ck9008 EFT
4/20/2018 General,ck9008 EFT
4/20/2018 General,ck9008 EFT
4/23/2018 General,ck9008 23997
4/23/2018 General,ck9008 23998
4/23/2018 General,ck9008 23999
4/23/2018 General,ck9008 24000
4/24/2018 General,ck9008 24001
4/30/2018 General,ck9008 24002
General,ck3008 Total
4/16/2018 Infrastructure,ck140074 EFT
Infrastructure,ck140074 Total
4/3/2018 Joint Fuel,ck70041 1306
4/5/2018 Joint Fuel,ck70041 1307
4/5/2018 Joint Fuel,ck70041 TXFR
4/9/2018 Joint Fuel,ck70041 1308
4/13/2018 Joint Fuel,ck70041 1309
4/25/2018 Joint Fuel,ck70041 1310

Joint Fuel,ck70041 Total
4/3/2018 Nantucket Escrow,ck153303 1044
Nantucket Escrow,ck153303 Total
4/18/2018 Newsletter,ck153745 1044
Newsletter,ck153745 Total
4/2/2018 O & M,ck9210

4/9/2018 O & M,ck3210 8161
4/10/2018 O & M,ck9210 EFT
4/25/2018 O & M,ck9210 8162
4/26/2018 O & M,ck9210 ACH

O & M,ck9210 Total
4/3/2018 Refuse,ck59692 775
Refuse,ck59692 Total

4/5/2018 Ribbon ck430001959 1026
4/16/2018 Ribbon ck430001959 1027
4/23/2018 Ribbon ck430001959 1028

Ribbon ck430001959 Total
4/3/2018 W-S Debt,ck107689 EFT
W-S Debt,ck107689 Total

4/9/2018 Youth Comm.,ck135895 1380

4/9/2018 Youth Comm.,ck135895 1381

4/9/2018 Youth Comm.,ck135895 1382
4/24/2018 Youth Comm.,ck135895 1383

Youth Comm.,ck135895 Total

Grand Total

04/01/18 - 04/30/18

Description

The Vedette, inc.
Beecher Hardware
Beecher Postmaster
Beecher Postmaster
Beecher Lions
Beecher Lions
Beecher Lions
Marge Cook

1PBC
Net Pay
Net Pay

IPBC

NCPERS Group Life Ins.

Hlinois State Disbursement Unit
Fed Payroll Taxes

State Of llfinois

Teamsters Union Local # 700
Operating Engineers Local 399
Will County Govermental League
IMRF

lllinois State Disbursement Unit
Humana Dental

Fed Payroll Taxes

IDES

State Of Illinois

Funks Tailer Sales

Teamsters Union Local # 727
AFLAC

VSP Of lllinois

lecma

NCPERS Group Life Ins.

First Community Bank

Heritage FS
Washington Township
Village Of Beecher
Heritage FS

Heritage FS

Heritage FS

Park N Pool
Washington Township

1PBC

Operating Engineers Local 399
IMRF

lcma

Credit Card Charges

Star / A&J Disposal

US Postmaster
Lambert Monument Sales, Inc.
Great American Glass & Stone Works

First Community Bank

Tom Mondello

Walts

Royal Entertainment

Beecher Scholarship Foundation

Memo

Legal notice - car raffle

10 picnic table leg kits

4 rolls of stamps

PO Box rental

reimbursement for pull tab license
reimbursement for bingo license
reimbursement for big six license
bingo tickets

Health Ins auto debit 04/2018
Net Pay payroll 04/04/18
Net Pay payroll 04/18/18

Health Ins auto debit 04/2018
supp. life ins., 47250418

Little - 04/4/18 payroll

Fed w/h, ss, med payroll 04/04/18
ILw/h tax payroli 04/04/18

p.d. union dues April

PW & Clerical Union Dues
emp.assistance program,2018-1193
IMRF

Little - 04/18/18 payroll
181933933

Fed w/h, ss, med payroll 04/18/18
unemployment ins. 1st gtr 2018
ILw/h tax payroll 04/18/18

PW Trailers

Potice Union health ins

Aflac suplimental ins

vision ins

302933 deferred comp.deducts
supp. life ins., 47250518

loan payment April 2018

Inv. 80071

Monthly internet and electric
Administrative duties reimbursement
Inv. 80123

Inv. 80187

Inv. 80274

Hip Top Replacement
Spring newsletter ads 2018

Health Ins auto debit 04/2018

PW & Clericat Union Dues

IMRF

302933 deferred comp.deducts

fees for March Credit Card payments

pick up, March 2018,#11-28728

PO Box for 6 months
Dedication Stone for monument
engraved pavers

loan payment April 2018

Aurellios Pizza - Mom/Son dance
food

photo booth / DJ

two scholarships - $1,000 & $500

Amount

(80.00)
(2,395.00)
(200.00)
(38.00)
{50.00)
(42.00)
(400.00)
(123.38)
(3,328.38)
(19,697.70)
(34,877.86)
(34,613.13)
(89,188.69)
(13,632.87)
{48.00)
(1,200.00)
(13,556.64)
(2,348.14)
(231.72)
{173.25)
{119.70)
{10,350.11)
(1,200.00)
(925 86)
(15,194.88)
(5,137.82)
(2,725.29)
(5,853.00)
(5,110.50)
(260.54)
(154.93)
(200.00)
{48.00)
{79,471.25)
(2,640.98)
(2,640.98)
(3,578.81)
(100.00)
{300.00)
(2,598.81)
(3,513.26)
(3,499.24)
(13,590.12)
(1,667.62)
(1,667.62)
(1,810.00)
(1,810.00)
(6,064.83)
{299.50)
(4,606.28)
{200.00)
{13.98)
(11,184.59)
{25,197.76)
{25,197.76)
{25.00)
{906.00)
{975.00)
{1,906.00)
(557.56)
{557.56)
(665.00)
(273.06)
(600.00)
{1,500.00)
(3,038.06)

(233,581.01)



VILLAGE OF BEECHER (BEEFND)
Budget Revenue & Expense Report

Current: 3/1/2018 to 3/31/2018

5/9/2018 3:42:45 PM YTD5/1/2017 to 3/31/2018 Page 1
Actual Actual Budget Variance
01 - GENERAL ACCOUNT Current YTD YTD YTD
Operating Revenue
01-00-311 REAL ESTATE TAX 0.00 953,165.46 967,217.00 14,051.54
01-00-321 LIQUOR LICENSES 0.00 7,450.00 11,900.00 4,450.00
01-00-323 BUSINESS LICENSES 0.00 600.00 3,050.00 2,450.00
01-00-324 ANIMAL LICENSES 2,010.00 7,325.00 9,630.00 2,305.00
01-00-325 CONTRACTOR'S LICENSES 600.00 7,600.00 17,500.00 9,900.00
01-00-326 AMUSEMENT DEVICE LICENSES 0.00 1,600.00 1,175.00 (425.00)
01-00-327 VIDEO GAMING TAX 4,931.39 54,411.51 36,224.00 (18,187.51)
01-00-331 BUILDING PERMITS 7,611.72 31,393.62 41,683.00 10,289.38
01-00-332 RE-INSPECTION FEES 0.00 0.00 100.00 100.00
01-00-333 PARK IMPACT FEES 0.00 3,763.00 0.00 (3,763.00)
01-00-341 STATE INCOME TAX 24,104.50 424,715.21 440,259.00 15,543.79
01-00-343 REPLACEMENT TAX 2,329.49 5,567.12 5,420.00 (147.12)
01-00-345 SALES TAX 45,892.56 416,152.11 425,312.00 9,159.89
01-00-347 STATE USE TAX 13,948.93 104,774.35 100,315.00 (4,459.35)
01-00-352 IPRF GRANT - PPE FOR PW 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-00-353 E 9-1-1 GRANT 0.00 1,404.00 1,500.00 96.00
01-00-354 DCEO GRANT - BALLFIELD LIGHTS 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-00-355 GRANTS 0.00 10,000.00 15,000.00 5,000.00
01-00-356 CMAP LTA PLANNING GRANT 0.00 0.00 32,000.00 32,000.00
01-00-359 INTERGOVERNMENTAL REVENUES 0.00 4,817.03 10,000.00 5,182.97
01-00-361 COURT FINES 8,837.15 36,775.18 49,000.00 12,224.82
01-00-362 LOCAL ORDINANCE FINES 1,250.00 6,295.00 10,900.00 4,605.00
01-00-363 TOWING FEES 4,000.00 20,000.00 17,000.00 (3,000.00)
01-00-381 INTEREST INCOME 8.29 1,266.56 1,610.00 343.44
01-00-382 TELECOMMEXCISE TAX 8,211.12 88,295.19 106,600.00 18,304.81
01-00-383 FRANCHISE FEES - CATV 0.00 73,862.58 69,393.00 (4,469.58)
01-00-384 REIMBURSEMENTS - ENGINEERING 0.00 0.00 9,000.00 9,000.00
01-00-386 MOSQUITO ABATEMENT FEES 2,743.01 19,861.39 20,040.00 178.61
01-00-387 FINGERPRINT FEES 60.00 680.00 1,800.00 1,120.00
01-00-389 MISCELLANEOUS INCOME 1,132.11 15,721.93 14,900.00 (821.93)
01-00-392 FIXED ASSET SALES 0.00 0.00 500.00 500.00
01-00-393 INTERFUND OPERATING TRANS 0.00 45,223.00 45,223.00 0.00
01-00-396 RESERVE CASH 0.00 0.00 50,000.00 50,000.00
01-00-397 ENCUMBERANCES 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Operating Revenue $127,670.27 $2,342,719.24 $2,514,251.00 $171,531.76
Total Revenue $127,670.27 $2,342,719.24 $2,514,251.00 $171,531.76
Operating Expense
01-01-441 ELECTED OFFICIALS SALARIES 0.00 11,450.00 22,900.00 11,450.00
01-01-442 APPT OFFICIALS SALARIES 0.00 577.08 4,900.00 4,322.92
01-01-461 SOCIAL SECURITY 0.00 907.16 2,127.00 1,219.84
01-01-536 DATA PROCESSING SERVICES 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-01-552 TELEPHONE 0.00 560.00 560.00 0.00
01-01-561 DUES AND PUBLICATIONS 0.00 8,325.00 8,155.00 (170.00)
01-01-565 CONFERENCES 241.55 5,984.85 8,000.00 2,015.15
01-01-566 MEETING EXPENSES 0.00 250.00 250.00 0.00
01-02-441 APPOINTED OFFICIALS SALARIES 0.00 742.50 1,440.00 697.50
01-02-442 FICA 0.00 56.80 110.00 53.20
01-02-533 ENGINEERING SERVICES 0.00 1,682.30 9,000.00 7,317.70
01-02-535 PLANNING SERVICES 0.00 0.00 40,000.00 40,000.00
01-02-561 DUES AND PUBLICATIONS 0.00 50.00 50.00 0.00
01-02-566 MEETING EXPENSES 557.78 1,048.00 1,200.00 152.00
01-03-421 SALARIES FULL-TIME 7,355.92 89,432.31 96,877.00 7,444.69



VILLAGE OF BEECHER (BEEFND)

Current: 3/1/2018 to 3/31/2018

Budget Revenue & Expense Report

5/9/2018 3:42:45 PM YTD5/1/2017 to 3/31/2018 Page 2
Actual Actual Budget Variance
01 - GENERAL ACCOUNT Current YTD YTD YTD
01-03-451 HEALTH INSURANCE 2,062.04 24,191.59 24,389.00 197.41
01-03-461 SOCIAL SECURITY 562.73 6,841.54 7,411.00 569.46
01-03-462 IMRF 792.23 9,843.80 10,734.00 890.20
01-03-532 AUDITING SERVICES 0.00 7,945.00 8,000.00 55.00
01-03-534 LEGAL SERVICES 1,934.47 17,634.18 23,205.00 5,5670.82
01-03-536 DATA PROCESSING SERVICES 0.00 4,150.00 4,150.00 0.00
01-03-539 CODIFICATION 0.00 1,405.00 1,500.00 95.00
01-03-551 POSTAGE 0.00 1,694.91 1,950.00 255.09
01-03-552 TELEPHONE 0.00 8,220.29 9,800.00 1,679.71
01-03-555 COPYING AND PRINTING 0.00 4,296.93 4,800.00 503.07
01-03-558 LEGAL NOTICES 25.00 1,910.00 2,020.00 110.00
01-03-561 DUES AND PUBLICATIONS 0.00 259.75 1,160.00 900.25
01-03-566 MEETING EXPENSES 0.00 191.24 250.00 58.76
01-03-567 PROFESSIONAL DEVELOPMENT 419.10 3,204.05 4,000.00 795.95
01-03-595 OTHER CONTRACTUAL SERV 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-03-651 OFFICE SUPPLIES 413.83 1,749.68 1,900.00 150.32
01-03-822 CAPITAL OUTLAY - BLDG 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-03-830 NEW EQUIPMENT 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-04-422 PART-TIME SALARIES 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-04-461 SOCIAL SECURITY 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-04-595 OTHER CONTRACTUAL SERVICES 2,759.20 21,006.94 33,683.00 12,676.06
01-05-421 APPOINTED OFFICIALS SALARIES 0.00 5,850.00 5,850.00 0.00
01-05-461 FICA 0.00 448.00 448.00 0.00
01-05-462 IMRF 0.00 644.00 644.00 0.00
01-05-512 MAINT SERVICE - EQUIP. 0.00 0.00 4,490.00 4,490.00
01-05-513 MAINT SERVICE - VEHICLES 0.00 4,302.53 5,000.00 697.47
01-05-563 TRAINING (ESDA) 198.00 198.00 900.00 702.00
01-05-566 MEETING EXPENSES 0.00 0.00 500.00 500.00
01-05-595 OTHER PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 2,250.00 2,250.00 5,450.00 3,200.00
01-05-652 FIELD SUPPLIES 0.00 4,310.03 5,000.00 689.97
01-05-669 SUPPLIES - OTHER 0.00 226.16 2,900.00 2,673.84
01-06-421 SALARIES FULL-TIME 37,879.62 477,631.46 552,324.00 74,692.54
01-06-422 SALARIES PART-TIME 10,776.50 138,175.27 125,411.00 (12,764.27)
01-06-423 OVERTIME 6,271.47 70,746.56 67,666.00 (3,080.56)
01-06-451 HEALTH INSURANCE 7,909.14 95,747 .17 114,046.00 18,298.83
01-06-461 SOCIAL SECURITY 4,264.75 53,114.19 57,023.00 3,908.81
01-06-462 IMRF 5,295.64 70,060.03 75,879.00 5,818.97
01-06-471 UNIFORM ALLOWANCE 820.64 8,822.76 8,850.00 27.24
01-06-513 MAINT. SERVICE - VEHICLES 125.00 6,426.42 13,145.00 6,718.58
01-06-521 MAINT. SERVICE - EQUIP 803.17 13,405.17 16,230.00 2,824.83
01-06-534 LEGAL SERVICES 2,700.00 18,221.28 17,800.00 (421.28)
01-06-536 DATA PROCESSING SERVICES 8.76 4,317.93 6,000.00 1,682.07
01-06-548 OTHER PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 0.00 5,252.54 5,700.00 447.46
01-06-551 POSTAGE 0.00 228.16 850.00 721.84
01-06-552 TELEPHONE 0.00 5,295.61 8,000.00 2,704.39
01-06-555 COPYING AND PRINTING 0.00 1,059.47 2,400.00 1,340.53
01-06-556 DISPATCHING SERVICES 7,958.62 103,942.15 112,272.00 8,329.85
01-06-561 DUES AND PUBLICATIONS 0.00 6,226.00 9,640.00 3,414.00
01-06-563 TRAINING 70.00 4,545.89 9,900.00 5,354.11
01-06-566 MEETING EXPENSES 0.00 25.00 100.00 75.00
01-06-567 PROFESSIONAL DEVELOPMENT 0.00 2,531.82 3,000.00 468.18
01-06-575 CIRCUIT COURT RENT 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-06-613 MAINT. SUPPLIES - VEHICLES 950.43 2,751.76 3,520.00 768.24
01-06-651 OFFICE SUPPLIES 259.32 2,228.63 2,400.00 171.37
01-06-652 FIELD SUPPLIES 0.00 16,837.89 16,000.00 162.11
01-06-656 UNLEADED FUEL 2,336.26 23,707.52 26,590.00 2,882.48



VILLAGE OF BEECHER (BEEFND)
Budget Revenue & Expense Report

Current: 3/1/2018 to 3/31/2018

5/9/2018 3:42:45 PM YTD5/1/2017 to 3/31/2018 Page 3
Actual Actual Budget Variance
01 - GENERAL ACCOUNT Current YTD YTD YTD
01-06-830 NEW EQUIPMENT 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-06-840 NEW VEHICLE 0.00 30,800.00 30,800.00 0.00
01-06-929 MISC EXPENSES 0.00 43.70 100.00 56.30
01-07-538 MOSQUITO ABATEMENT SERV 0.00 3,500.00 3,500.00 0.00
01-07-595 OTHER CONTRACTUAL SERV 0.00 1,810.00 1,500.00 (310.00)
01-08-421 SALARIES FULL-TIME 9,058.40 101,440.62 106,328.00 4,887.38
01-08-422 SALARIES PART-TIME 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-08-423 OVERTIME 0.00 9,860.27 12,202.00 2,341.73
01-08-451 HEALTH INSURANCE 2,361.19 21,455.57 21,520.00 64.43
01-08-461 SOCIAL SECURITY 664.30 8,236.32 9,068.00 831.68
01-08-462 IMRF 1,119.30 12,173.29 13,134.00 960.71
01-08-471 UNIFORM ALLOWANCE 30.00 1,489.85 2,000.00 510.15
01-08-512 MAINT. SERVICE - EQUIPMENT 0.00 1,238.74 2,300.00 1,061.26
01-08-513 MAINT. SERVICE - VEHICLES 1,463.22 13,350.17 13,750.00 399.83
01-08-514 MAINT. SERVICE - STREET 507.72 16,083.70 24,600.00 8,516.30
01-08-516 MAINT. SERVICE - STREET LIGHT 0.00 133.65 180.00 46.35
01-08-533 ENGINEERING 0.00 4,641.92 2,900.00 (1,741.92)
01-08-572 STREET LIGHTING 10,257.28 102,730.41 119,500.00 16,769.59
01-08-576 RENTALS 1,644.90 7,788.06 9,763.00 1,974.94
01-08-595 OTHER CONTRACTUAL SERV 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-08-612 MAINT. SUPPLIES EQUIPMENT 190.02 2,530.94 2,800.00 269.06
01-08-613 MAINT. SUPPLIES - VEHICLES 0.00 3,483.21 3,500.00 16.79
01-08-614 MAINT. SUPPLIES - STREET 388.79 28,227.11 33,136.00 4,908.89
01-08-653 SMALL TOOLS 0.00 0.00 500.00 500.00
01-08-656 UNLEADED FUEL 1,208.25 20,653.93 32,750.00 12,096.07
01-08-830 CAPITAL OUTLAY- EQUIP. 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-08-860 CAPITAL OUTLAY-INFRASTRUCTURE 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-09-511 MAINT. SERVICE - BUILDING 582.10 8,911.17 11,480.00 2,568.83
01-09-611 MAINT. SUPPLIES - BUILDING 0.00 990.00 990.00 0.00
01-09-654 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 134.85 1,273.60 1,500.00 226.40
01-09-820 BUILDING 0.00 5,440.64 5,300.00 (140.64)
01-09-821 DEPOT RENT 0.00 2,022.39 2,025.00 2.61
01-09-830 NEW EQUIPMENT - CATV 0.00 2,500.00 2,500.00 0.00
01-10-820 CAPITAL OUTLAY - BUILDING 0.00 0.00 15,000.00 15,000.00
01-10-860 CAPITAL OUTLAY-INFRASTRUCT. 0.00 51,667.24 50,000.00 (1,667.24)
01-11-451 HEALTH INSURANCE 920.00 7,889.60 10,600.00 2,710.40
01-11-453 UNEMPLOYMENT INSURANCE 0.00 3,690.29 11,794.00 8,103.71
01-11-592 COMPREHENSIVE INSURANCE 0.00 71,093.00 75,889.00 4,796.00
01-11-595 OTHER CONTRACTUAL SERV 0.00 394.10 624.00 229.90
01-11-730 FISCAL AGENT FEES 0.00 350.00 350.00 0.00
01-11-914 SALES TAX REIMBURSEMENTS 31,431.78 124,061.73 133,377.00 9,315.27
01-11-915 PROPERTY TAX REIMB 0.00 6,365.28 7,630.00 1,264.72
01-11-951 CAPITAL RESERVE CONTRIB. 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-11-953 INTERFUND TRANSFERS 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-11-954 INTERFUND TRANS- GO BOND ACCT 0.00 85,920.61 85,922.00 1.39
01-11-955 INTERFUND TRANS-CAP EQUIP 0.00 9,850.00 9,850.00 0.00
01-11-956 INTERFUND TRANS-PARK 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-13-421 FULL-TIME SALARIES - PARKS 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
01-13-422 SALARIES PART-TIME 0.00 4,642.00 6,504.00 1,862.00
01-13-461 SOCIAL SECURITY 0.00 355.12 496.00 140.88
01-13-515 MAINT SERVICE - PARKS 320.00 4,162.77 6,400.00 2,237.23
01-13-571 ELECTRIC POWER 46.44 2,191.81 3,540.00 1,348.19
01-13-595 CONTRACTUAL SERVICES 0.00 2,436.83 2,400.00 (36.83)
01-13-614 MAINT SUPPLIES - PARKS 0.00 1,914.46 3,700.00 1,785.54

Total Operating Expense $170,329.71 $2,173,934.40 $2,514,251.00 $340,316.60



VILLAGE OF BEECHER (BEEFND)
Budget Revenue & Expense Report

Current: 3/1/2018 to 3/31/2018

5/9/2018 3:42:45 PM YTD5/1/2017 to 3/31/2018 Page 4
Actual Actual Budget Variance

01 - GENERAL ACCOUNT Current YTD YTD YTD

Total Expense $170,329.71 $2,173,934.40 $2,514,251.00 $340,316.60

Excess Revenue Over Expenses ($42,659.44) $168,784.84 $0.00 ($168,784.84)




VILLAGE OF BEECHER (BEEFND)
Budget Revenue & Expense Report

Current: 3/1/2018 to 3/31/2018

5/9/2018 3:42:45 PM YTD5/1/2017 to 3/31/2018 Page 5
Actual Actual Budget Variance
11 - CAPITAL EQUIPMENT SINKING FUND Current YTD YTD YTD
Operating Revenue
11-00-381 INTEREST INCOME 4.30 41.50 0.00 (41.50)
11-00-392 PROCEEDS - FIXED ASSET SALES 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
11-00-393 INTERFUND TRANSFERS 0.00 27,493.00 27,493.00 0.00
11-00-396 RESERVE CASH 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
11-00-397 ENCUMBERANCES 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Operating Revenue $4.30 $27,534.50 $27,493.00 {$41.50)
Total Revenue $4.30 $27,534.50 $27,493.00 ($41.50)

Operating Expense

11-11-830 CAPITAL QUTLAY - EQUIPMENT 0.00 45,011.03 0.00 (45,011.03)
11-11-961 CAPITAL RESERVE CONTRIBUTION 0.00 0.00 27,493.00 27,493.00
Total Operating Expense $0.00 $45,011.03 $27,493.00 ($17,518.03)
Total Expense $0.00 $45,011.03 $27,493.00 ($17,518.03)

Excess Revenue Over Expenses $4.30 ($17,476.53) $0.00 $17,476.53




VILLAGE OF BEECHER (BEEFND)
Budget Revenue & Expense Report

Current: 3/1/2018 to 3/31/2018

5/9/2018 3:42:45 PM YTD5/1/2017 to 3/31/2018 Page 6
Actual Actual Budget Variance
12 - REFUSE ACCOUNT Current YTD YTD YTD
Operating Revenue
12-00-377 REFUSE CHARGES 43,715.29 316,022.61 322,299.00 6,276.39
12-00-381 INTEREST INCOME 11.29 108.79 0.00 (108.79)
12-00-389 MISCELLANEOUS INCOME 0.00 2,193.01 8,000.00 5,806.99
12-00-396 RESERVE CASH 0.00 0.00 3,176.00 3,176.00
Total Operating Revenue $43,726.58 $318,324.41 $333,475.00 $15,150.59
Total Revenue $43,726.58 $318,324.41 $333,475.00 $15,150.59
Operating Expense
12-07-573 REFUSE DISPOSAL 25,197.76 273,482.10 300,252.00 26,769.90
12-07-578 YARD WASTE BAGS 0.00 474.00 8,000.00 7,526.00
12-07-953 INTERFUND OPERAT TRANS 0.00 25,223.00 25,223.00 0.00
Total Operating Expense $25,197.76 $299,179.10 $333,475.00 $34,295.90
Total Expense $25,197.76 $299,179.10 $333,475.00 $34,295.90
Excess Revenue Over Expenses $18,528.82 $19,145.31 $0.00 ($19,145.31)




VILLAGE OF BEECHER (BEEFND)
Budget Revenue & Expense Report

Current: 3/1/2018 to 3/31/2018

5/9/2018 3:42:45 PM YTD5/1/2017 to 3/31/2018 Page 8
Actual Actual Budget Variance
14 - MFT ACCOUNT Current YTD YTD YTD
Operating Revenue
14-00-344 MOTOR FUEL TAX 8,543.34 102,394.35 111,678.00 9,283.65
14-00-381 INTEREST 20.89 163.34 100.00 (63.34)
14-00-384 SAFE ROUTES TO SCHOOL GRANT 0.00 4,422.38 5,500.00 1,077.62
14-00-385 FEDERAL STP - PENFIELD REIMB 0.00 0.00 193,600.00 193,600.00
14-00-389 MISC INCOME -SPECAL MFT PMT 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
14-00-397 ENCUMBRANCES 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Operating Revenue $8,564.23 $106,980.07 $310,878.00 $203,897.93
Total Revenue $8,564.23 $106,980.07 $310,878.00 $203,897.93

Operating Expense

14-08-533 ENGINEERING 1,470.33 59,398.96 182,953.00 123,554.04
14-08-614 MAINT. SUPPLIES - STREET 9,891.00 62,465.31 75,791.00 13,325.69
14-10-711 DEBT SERVICE - 2006 INSTALL 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
14-10-860 CAPITAL OUTLAY-INFRASTRUCTURE 0.00 6,577.15 35,244.00 28,666.85
14-10-861 CAPITAL PROJECTS 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
14-10-951 RESERVE CONTRIBUTION 0.00 0.00 16,890.00 16,890.00
Total Operating Expense $11,361.33 $128,441.42 $310,878.00 $182,436.58
Total Expense $11,361.33 $128,441.42 $310,878.00 $182,436.58

Excess Revenue Over Expenses ($2,797.10) ($21,461.35) $0.00 $21,461.35




VILLAGE OF BEECHER (BEEFND)
Budget Revenue & Expense Report

Current: 3/1/2018 to 3/31/2018

5/9/2018 3:42:45 PM YTD5/1/2017 to 3/31/2018 Page 9
Actual Actual Budget Variance
16 - JOINT FUEL ACCOUNT Current YTD YTD YTD
Operating Revenue
16-00-358 FUEL FUND REIMBURSEMENTS 18,151.24 155,987.66 178,640.00 22,652.34
16-00-381 INTEREST 8.81 70.08 0.00 (70.08)
16-00-396 RESERVE CASH 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Operating Revenue $18,160.05 $156,057.74 $178,640.00 $22,582.26
Total Revenue $18,160.05 $156,057.74 $178,640.00 $22,582.26

Operating Expense

16-12-577 FUEL PAYMENTS 15,765.97 150,474.43 178,640.00 28,165.57
16-12-820 CAPITAL OUTLAY-EQUIP 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Operating Expense $15,765.97 $150,474.43 $178,640.00 $28,165.57
Total Expense $15,765.97 $150,474.43 $178,640.00 $28,165.57

Excess Revenue Over Expenses $2,394.08 $5,583.31 $0.00 ($5,583.31)




VILLAGE OF BEECHER (BEEFND)
Budget Revenue & Expense Report

Current: 3/1/2018 to 3/31/2018

5/9/2018 3:42:45 PM YTD5/1/2017 to 3/31/2018 Page 10
Actual Actual Budget Variance
18 - G.O. BOND REDEMPTION FUND Current YTD YTD YTD
Operating Revenue
18-00-381 INTEREST INCOME 0.23 15.41 0.00 (15.41)
18-00-393 INTERFUND OPERATING TRANS 0.00 74,671.25 85,922.00 11,250.75
18-00-396 RESERVE CASH 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Operating Revenue $0.23 $74,686.66 $85,922.00 $11,235.34
Total Revenue $0.23 $74,686.66 $85,922.00 $11,235.34

Operating Expense

18-00-710 PRINCIPAL & INTEREST 0.00 74,671.25 85,922.00 11,250.75
18-00-820 BUILDING 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Operating Expense $0.00 $74,671.25 $85,922.00 $11,250.75
Total Expense $0.00 $74,671.25 $85,922.00 $11,250.75

Excess Revenue Over Expenses $0.23 $15.41 $0.00 {$15.41)




VILLAGE OF BEECHER (BEEFND)

Budget Revenue & Expense Report
Current: 3/1/2018 to 3/31/2018

5/9/2018 3:42:45 PM YTD5/1/2017 to 3/31/2018 Page 11
Actual Actual Budget Variance
19 - PUBLIC INFRASTRUCTURE ACCOUNT Current YTD YTD YTD
Operating Revenue
19-00-346 12% INFRASTRUCTURE SALES TAX 11,714.29 132,190.06 138,424.00 6,233.94
19-00-355 STP GRANT- NEW TRAFFIC SIGNAL 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
19-00-356 IDOT 100% MATCH- RT 1 REPAIRS 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
19-00-381 INTEREST INCOME 58.13 426.56 100.00 (326.56)
19-00-393 INTERFUND TRANSFERS 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
19-00-394 LOAN PROCEEDS - ENG INFRA 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
19-00-396 RESERVE CASH 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Operating Revenue $11,772.42 $132,616.62 $138,524.00 $5,907.38
Total Revenue $11,772.42 $132,616.62 $138,524.00 $5,907.38

Operating Expense

19-19-533 ENGINEERING 0.00 ' 0.00 0.00 0.00
19-19-711 DEBT SERV-2014 STP ENGIN LOAN 2,640.98 29,050.78 31,692.00 2,641.22
19-19-861 CAPITAL OUTLAY - INFRA. 0.00 72,825.00 70,000.00 (2,825.00)
18-19-952 CAPITAL RESERVE CONTRIB. 0.00 0.00 36,832.00 36,832.00
18-19-953 INTERFUND TRANSFERS 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Operating Expense $2,640.98 $101,875.78 $138,524.00 $36,648.22
Total Expense $2,640.98 $101,875.78 $138,524.00 $36,648.22

Excess Revenue Over Expenses $9,131.44 $30,740.84 $0.00 ($30,740.84)




VILLAGE OF BEECHER (BEEFND)
Budget Revenue & Expense Report

Current: 3/1/2018 to 3/31/2018

5/9/2018 3:42:45 PM YTD5/1/2017 to 3/31/2018 Page 12
Actual Actual Budget Variance
51 - WATER ACCOUNT Current YTD YTD YTD
Operating Revenue
51-00-371 WATER CHARGES 89,760.06 706,477.46 713,377.00 6,899.54
51-00-375 WATER SERVICE CONNECTION FEES 2,297.94 10,369.28 8,000.00 (2,369.28)
51-00-381 INTEREST INCOME 42.20 286.53 340.00 53.47
51-00-387 RENTAL INCOME 225.00 2,475.00 2,700.00 225.00
51-00-389 MISCELLANEOUS INCOME 3,200.00 3,800.00 2,900.00 (900.00)
51-00-393 INTERFUND TRANS FROM GENERAL 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
51-00-396 RESERVE CASH 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Operating Revenue $95,525.20 $723,408.27 $727,317.00 $3,908.73
Total Revenue $95,525.20 $723,408.27 $727,317.00 $3,908.73
Operating Expense
51-20-421 SALARIES FULL-TIME 16,937.64 199,863.96 214,533.00 14,669.04
51-20-422 SALARIES PART-TIME 0.00 10,411.62 11,200.00 788.38
51-20-423 SALARIES OVERTIME 166.78 8,854.16 9,183.00 328.84
51-20-451 HEALTH INSURANCE 2,695.48 32,996.74 31,884.00 (1,112.74)
51-20-461 SOCIAL SECURITY 1,308.49 16,720.50 17,971.00 1,250.50
51-20-462 IMRF 1,955.80 22,550.61 24,788.00 2,237.39
51-20-471 UNIFORMS 0.00 400.00 400.00 0.00
51-20-513 MAINT. SERVICE- VEHICLES 0.00 2,909.53 4,500.00 1,590.47
51-20-517 MAINT. SERVICE - WATER SYSTEM 0.00 33,000.00 33,000.00 0.00
51-20-532 AUDIT 0.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 0.00
51-20-533 ENGINEERING 0.00 0.00 1,200.00 1,200.00
51-20-534 LEGAL SERVICES 0.00 0.00 4,200.00 4,200.00
51-20-536 DATA PROCESSING SERVICES 0.00 3,743.41 3,500.00 (243.41)
51-20-537 LABORATORY ANALYSIS 123.88 1,267.82 5,600.00 4,332.18
51-20-551 POSTAGE 551.90 1,842.87 2,400.00 557.13
51-20-552 TELEPHONE 0.00 1,341.93 1,680.00 338.07
51-20-553 LEASED CONTROL LINES 0.00 2,010.00 2,280.00 270.00
51-20-561 DUES AND PUBLICATIONS 0.00 584.56 600.00 15.44
51-20-563 TRAINING 100.00 2,506.16 3,900.00 1,393.84
51-20-565 CONFERENCES 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
51-20-571 ELECTRIC POWER 875.75 24,765.45 31,653.00 6,887.55
51-20-592 COMPREHENSIVE INSURANCE 0.00 34,317.00 37,945.00 3,628.00
51-20-595 OTHER PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 0.00 818.00 900.00 82.00
51-20-611 MAINT. SUPPLIES - BUILDING 0.00 0.00 350.00 350.00
51-20-616 MAINT. SUPPLIES-WATER SYSTEM 2,661.55 63,700.25 64,417.00 716.75
51-20-651 OFFICE SUPPLIES 528.93 1,694.15 1,900.00 205.85
51-20-653 SMALL TOOLS 0.00 1,598.00 1,598.00 0.00
51-20-656 UNLEADED FUEL 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
51-20-657 DIESEL FUEL 0.00 0.00 600.00 600.00
51-20-658 CHEMICALS 6,212.66 34,545.31 37,760.00 3,214.69
51-20-822 CAPITAL OUTLAY - BLDG 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
51-20-830 CAPITAL OUTLAY - EQUIPMENT 0.00 6,000.00 6,000.00 0.00
51-20-953 INTERFUND TRANS 0.00 98,127.16 166,375.00 68,247.84
Total Operating Expense $34,118.86 $611,569.19 $727,317.00 $115,747.81
Total Expense $34,118.86 $611,569.19 $727,317.00 $115,747.81
Excess Revenue Over Expenses $61,406.34 $111,839.08 $0.00 ($111,839.08)




VILLAGE OF BEECHER (BEEFND)
Budget Revenue & Expense Report

Current: 3/1/2018 to 3/31/2018

5/9/2018 3:42:45 PM YTD5/1/2017 to 3/31/2018 Page 13
Actual Actual Budget Variance
52 - SEWER ACCOUNT Current YTD YTD YTD
Operating Revenue
52-00-372 SEWER CHARGES 59,289.45 473,855.51 478,933.00 5,077.49
52-00-373 LIFT STATION CHARGES 1,245.92 10,926.97 11,200.00 273.03
52-00-374 DEBT SERVICES CHARGES 14,960.15 115,526.16 110,400.00 (5,126.16)
52-00-381 INTEREST INCOME 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
52-00-389 MISC. INCOME 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
52-00-393 TRANSFER FROM WATER FUND 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
52-00-396 RESERVE CASH-SEWER FUND 0.00 0.00 20,000.00 20,000.00
52-23-393 TRANS FROM SEWER FUND 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Operating Revenue $75,495.52 $600,308.64 $620,533.00 $20,224.36
Total Revenue $75,495.52 $600,308.64 $620,533.00 $20,224.36

Operating Expense

52-21-421 SALARIES FULL-TIME 13,025.77 161,558.63 169,400.00 7,841.37
52-21-422 SALARIES PART-TIME 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
52-21-423 OVERTIME 695.74 13,410.17 9,569.00 (3,841.17)
52-21-451 HEALTH INSURANCE 2,969.43 31,008.29 29,487.00 (1,521.29)
52-21-461 SOCIAL SECURITY 1,019.10 12,808.20 13,615.00 806.80
52-21-462 IMRF 1,708.13 18,751.86 18,719.00 967.14
52-21-471 UNIFORM ALLOWANCE 0.00 3,545.30 4,500.00 954.70
52-21-512 MAINT. SERVICE - EQUIPMENT 0.00 8,000.00 8,000.00 0.00
52-21-513 MAINT. SERVICE - VEHICLES 0.00 928.20 1,900.00 971.80
52-21-518 MAINT SERVICE SEWER SYSTEM 0.00 16,900.00 16,900.00 0.00
52-21-532 AUDIT 0.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 0.00
52-21-533 ENGINEERING 0.00 920.69 1,000.00 79.31
52-21-534 LEGAL SERVICES 759.37 759.37 4,200.00 3,440.63
52-21-536 DATA PROCESSING SERVICES 357.00 1,871.20 5,300.00 3,428.80
52-21-537 LABORATORY ANALYSIS 25.00 7,028.22 7,207.00 178.78
52-21-549 OTHER PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 0.00 1,639.48 1,650.00 10.52
52-21-551 POSTAGE 219.52 1,510.48 1,900.00 389.52
52-21-552 TELEPHONE 0.00 1,452.76 2,280.00 827.24
52-21-562 IEPA PERMIT FEES 0.00 11,000.00 11,000.00 0.00
52-21-563 TRAINING 0.00 625.00 3,900.00 3,275.00
52-21-571 ELECTRICAL POWER 5,436.70 59,552.52 65,588.00 6,035.48
52-21-574 NATURAL GAS 505.86 5,253.78 5,900.00 646.22
52-21-592 COMPREHENSIVE INSURANCE 0.00 34,317.00 37,945.00 3,628.00
52-21-595 OTHER PROFESSIONAL SERV 3,750.00 37,500.00 45,000.00 7,500.00
52-21-611 MAINT. SUPPLIES - BUILDING 0.00 497.35 500.00 2.65
52-21-612 MAINT. SUPPLIES - EQUIPMENT 0.00 2,471.81 2,700.00 228.19
52-21-617 MAINT. SUPPLIES-SEWER SYSTEM 0.00 1,528.17 2,400.00 871.83
52-21-651 OFFICE SUPPLIES 0.00 450.46 900.00 449.54
52-21-653 SMALL TOOLS 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
52-21-657 DIESEL FUEL 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
52-21-820 NEW EQUIPMENT 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
52-21-830 CAPITAL OUTLAY- EQUIPMENT 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
52-21-952 CAPITAL IMPROV CONTRIB 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
52-21-953 INTERFUND TRANS 0.00 32,673.00 143,073.00 110,400.00
52-22-953 INTERFUND TRANS (TO GENERAL) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Operating Expense $30,471.62 $472,961.94 $620,533.00 $147,571.06

Total Expense $30,471.62 $472,961.94 $620,533.00 $147,571.06




VILLAGE OF BEECHER (BEEFND)
Budget Revenue & Expense Report

Current: 3/1/2018 to 3/31/2018

5/9/2018 3:42:45 PM YTD5/1/2017 to 3/31/2018 Page 14
Actual Actual Budget Variance
52 - SEWER ACCOUNT Current YTD YTD YTD

Excess Revenue Over Expenses $45,023.90 $127,346.70 $0.00 ($127,346.70)




VILLAGE OF BEECHER (BEEFND)
Budget Revenue & Expense Report

Current: 3/1/2018 to 3/31/2018

5/9/2018 3:42:45 PM YTD5/1/2017 to 3/31/2018 Page 15
Actual Actual Budget Variance

53 - WATER & SEWER CAPITAL IMPR Current YTD YTD YTD

Operating Revenue

53-00-381 INTEREST INCOME 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

53-21-350 IDOT GRANT-ILLIANA CORRIDOR PLANI 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
53-21-373 WATER TAP-INS 1,717.00 17,847.00 0.00 (17,847.00)
53-22-374 SEWER TAP-INS 3,549.00 37,079.00 0.00 (37,079.00)
53-22-381 INTEREST 13.76 104.17 150.00 45.83
53-22-393 INTERFUND TRANSFERS 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
53-22-394 LOAN PROCEEDS-IPEAWASTEWATER 0.00 0.00 8,200,000.00 8,200,000.00
53-22-396 RESERVE CASH - CAPITAL 0.00 0.00 79,750.00 79,750.00
53-22-397 ENCUMBRANCES 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Operating Revenue $5,279.76 $55,030.17 $8,279,900.00 $8,224,869.83
Total Revenue $5,279.76 $55,030.17 $8,279,900.00 $8,224,869.83
Operating Expense

53-21-517 MAINT SERV - WATER SYSTEM 0.00 0.00 2,500.00 2,500.00
53-21-616 METER REPLACEMENT PROGRAM 0.00 29,310.40 29,400.00 89.60
53-21-861 CAPITAL OUTLAY- INFRAS 0.00 0.00 8,200,000.00 8,200,000.00
53-22-518 MAINT SERV - SEWER SYSTEM 1,256.15 12,234.16 22,500.00 10,265.84
53-22-533 ENGINEERING 0.00 11,590.00 15,000.00 3,410.00
53-22-535 PLANNING SERVICES 0.00 3,620.67 6,000.00 2,379.33
53-22-595 OTHER PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 1,000.00 1,675.00 4,500.00 2,925.00
53-22-951 CAPITAL RESERVE CONTRIB 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
53-22-953 INTERFUND TRANSFERS 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Operating Expense $2,256.15 $58,330.23 $8,279,900.00 $8,221,569.77
Total Expense $2,256.15 $58,330.23 $8,279,900.00 $8,221,569.77
Excess Revenue Over Expenses $3,023.61 ($3,300.06) $0.00 $3,300.06




VILLAGE OF BEECHER (BEEFND)
Budget Revenue & Expense Report

Current: 3/1/2018 to 3/31/2018

5/9/2018 3:42:45 PM YTD5/1/2017 to 3/31/2018 Page 16
Actual Actual Budget Variance
54 - WATER & SEWER DEBT SERVICE Current YTD YTD YTD
Operating Revenue
54-21-393 TRANS FROM WATER FUND 0.00 13,472.00 10,038.00 (3,434.00)
54-22-336 UTILITY TAX 19,377.29 170,750.64 186,736.00 15,985.36
54-22-346 V2% INFRA SALES TX 11,714.30 132,190.06 138,424.00 6,233.94
54-22-381 INTEREST INCOME 63.96 350.11 510.00 159.89
54-22-391 1ST COMM BK-WWTP LOAN PROCEEDS 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
54-22-393 TRANSFER FROM WATER FUND 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
54-22-394 TRANSFER FROM SEWER FUND 0.00 0.00 110,400.00 110,400.00
54-22-395 TRANSFER FROM REFUSE FUND 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
54-22-396 RESERVE CASH 0.00 0.00 289,272.00 289,272.00
Total Operating Revenue $31,155.55 $316,762.81 $735,380.00 $418,617.19
Total Revenue $31,155.55 $316,762.81 $735,380.00 $418,617.19

Operating Expense

54-21-533 ENGINEERING 0.00 141,410.30 300,000.00 158,589.70
54-21-711 2013 INSTALLMENT CONTRACT 0.00 81,647.03 81,642.00 (5.03)
54-22-712 2018 BALLOON LOAN 503.68 4,192.64 353,738.00 349,545.36
54-22-713 1996 IEPA LOAN 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
54-22-951 RESERVE CONTRIBUTION 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
54-22-953 INTERFUND TRANSFERS 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
54-23-716 WASH TWP BUILDING PMT 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Operating Expense $503.68 $227,249.97 $735,380.00 $508,130.03
Total Expense $503.68 $227,249.97 $735,380.00 $508,130.03

Excess Revenue Over Expenses $30,651.87 $89,512.84 $0.00 ($89,512.84)




VILLAGE OF BEECHER (BEEFND)
Budget Revenue & Expense Report

Current: 3/1/2018 to 3/31/2018

5/9/2018 3:42:45 PM YTD5/1/2017 to 3/31/2018 Page 17
Actual Actual Budget Variance
55 - WATERMAIN REPLACEMENT FUND Current YTD YTD YTD
Operating Revenue
55-21-381 INTEREST INCOME 90.09 399.11 300.00 (99.19)
55-21-393 INTERFUND TRANS 0.00 79,685.16 151,367.00 71,681.84
55-21-394 LOAN PROCEEDS - IEPA DRINK WAT 236,416.33 1,087,890.64 1,182,000.00 94,109.36
55-21-396 RESERVE CASH 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
55-21-397 ENCUMBRANCES 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Total Operating Revenue $236,506.42 $1,167,974.91 $1,333,667.00 $165,692.09
Total Revenue $236,506.42 $1,167,974.91 $1,333,667.00 $165,692.09
Operating Expense
55-21-533 ENGINEERING 8,613.85 73,359.14 136,500.00 63,140.86
55-21-714 DEBT SERV - 2017 IEPA LOAN 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
55-21-861 CAPITAL OUTLAY-PENFIELD MAIN 0.00 1,008,876.71 1,051,000.00 42,123.29
55-21-862 CAPITAL OUTLAY-ELM/BIRCH MAIN 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
55-22-951 CAPITAL RESERVE CONTRIBUTION 0.00 0.00 146,167.00 146,167.00
Total Operating Expense $8,613.85 $1,082,235.85 $1,333,667.00 $251,431.15
Total Expense $8,613.85 $1,082,235.85 $1,333,667.00 $251,431.15
Excess Revenue Over Expenses $227,892.57 $85,739.06 $0.00 ($85,739.06)




‘ 4849 Rugby Avenue

Community Sute 100

Bethesda, MD 20814
POWER GROUP Phone: 844-268-6088

April 4, 2018

Janett Conner
Beecher Village Clerk
625 Dixie Highway
P.O. Box 1154
Beecher, IL 60401

RE: Notice of Development for Community Solar Garden

Dear Janett,

This letter is to provide notice of development for a community solar garden within 1.5mi of the
Village of Beecher. Community Power Group is working to develop the community solar garden,
Beecher Sun [, on approximately 13 acres off of E Corning Road, south of Beecher. See the
attached map for further details on the location and the attached site plan for details on the solar
farm.

If you have any questions or thoughts, please feel free to reach out to me by phone at (443) 878-
8296 or by e-mail at nmento@communitypowergroup.com.

Best regards,
/

Nick Mento
Project Manager

© Community Power Group 2017



Exhibit A — Project Location

Titiel
AL H

]

A

.
(=
O
5
@,
(8}
(o]
=
13)
@
(@]
g
£

v —_—
o Cottage

==as5hland=Ave




MLOLY,98.48 "N, 99BE6EL.LP

L0¥09 11 "¥3HO3I3E

o v

| sv10S 23H033a

= dNOHO ¥IMOd ALINNWWOD

T

ue|d ays — g HqIyx3




PLAT OF SURVEY

LEGEND
Lt VAR DT
ooy RECORG DA
taat o sy N
————— et e
———— —  (TIPGONT OmY

NSE® 53 0°E

P x4
—_—

o wast t
e,
o

4
]

LTAN

GRAPHIC SCALE
= i " xo “«
L 2 SURVEYOR'S NOTES
|._m M&sﬂnﬂrmunuum
PARTS THERECF ANGILAR BATA TS W
WOCATES ﬂm& WS MO S
L MORTH MIRCW WD BEARMCS BASED OF D LLMOS STATE
PLVE (DORONATE SYSTEM, [AST 20N, vADSR, 207!
rsnon
FAT O s |
=1 3 wPROVMEWT LOCATONS 4RL BASID On & FE0 SUNKY
TONTY OF sENCALL BYCM LAVOE MWD ASSODATES, WC ON */32/18
'.‘ LAVOE MO ASSOCATES. Mol , RLINOMS MMOFESTONAL DESON Ty 4 COMPANE YOUR PONTS BEFCRE USAG SAVE MO PORT
18400141, MREAY STATFY Pal u AT CRAW MADN 2O BE Y DITTRINTS.
WV THat 1t ll’lY 'S, MRE PREPARD) MG POV BT V2 &0
SSKNAL wwmmn.--nnvws iwummu ™ DUED O 'L POIK |
m ' “ FOR BOUNGARY ROVYS. I ANY DISCREP AT BURDWG (S ne [A“\“
M m l( A5 SOW 08
‘7C ™I St o e, 2 Sy ot
i
= 5
2 o Ne 0333507
\nw(munml S e
H
- PLAWFIEL
s Community Power Group
i Comrg Averan
Wasrungion Townato, W County, Mnos

DRAWN BY a0 |CHECKED BY me
Plat of Su Y  SCALE: 200 DATE. 17222018
J06 NUMBERT |SHEET 1 of 7
T Lavele & Aseciotes, buc. | 17262
Civid s BB

o:_:gmm M.unhl%
PAam s prcacind wnder s Copynght Lrws of Saamcs of Americs wel faropy
e, Lvoe &

“
& Assocasies lax. comeoamtes o vialariom of C M. Lavest & Asecxistes, boc 't
wdn—;—uupﬂn‘

voice 815254005
Ju 34365130




SOLAR FACILITY SITE LEASE AGREEMENT

This Solar Facilities Site Lease Agreement (the “Lease” or “Agreement”), dated as of this _\iday of
December 2017 (the “Effective Date™), is entered into by and between Community Power Group, L1C, a
Delaware limited liability company (“Lessee”), and Trust #16851 (“Lessor”). Each of Lessee and Lessor is
referred to herein as a “Party” and collectively they are referred to as the “Parties”. This Agreement and a similar
agreement as to different property which is being executed this date, supercede and replace the Solar Facility Site
Lease Agreement executed by the parties dated July 19, 2017.

A. GENERAL TERMS

A.1. Purpose of the Lease The purpose of this Lease is to lease land (as further defined herein and more fully
described in Exhibit A) to allow Lessee to develop, construct, own, operate and maintain a solar photovoltaic
energy and storage facility (the “Facility” and as further defined at Exhibit A). Lessee requires access to certain
property owned or leased by Lessor as identified in Exhibit A; and Lessor agrees to lease a portion of land (the
“Premises”) described herein and within the substance of Exhibit A to Lessee on the terms and conditions
hereinafter set forth within the substance of this Lease.

A.2. Fecility Development, Construction, Ownership, Opetation and Maintenance Lessor hereby consents to the
development, construction, ownership, operation and maintenance of the Facility and any component thereof by
Lessee, its Affiliates and any employees, agents, representatives, subcontractors or other designees of any of the
foregoing and any local electric utility personnel, on the Premises, including solar panels, mounting substrates or
supports, wiring and connections, energy storage devices, power inverters, service equipment, metering
equipment, utility interconnections and any other equipment or facilities related thereto (the “Permitted Uses™).

A.3. Rent During the term of this Lease, Lessee shall pay Lessor rent on a per acre, per year basis as compensation
in full for the rights with respect to the Premises, and such other rights, as set forth in this Lease. Lessee shall pay
Rent to Lessor according to the following schedule:

A.3.1. Annual Operating Rent The Annual Operating Rent for the full 25 year period shall be paid monthly
assuming an amount equal to i} per acre, per year (the “Initial Annual Operating Rent”) escalating at a
rate of Jfi]- The final acres of the facility shall be defined and attached hereto in Exhibit B upon receipt of
all related approvals. The rent will be paid in twelve equal monthly installments on the 15% of each month
during the term. Payments will be paid out to Trustees based on the percentage interest each Trustee owns.
Such amount represents the full financial lease obligation from the Lessee to Lessor. Any rent payments
more than ten (10) days in arrears shall bear interest at the rate of eight percent (8%) per annum, and in
addition, Lessee shall pay a late fee to Lessor of one-hundred ($100.00) dollars with respect to each late
payment.

A.3.1.1. Operating Rent Commencement Date: Shall be the full month during which the Facility
begins to generate electric power for delivery to the distribution grid.

A.3.2. Construction and Decommissioning Rent Construction and Decommissioning Rent shall be a

monthly payment equal to 1/12th the Annual Operating Rent, with the first payment due on the Construction
Rent Commencement Date. In the event the Construction Rent Date is not achieved no rent shall be payable
in accordance with this Lease.

A.3.2.1. Construction Rent Commencement Date Construction will be deemed started in the event
any material alterations are made to the property or the housing of any construction equipment.
Lessee shall use reasonable efforts to provide six (6) months notice of its intent to start construction
in an effort to help Lessor plan for its planting or harvesting season.

A.3.2.2. Decommissioning Rent Termination Date The date on which the restoration of the premises
are returned to the same condition (excepting reasonable wear and tear due to natural occurrences) as

the premises were at the date of the commencement of the lease are deemed compiete.

A3.3. Prepayment Option Prior to the commencement of the Annual Operating Rent Period, Lessor
has the option, but not the obligation, to receive the first years Annual Operating Rent payment plus 50% of
next 10 years of Annual Operating Rent payments in one upfront payment. For the avoidance of doubt if

" Community 1 Proprietary and Confidential

POWER GROUP



acreage leased was [ and the initial Annual Operating Rent payment is [ @ acres x

then Lessor would be entitled to receivejjj (first Annual Operating Rent Payment) plus (50%
of next ten years’ payments) for a total payment of [l in lien of receiving the first eleven years
payments on an annual basis. After the eleventh year, lease payments will be made in accordance with the
remaining Annual Operating Rent schedule.

A.3.4. Lessee kWh Option Lessee shall have the right to elect to convert future rent payments from a per
acre basis to a per kWh basis upon the first anniversary of the Operating Rent Commencement Date (the
“Base Year”). The calculation of the Rate per kWh rent shall be equal to the actual first years Operating
Rent divided by the number of kWh produced for the Base Year (the “kWh Rent Rate™). The kWh Rent Rate
shall then be used to calculate the Annual Operating Rent by multiplying the kWh Rent rate by the number
of actual kWhs produced during the proceeding rent periods. This option shall not be applicable to the first
11 years in the event Lessor has chosen the Lessor Prepayment Option.

A.3.5. Deposit/Option Payment In acceptance and execution by all parties of this agreement, Lessee shall
pay Lessor a good faith non-refundable amount o

A4, Term The term of this Lease (the “Term™) shall commence on the Effective Date of this Lease and the
Effective Date shall be the date this Lease is signed by both Lessor and Lessee. The termination of this Lease
shall be the twenty-fifth (25") anniversary of the Operating Rent Commencement Date and shall automatically
extend for up to two (2) consecutive periods of five (5) years each, unless earlier terminated in accordance herein,

A.S. Lessor Right to Terminate If, within two (2) years from the Effective Date, Lessee fails to start Installation
Work, or becomes inactive in pursuing related permits or interconnection agreements related to the Facility,
Lessor may terminate this Agreement by delivering notice to Lessee of its intention to terminate this Agreement,
and the Agreement shall terminate twenty-one (21) days after Lessee’s receipt of such notice. However, if Lessee
is active in pursuing related permits or interconnection agreements, then Lessee shall have the right to buy up to
two (2) additional years to start construction (the Extended Period) at a rate equal to 10% of the first years rent
payment. Such amount is payable in monthly installments during the Extended Period. In the event of termination,
in accordance with Section H, neither Party shall have any further liability to the other, provided that: (i) Lessee,
at its expense, shall remove any equipment or materials which Lessee has placed on the Premises; (ii) Lessee, at
its expense, shall restore any portions of the Premises disturbed by Lessee to their pre-existing condition pursuant
to Section A.6 of this Agreement; (iii) the Parties shall not be released from any payment or other obligations
arising under this Agreement prior to the delivery of the notice, in accordance with Section K.1.

A.6. Removal of Facility at End of Term Unless Lessor elects to purchase the Facility pursuant to Section A.7,
Lessee shall, within one-hundred and eighty (180) days following the end of the Term, and at Lessee’s cost and
expense, be required to decommission, deconstruct, dismantle and remove the Facility from the Premises, the
completion of which shall consititute the Termination Date. During such decommissioning period, Lessee, its
Affiliates and any employees, agents, representatives, contractors, subcontractors and other designees of any of
the foregoing and any local electric utility personnel shall continue to have access to the Premises and the Facility
as otherwise provided in this Lease. Monthly lease payments will continue until the Decommissioning Rent
Termination Date. Prior to the Construction Rent period Lessor and Lessee shall agree to a surety mechanism for
the removal of the facility.

A.7. Purchase Option Upon Expiration The Lessor may purchase the Facility upon the expiration of this
Agreement, if the Agreement is still in effect on such date, at the Facility's fair market value on an installed and
running, or going-concern basis. The Lessee shall notify the Lessor of the right to exercise this purchase option
in writing, not less than one hundred twenty (120) days prior to the expiration date. The Lessor shall provide
written notice to Lessee of the Lessor’s intent to exercise this purchase option, not less than sixty (60) days prior
to the expiration date or ten (10) business days following determination of Fair Market value, whichever is later
(or else the option shall automatically expire) (“Exercise Notice at Term Expiration™).

A.8. Access to Premises Lessor shall provide Lessee with access to the Premises as reasonably necessary to allow
Lessee to develop, construct, own, operate and maintain the Facility as contemplated herein, including ingress
and egress rights to the Premises for Lessee, its Affiliates and any employees, agents, representatives,
subcontractors, Lenders, investors, potential Lenders or potential investors, regulators and other designees of any

‘ Community 2 Proprietary and Confidential

POWER GROUP




of the foregoing and any local electric utility personnel, and access to the Facility to interconnect the Facility with
the local electrical grid. Lessor grants Lessee all ingress and egress rights of way to the premises as necessary for
the design, construction, operation and maintenance of the Facility during the Term of the Lease. Lessor shall
provide such space on the Premises and access as is reasonably requested by Lessee for laydown, for the
temporary storage and staging of tools, materials, parts, supplies and equipment, for rigging and material handling,
for the parking of vehicles and temporary trailers and facilities and for erecting an office or other structure, in
each case as reasonable necessary or convenient for the development, construction, ownership, operation, and
maintenance of the Facility or any portion thereof. Lessor will identify specific areas for storage, staging, and
parking use by the Lessee and its Affiliates. Lessor and its authorized representatives shall at all times have access
to, and the right to observe, the development, construction, ownership, operation and maintenance of the Facility
on the Premises, subject to compliance with Lessee’s safety rules. However, Lessor shall retain the right to
identify altemative areas on property it owns or controls to be used by Lessee for the aforementioned purposes in
the event the specific location with respect to Lessee’s activities interferes with Lessor’s operation of its own
business.

A.9. Facility and Qutput Ownership Lessor acknowledges and agrees that (i) Lessee or one of its Affiliates is and
shall be the exclusive owner and operator of the Facility, (ii) all permits, approvals, interconnection agreements,
equipment, warrantees, guarantees, service agreements, facilities and other contracts comprising the Facility shall
remain the personal property of Lessee and shall not become fixtures, notwithstanding the manner in which the
Facility is or may be mounted on, adhered to or attached to the Premises or structures, buildings and fixtures on
the Premises, and (jii) Lessor shall have no right, title or interest in any Facility or any component thereof,
notwithstanding that any such Facility may be mounted on, adhered to, or attached to the Premises or structures,
buildings and fixtures on the Premises, except as otherwise provided herein. As between Lessor and Lessee,
Lessor acknowledges that Lessee or one of its Affiliates is and shall be the exclusive owner of all Energy output
of the Facility, of all Environmental Attributes related to the Facility and of any other tax or financial incentives
related to the Facility. Without the express written consent of Lessee, Lessor shall not make or publish any public
statement or notice suggesting ownership of such Energy output, Environmental Attributes or tax or financial
incentives.

A.10. Insurance Lessee’s liability insurance shall be purchased and maintained by the Lessee to protect him from
claims for damages because of bodily injury, including death, and from claims for damages, other than to the
work itself, to property which may arise out of or result from the Lessee’s operation under this Agreement,
whether such operation be by himself or by any or anyone directly or indirectly employed by any of them. The
insurance shall name the Lessor as an additional insured and shall be written for not less than $500,000 each
person, $1,000,000 each occurrence and $2,000,000 aggregate for bodily injury, and $500,000 each occurrence,
$1,000,000 aggregate for property damage, or such amount as required by law, whichever is greater, and shall
include contractual liability applicable to the Lessee’s obligations. Lessee shall supply Lessor with an annual
certificate of insurance upon renewal. The provisions of this Lease shall not be construed so as to relieve any
insurer of its obligation to pay any insurance proceeds in accordance with the terms and conditions of valid and
collectible insurance policies. The liability of the Parties hereunder shall not be limited or reduced by insurance.

A.11. Taxes Lessee shall pay any personal and real property taxes, possessory interest taxes, business or license
taxes or fees, service payments in lieu of such taxes or fees, annual or periodic license or use fees, excises,
assessments, bonds, levies, fees or charges of any kind which are assessed, levied, charged, confirmed, or imposed
by any public authority due to Lessee’s occupancy and use of the Premises (or any portion or component thereof).
Lessor pays all real and personal property taxes on the Premises excepting only real and personsl property taxes
charged against the Facility. Any taxes, fees, service payments, excises, assessments, bonds, levies, fees or
charges of any kind which are adopted by any public authority after the date hereof shall be paid by the party
responsible for creating the expense,

B. REPRESENTATIONS, WARRANTIES AND COVENANTS OF LESSOR

B.1. Power and Authorization Lessor represents and warrants that it has all requisite power and authority to enter
into this Lease and to carry out the transactions contemplated hereby, and that it has taken all necessary actions
to authorize the execution, delivery and performance of this Lease.

J Community 3 Proprietary and Confidential
POWER GROUP



B.2. No Conflict Lessor represents and warrants that the execution, delivery and performance by it of this Lease
does not (i) violate (A) its organizational documents, or (B) any Applicable Law, or (ii) require any approval or
consent of any other Person, except for such approvals or congents that have been obtained on or before the date
hereof or the absence of which could not, individually or in the aggregate, reasonably be expected to have a
material adverse effect on its ability to execute, deliver or perform this Lease.

B.3. Binding Obligation Lessor represents and warrants that this Lease has been duly executed and delivered by
it and is a Jegally valid and binding obligation, enforceable against it in accordance with the terms hereof, except
as may be limited by bankruptcy, insolvency, reorganization, moratorium or similar laws relating to or limiting
creditors® rights generally or by equitable principles relating to enforceability.

B.4. Lessor’s Title to Premises Lessor represents, warrants and covenants that Lessor has lawful title to (or a valid
leasehold interest in) the Premises and that Lessee shall have quiet and peaceful possession of the Premises in
accordance with this Lease, free from any claim of any Person of superior title thereto, without hinderance to or
interference with or molestation of Lessee’s quiet enjoyment thereof, throughout the Term of this Lease. Lessor
shall not sell, lease, assign, mortgage, pledge or otherwise alienate or encumber the Premises unless Lessor shall
have given Lessee at least fifteen (15) days’ prior written notice thereof, which notice shall identify the transferee,
the Premises to be so transferred and the proposed date of transfer. Lessor agrees that this Lease shall run with
the Premises and survive any such transfer of any of the Premises. In furtherance of the foregoing, Lessor agrees
that it shall cause any purchaser, lessee, assignee, mortgagee, pledge or party to whom a lien has been granted to
execute and deliver to Lessee a document in form and substance satisfactory to Lessee, pursuant to which such
party (i) acknowledges and consents to the Lessee’s rights in the Premises as set forth herein, including an
acknowledgement by the transferee that it has no interest in the Facility, the Energy output, the Environmental
Attributes or any other tax or financial incentive relating thereto, and shall not gain any interest in any of the
foregoing by virtue of the Lessor’s transfer, and (ii) expressly subordinates any lien it may have in and to any of
the foregoing to Lessee’s rights and interests hereunder.

B.5. No Interference With and Protection of the Facility. Lessor will not conduct activities on, in, under, over or
about the Premises, the Facility or any portion thereof that have a reasonable likelihood of causing damage,
impairment or otherwise adversely affecting the Facility. To the extent practicable, Lessor shall permit Lessee to
maintain reasonable and appropriate security measures on the Premises to prevent Lessor’s employees, invitees,
agents and representatives, any third parties or animals, from having access to the Premises or the Facility, and to
prevent any theft, vandalism or other actions that have a reasonable likelihood of causing damage, impairment or
otherwise adversely affecting the Facility.

B.6. Insolation Lessor acknowledges and agrees that access to sunlight (“insolation™) is essential to the value to
Lessee of the leasehold interest granted hereunder and is a material inducement to Lessee in entering into this
Lease. Accordingly, Lessor shall not permit any interference with insolation on and at the Premises or any other
real property owned by, leased to or from, or otherwise controlled by Lessor that may reasonably be considered
to adversely affect the Facility. In the Event of any obstruction that interferes with insolation is proposed to be
erected or installed on property other than the Premises Lessor shall promptly deliver to Lessee copies of any
notice relating thereto received by Lessor, and Lessee shall have the right to intervene or to direct Lessor to
intervene in any proceeding and to contest the installation or erection of such obstruction. In the event such
obstruction is installed, (a) Lessee shall have the right to remove the Facility from the Premises and (b) Lessor
shall be liable for damages in accordance with Section H. However, the maintenance of the property upon which
the equipment is located including the control of the growth of foliage is the responsibility of the Lessee.

B.7. Hazardous Materials To the best of Lessor’s knowledge, there are no hazardous, toxic or dangerous
substances, chemicals, materials or wastes present on, in, under or over the Premises in violation of any
Applicable Law or that might otherwise impair Lessee’s ability to utilize the Premises as contemplated by this
Lease. Lessor shall not introduce or use any hazardous, toxic or dangerous substances, chemicals, materials or
wastes on, in, under or over the Premises in violation of any Applicable Law. If Lessor becomes aware of any
hazardous, toxic or dangerous substances, chemicals, materials or wastes present on, in, under or over the
Premises, Lessor shall promptly notify Lessee of the type and location of such substances, chemicals, materials
or wastes in writing. Lessor agrees to assume full responsibility for and shall protect, indemnify, defend and hold
harmless Lessee and its Indemnitees against, any loss, costs, damages, liability or cleanup obligations arising out

“ Community 4 Proprietary and Confidential
POWER GROUP




of (i) any pre-existing conditions caused as a result of Hazardous Materials on, in, under or over the Premises,
and (ii} any loss, costs, damages, liability or cleanup obligations arising as a result of actions or inactions on the
part of Lessor on or after the date hereof. Notwithstanding the foregoing, the indemnification by Lessor set forth
herein shall not apply in instances where the loss, costs, damages, liability or cleanup arises as a result of actions
of Lessee or those acting for or on behalf of Lessee.

C. REPRESENTATIONS, WARRANTIES AND COVENANTS OF LESSEE

C.1. Powers; Authorization Lessee represents and warrants that it has all requisite power and authority to enter
into this Lease, and to carry out the transactions contemplated hereby, and that it has taken all necessary actions
to authorize the execution, delivery and performance of this Lease.

C.2. No Conflict Lessee represents and warrants that the execution, delivery and performance by it of this Lease
does not (i) violate (A) its organizational documents, or (B) any Applicable Law, or (ii) require any approval or
consent of any other Person, except for such approvals or consents that have been obtained on or before the date
hereof or the absence of which could not, individually or in the aggregate, reasonably be expected to have a
material adverse effect on its ability to execute, deliver or perform this Lease.

C.3. Binding Obligation Lessee represents and warrants that this Lease has been duly executed and delivered by
it and is a legally valid and binding obligation, enforceable against it in accordance with the terms hereof, except
ag may be limited by bankruptcy, insolvency, reorganization, moratorium or similar laws relating to or limiting
creditors’ rights generally or by equitable principles relating to enforceability.

C.4. Hazardous Materialy Lessee shall not introduce or use any hazardous, toxic or dangerous materials on, in,
under or over the Premises in violation of any Applicable Law. If Lesscc becomes aware of any such hazardous,
toxic or dangerous materials on, in, under or over the Premises, Lessee shall promptly notify Lessor of the type
and location of such materials in writing. Lessee agrees to assume full responsibility for (and shall protect,
indemnify and defend Lessor Indemnitees against) any lisbility or cleanup obligations for any hazardous, toxic
or dangerous materials on, in, under or over the Premises in violation of any Applicable Law that are directly
caused by the actions of Lessee or those acting for or on behalf of Lessee.

D. LIABILITY AND INDEMNITY

D.1. Lessee Indemnity Lessee shall defend, indemnify, protect and hold harmless Lessor, and its partners,
members, affiliates, agents, directors, shareholders, employees, representatives, successors, assigns, contractors
or anyone claiming under Lessor (collectively, including Lessor, the “Lessor Parties”) from and against all claims,
demands, liabilities, losses, damages, costs (inchuding, without limitation, reasonable attorneys' fees) and
expenses (collectively, “Claims”) suffered or incurred by any of the Lessor Parties as a result of or arising out
of: (a) any acts, omissions or negligence of Lessee, its partners, members, affiliates, agents, directors,
shareholders, employees, representatives, successors, assigns, contractors or anyone claiming under Lessee
(collectively, including Lessee, the “Lessce Parties”) in connection with Lessee Parties’ uses of or operations on
the Property, except to the extent any such Claim is cansed by the negligence or willful misconduct of a Lessor
Party, or (b) a breach of this Lease by Lessee that remains uncured after any applicable notice and cure period.
Notwithstanding the foregoing, the Lessor Parties hereby waive any Claims against the Lessee Parties for damage
or injury suffered by the Lessor Parties arising as a result of any audible or electromagnetic noise, vibration,
electrical interference and radio frequency interference attributable to the Lessee Parties’ operations on the
Property or any other property, provided that nothing herein shall be deemed to release Lessee from its obligation
to defend, indemnify, protect and hold harmless the Lessor Parties from third party claims under the first sentence
of this Section D.1. The Lessee Parties shall not be liable for losses of rent, business opportunities, profits or any
other consequential damages that may result from the conduct of Lessee Parties’ uses of or operations on the
Property.

D.2. Indemnity by Lessor. Lessor shall defend, indemnify, protect and hold harmless the Lessee Parties from and
against any and all Claims suffered or incurred by any of the Lessee Parties as a result of or arising out of: (a) any
acts, omissions or negligence of any of the Lessor Parties in connection with Lessor Parties’ uses of or operations
on the Property, except to the extent any such Claim is caused by the negligence or willful misconduct of a Lessee
Party, (b) the condition of the Property, except to the extent any such Claim is caused by the negligence or willful

" Community 5 Proprictary and Confidential

POWER GROUP



misconduct of a Lessee Party, or (c) a breach of this Lease by Lessor that remains uncured after any applicable
notice and cure period.

D.3. No Consequential Damages. Notwithstanding any provision in this Lease to the contrary, neither Lessee nor
Lessor shall be liable to the other for incidental, consequential, special, punitive or indirect damages, including
without limitation, loss of use, loss of profits, cost of capital or increased operating costs, arising out of this Lease
whether by reason of contract, indemnity, strict liability, negligence, intentional conduct, breach of warranty or
from breach of this Lease. The foregoing provision shall not prohibit Lessee or Lessor from seeking and obtaining
general contract damages for a breach of this Lease.

E. CASUALTY OR CONDEMNATION, FORCE MAJEURE

E.1. In the event the Premises shall be so damaged or destroyed so as to make the use of the Premises impractical
as determined by Lessee, then Lessee may elect to terminate this Lease on not less than twenty (20) days’ prior
notice to Lessor, effective as of a date specified in such notice. If Lessee does not elect to terminate this Lease
pursuant to the previous sentence, Lessor shall exercise commercially reasonable efforts to repair the damage to
the Premises and return the Premises to its condition prior to such damage or destruction; provided, however,
that, except as otherwise provided in this Lease (including Section A.10 and D.2), Lessor shall in no event be
required to repair, replace or restore any property of Lessee comprising part of the Facility, which replacement or
restoration shall be Lessee’s responsibility. In the event of an award related to eminent domain or condemnation
of all or part of the Premises, each Party shall be entitled to take from such an award that portion as allowed by
Applicable Law for its respective property interest appropriated as well as any damages suffered thereby.

E.2. To the extent either Party is prevented by Force Majeure from carrying out, in whole or part, its obligations
under this Lease and such Party (the “Claiming Party*) gives notice and details of the Force Majeure to the other
Party as soon as practicable (and in any event within five (5) Business Days after the Force Majeure first prevents
performance by the Claiming Party), then the Claiming Party will be excused from the performance of its
obligations under this Lease (other than the obligation to make payments then due, and except as otherwise
provided in Section A.10 and D.2). The Claiming Party will use commercially reasonable efforts to eliminate or
avoid the Force Majeure and resume performing its obligations hereunder; provided, however, that neither Party
is required to settle any strikes, lockouts or similar disputes except on terms acceptable to such Party, in its sole
discretion, The non-Claiming Party will not be required to perform or resume performance of its obligations to
the Claiming Party corresponding to the obligations of the Claiming Party excused by Force Majeure (other than
the obligation to make payments then due, and except as otherwise provided in Section A.10 and D.2).

E.3. Force Majeure If performance of this Lease or of any obligation hereunder is prevented or substantiaily
testricted or interfered with by reason of an event of Force Majeure (defined below), the affected Party, upon
giving notice to the other Party, shall be excused from such performance to the extent of and for the duration of
such prevention, restriction or interference. The affected Party shall use its reasonable efforts to avoid or remove
such causes of nonperformance and shall continue performance as soon as such causes are removed. “Force
Majeure” means: fire, earthquake, flood, tornado or other acts of God and natural disasters; strikes or labor
disputes; war, civil strife or other violence; any law, order, proclamation, regulation, ordinance, action, demand
or requirement of any government agency, or any other act or condition beyond the reasonable control of a Party.

F. ASSIGNMENT

F.1. Lessor Assignment Lessor shall have the right to assign its rights, duties and obligations under this L.ease to
& third party without the prior written consent of Lessee, so long as such assignment does not adversely impair
Lessee’s rights in connection with this Lease.

F.2. Lessee Assignment Lessee shall have the right fo assign its rights, duties and obligations under this lease
without the prior written consent of Lessor to the following entities: (i) one or more parties providing financing
or refinancing in connection with the development, construction, ownership, operation or maintenance of the
Facility, or any representative of such parties, and (ii) an affiliated entity or a successor entity in a merger or
acquisition transaction, For the avoidance of doubt, changes in control of Lessee shall not be deemed to be
assignments of this Lease.

J Community 6 Proprietary and Confidential
POWER GROUP



F.3. Lessor Sale In the event Lessor shall decide to sell the Premises, the Lessor hereby grants to Lessee a right
of first offer with respect to the sale of the premises. The Lessee’s right of first offer does not apply to a sale
and/or transfer of the premises to a family member, or family trust. The terms and conditions on which Lessor is
willing to sell shall be conveyed to Lessee in writing. Thereafter, Lessee shall have thirty (30) days within which
to accept said termns and conditions in writing. In the event of Lessee’s acceptance of such offer, Lessor shall sell
the Premises to Lessee pursuant to the terms and conditions of said offer and Lessee shall have one hundred
twenty (120) days to close on the purchase. In the event Lessor does not sell the Premises to a third (3rd) party
after first offering it to Tenant, this right of first offer shall continue to exist as to any proposed subsequent sale.

G. COOPERATION WITH FINANCING

G.1. Right to Encumber. Lessee, any successor or assignee of Lessee, or any holder of a sublease or license (each
hereinafter sometimes referred to as an “Obligor”) may at any time mortgage, pledge, or encumber to any
entity (herein, a “Lender”) all or any portion of the Obligor’s rights and interests under this Lease or such
sublease or license, in each case without the consent of Lessor. For purposes of this Lease, each entity which
now or hereafter is the recipient or beneficiary of any such mortgage, pledge, or encumbrance and whose
lien or encumbrance is now or hereafter recorded in the official records of the County in which the Property
is located, shall be referred to in this Lease as a “Lender”.

G.2. Covenants for Lenders’ Benefit. Lessee and Lessor expressly agree between themselves and for the benefit
of any Lenders, that if an Obligor mortgages, pledges, or encumbers any of its rights and interests as provided
in Section G.1 above, then notwithstanding any other provision of this Lease to the contrary:

G.2.1.1. Lessor and Lessee will not terminate, suspend, amend or modify, or take any action causing,
consenting to, acquiescing in, or accepting the termination, suspension, amendment or modification of this
Lease, if such amendment or modification would reduce the rights or remedies of any Lender hereunder or
impair or reduce the security for any lien held by such Lender, without such Lender’s consent.

G.2.2. Each Lender shall have the right, at its discretion, to take, or cause to be taken, any action required to
be performed under this Lease by the Obligor that is party to such Lender’s mortgage, pledge or
encumbrance, and any such action performed by such Lender shall be as effective to prevent or cure a default
under this Lease and/or a forfeiture of any of such Obligor’s rights under this Lease as if done by such
Obligor itself.

G.2.3. The right of a Lender to receive notices and to cure Obligor’s defaults pursuant to the provisions of
this Section G.2 shall be available only to those Lenders which shall have notified Lessor in writing of their
name and address, or whose lien is recorded in the official recards of the County in which the Property is
located, regardless of whether the specific provision in question expressly so states. No default which
requires the giving of notice to Obligor shall be effective unless a like notice is given to all Lenders. If Lessor
shall become entitled to terminate this Lease due to an uncured default by Obligor, Lessor will not terminate
this Lease unless it has first given written notice of such uncured default and of its intent to terminate this
Lease to each Lender and has given each Lender at least thirty (30) days after the expiration of the cure
period which this Lease provides to Obligor for curing such default, to cure the default to prevent such
termination of this Lease. Furthermore, if within such thirty (30) day period a Lender notifies Lessor that it
must foreclose on Obligor’s interest or otherwise take possession of Obligor’s interest under this Lease in
order to cure the default, Lessor shall not terminate this Lease and shall permit such Lender a sufficient
period of time as may be necessary for such Lender, with the exercise of due diligence, to foreclose or
acquire Obligor’s interest under this Lease and to perform or cause to be performed all of the covenants and
agreements to be performed and observed by Obligor. In the event a Lender shall elect to exercise its rights
hereunder, such Lender shall have no personal liability to Lessor and the sole recourse of the Lessor in
seeking enforcement of its obligations under this Lease or any new lease entered into pursuant to Section
G2.4 below shall be to such Lender’s interest in this Lease and the Property, Upon the sale or other transfer
by any Lender of its interest in the Lease or Property, such Lender shall have no further duties or obligations
hereunder.

J Community 7 Proprietary and Confidential
POWER GROUP



G.2.4. In case of the termination or rejection of this Lease as a result of any default hereunder or the
bankruptcy, insolvency or appointment of a receiver in bankruptcy, Lessor shall provide prompt notice
thereof to the Lenders. Upon written request of the Lender that is the beneficiary of the first priority security
interest in the Lessee’s interest under this Lease, made within forty (40) days afier notice to such Lender of
such rejection or termination, Lessor shall enter into a new lease agreement with such Lender, or its designee
or assignee, within twenty (20) days afier the receipt of such request. Such new lease agreement shall be
effective as of the date of the termination or rejection of this Lease, upon the same terms, covenants,
conditions and agreements as contained in this Lease for the remaining term of the original Lease before
giving effect to such termination or rejection. Lessor shall have no rights to terminate such new lease based
upon defaults occurring prior to the execution of the new lease. Lessor hereby agrees with and for the benefit
of the Lenders that the provisions of this Subsection shall survive termination, rejection or disaffirmation of
the Lease, whether by default or as a result of the bankruptcy, insolvency or appointment of a receiver in
bankruptcy and shall continue in full force and effect thereafter to the same extent as if this Subsection were
a separate and independent instrument. It is the intent of the parties hereto that any such new lease shall have
the same priority as this Lease.

G.2.5. There shall be no merger of this Lease, or of the leasehold estate created by this Lease, with the fee
estate in the Property by reason of the fact that this Lease or the leasehold estate or any interest therein may
be held, directly or indirectly, by or for the account of any person or persons who shall own the fee estate or
any interest therein, and no such merger shall occur unless and uatil all persons at the time having an interest
in the fee estate in the Property and all persons (including the Lenders) having an interest in the Lease or in
the estate of Lessor and Lessee shall join in a written instrument effecting such merger and shall duly record
the same.

G.3. Lessor shall, at Lessee’s or a Lender’s request, provide to Lessee and such Lender (i) confirmation that such
Lender is a “Lender” for purposes of this Lease, (ii) a consent and estoppels acknowledging the Lender’s mortgage
or other lien or encumbrance, confirming the continuing effectiveness of this Lease, identifying any modifications
hereto and any breaches or defaults hereunder, and containing such other information and agreements as Lessee
or such Lender may reasonable request, and (iii) such other certificates or affidavits as Lessee, such Lender or
any title company selected by either Lessee or such Lender may reasonably request. Lessor shall duly execute
and return same to Lessee and/or Lender within ten (10) days of Lessee’s or Lender’s request therefor. Should
Lessor fail to timely execute and deliver the consent and estoppel, then Lessee and/or Lender may rely on the
contents thereof and the consent and estoppel shall be conclusively binding upon Lessor.

H. DEFAULTS AND REMEDIES
H.1. Lessee's Default Each of the following shall be an event of default ("Event of Default") hereunder:

H.1.1, If Lessee shall fail to pay any installment of Construction and Decommissioning Rent, Operating
Rent or any other payment due under this Lease, and such failure shall continue for a period of thirty (30)
days following Lessor's notice of same to Lessee, provided that such notice from Lessor shall be in lieu of,
and not in addition to, any notice of default required by applicable law, Lessee shall be deemed in default
subject to the provisions herein; and provided further, with respect to the notice requirement, Lessor shall
be obligated to give only two (2) such notices per any twelve (12) month period, with any subsequent
payment default to be an Event of Default if such failure to pay shall continue for a period of thirty (30) days
from the date such payment is due and 1 oti not be a defe f for such default;

H.1.2. If Lessee or any guarantor or surety of Lessee's obligations hereunder shall (i) make a general
assignment for the benefit of creditors; (if) commence any proceeding for relief, or seeking reorganization,
arrangement, adjustment, liquidation, dissolution or composition of it or its debts or seeking appointment of
a receiver, trustee, custodian or other similar official for it or for all or of any substantial part of its property;
(iii) become the subject of any such proceeding which is not dismissed within sixty (60) days after its filing
or entry; or (iv) die or suffer a legal disability (if Lessee, guarantor or surety is an individual) or be dissolved
or otherwise fail to maintain its legal existence (if Lessee, gnarantor or surety is a corporation, partmership
or other entity);

“ Community 8 Proprictary and Confidential
POWER GROUP




H.1.3. If Lessee shall fail to discharge or bond over any lien placed upon the Premises in violation of this
Lease within thirty (30) days after Lessee receives notice that any such lien or encumbrance is filed against
the Premises;

H.1.4. if Lessee shall fail to comply with any provision of this Lease, other than those specifically referred
to hereinabove and, except as otherwise expressly provided therein, such default shall continue for more
than thirty (30) days after Lessor shall have given Lessee written notice of such default, or such longer period
if such default cannot be reasonably cured within such thirty (30) day period, provided that Lessee diligently
commences the cure within the thirty (30) day period and diligently prosecutes such cure to completion; and

H.1.5. if Lessee shall abandon the Facility for more than ninety (90) days or fail to remove the facility at the
end of the Lease Term within 180 days. Due to the nature of the Facility, “abandonment” does not refer to
lack of physical presence of personnel on the Premises.

H.2. Upon the occurrence of an Event of Default, defined as aforesaid, then in any such case, notwithstanding
any waiver or other indulgence of any prior default, Lessor may terminate this Lease by written notice to Lessee
sent at any time thereafter, but before Lessee has cured or removed the cause for such termination. Subject to
customary cure periods for any financing parties that may finance all or a portion of the Facilities, such termination
shall take effect on the later of (i) the last day of the month in which Lessee receives the notice, or (ii) twenty-one
(21) days after Lessee receives the notice, and shall be without prejudice to any remedy Lessor might otherwise
have for any prior breach of covenant.

H.3. Lessor Default Election Upon each occurrence of an Event of Default and so long as such Event of Default
shall be continuing, Lessor may at any time thereafter, at its election by written notice to Lessee: (i) terminate this
Lease or Lessee's right of possession, but Lessee shall remain liable as hereinafter provided; and/or (ii) pursue
any remedies provided for under this Lease or at law or in equity. Upon the termination of this Lease or
termination of Lessee's right of possession, it shall be lawful for Lessor, without formal demand or notice of any
kind, to re-enter the Premises by summary dispossession proceedings or any other action or proceeding authorized
by law and to remove Lessee and all persons and property therefrom.

H.4. Reimbursement of Lessor's Expenses In the case of termination of this Lease or termination of Lessee's right
of possession pursuant to 27 (but excluding termination under Section A.5)), Lessee shall reimburse Lessor for
all actual expenses arising out of such termination, including, without limitation, (i) all costs actually incurred in
collecting such amounts due from Lessee under this Lease (including reasonable attorneys' fees actually incurred
and the costs of litigation and the like but only if Lessor is successful in its litigation), (ii) all customary and
necessary expenses incurred by Lessor in attempting to remove the facility in accordance with Section A.S, and
(iii) all Lessor's other expenditures necessitated by the termination. The reimbursement from Lessee shall be due
and payable within thirty (30) days following written notice from Lessor that an expense has been incurred with
documentation substantiating such expenses, without regard to whether the expense was incutred before or after
the termination,

H.5. Termination of Right of Posgsession Even though Lessee has breached this Lease and abandoned the
Premises, this Lease shall continue in effect for so long as Lessor does not terminate the Lease (even though it
has terminated Lessee's right of possession), and Lessor may enforce all its rights and remedies under this Lease,
including the right to recover Rent as it becomes due until the earlier of: i) the experation of the Term; or ii)
Lessee has met all conditions as outlined in A.6. Any such payments due Lessor shall be made on the dates that
Rent would otherwise come due under this Lease, and Lessee agrees that Lessor may file suit to recover any sums
falling due from time to time. Notwithstanding any such termination of possession only, Lessor may at any time
thereafier elect in writing to terminate this Lease for such previous breach.

H.6. Claims in Bankruptcy Nothing herein shall limit or prejudice the right of Lessor to prove and obtain in a
proceeding for bankruptcy, insolvency, arrangement or reorganization, by reason of the termination, an amount
equal to the maximum allowed by the statute of law in effect at the time when, and governing the proceedings in
which, the damages are to be provided, whether or not the amount is greater to, equal to, or less than the amount
of the loss or damage which Lessor has suffered.

J Community 9 Proprietary and Confidential
POWER GROUP



H.7. Lessor's Right to Cure Defaults Lessor may, but shall not be obligated to cure, at any time any default by
Lessee under this Lease after the applicable notice and cure period (if any) has expired. In curing such defaults,
Lessor may enter upon the Premises and take such action thereon as may be necessary to effect such cure. In the
case of an emergency threatening serious and imminent injury to persons or property, Lessor may cure such
default without notice. All costs and expenses incurred by Lessor in curing a default, including reasonable
attorneys' fees actually incurred, together with interest thereon at a rate equal to the lesser of (a) eight percent
(8%) per annum, from the day of payment by Lessor shall be paid by Lessee to Lessor on demand.

H.8. No Waiver Exercise by Lessor of any one or more remedies hereunder granted or otherwise available shall
not be deemed to be an acceptance of surrender of the Premises and/or a termination of this Lease by Lessor,
whether by agreement or by operation of law, it being understood that such surrender and/or termination can be
effected only by the written agreement of Lessor and Lessee. Lessee and Lessor further agree that forbearance or
waiver by either party to enforce its rights pursuant to this Lease, or at law or in equity, shall not be a waiver of
such party's right to enforce one or more of its rights in connection with any subsequent default. A receipt by
Lessor of rent with knowledge of the breach of any covenant hereof shall not be deemed a waiver of such breach,
and no waiver by Lessor of any provision of this Lease shall be deemed to have been made unless expressed in
writing and signed by Lessor. No payment by Lessee, or acceptance by Lessor, of a lesser amount than shall be
due from Lessee to Lessor shall be treated otherwise than as a payment on account of the earliest installment of
any payment due from Lessce under the provisions hereof. The acceptance by Lessor of a check for a lesser
amount with an endorsement or statement thereon, or upon any letter accompanying such check, that such lesser
amount is payment in full, shall be given no effect, and Lessor may accept such check without prejudice to any
other rights or remedies which Lessor may have against Lessee.

H.9. Late Charge; Default Interest If any payment of Base Rent, Additional Rent or any other payment payable
hereunder by Lessee to Lessor shall not be paid when due, Lessor may impose, at its election, a late fee of one
hundred ($100.00) dollars with respect to each late payment and interest on the overdue amount from the date
when the same was payable until the date paid at a rate equal to the lesser of (a) eight percent (8%) per annum.
Such late fee and interest shall constitute Additional Rent payable hereunder.

H.10. Lessor Risk of Entry Should Lessor choose to exercise its rights to enter the Premises and interact with the
Facility in any way under the terms of this Lease, Lessor expressly represents and warrants that it is doing so at
its own risk and indemnifies and holds harmless Lessee from any harm, loss or damage that may occur as a result

of such entry.
1. DISPUTE RESOLUTION

L1. Notice of Dispute/Negotiated Resolution. In the event of any controversy, claim or dispute between the Parties
hereto arising out of or related to this Lease, or the breach hereof, that has not been resolved by informal
discussions and negotiations, either Party may, by written notice to the other, invoke the formal dispute resolution
procedures set forth herein. The written notice invoking these procedures shall set forth in reasonable detsil the
nature, background and circumstances of the controversy, claim or dispute. During the ten (10) Business Day
period following such written notice, the Parties shall meet, confer and negotiate in good faith to resolve the
dispute.

1.2. Mediation If the parties are unable to successfully resolve any dispute under this Lease, then in that event the
dispute shall be submitted to mediation. The dispute shall be mediated in the following manner; (i) The dispute
shall be submitted to the American Arbitration Association for mediation and not arbitration, with each party
paying its own mediation costs and attorney’s fees; (ii) A representative of the American Arbitration Association
shall select a mediator to mediate the dispute with each Party sharing equally the cost of mediation; (iii) The
dispute shall be submitted to the American Arbitration Association for mediation within two (2) weeks of the date
when the Parties themselves have been unsuccessful in resolving the dispute; (iv) As in any mediation procedure,
the mediation shall not be final and binding as would be the case with an arbitration proceeding, and if the
mediation is not successful, then either Party shall have all remedies and rights in accordance with the provisions
of Nlinois Law.

J. NOTICE OF LEASE

“ Community 10 Proprictary and Confidential
POWER GROUP



J.1. Lessee agrees not to record this Lease without Lessor's consent, but, if the Lease Term is seven (7) years or
longer, each party hereto agrees, on the request of the other, to execute a notice of lease in recordable form and
complying with applicable law. In no event shall such document set forth the rent or other charges payable by
Lessee under this Lease; and any such document shall expressly state that it is executed pursuant to the provisions
contained in this Lease, and is not intended to vary the terms and conditions of this Lease. At Lessor's request,
promptly upon expiration of or earlier termination of the Lease Term, Lessee shall execute and deliver to Lessor
a release of any document recorded in the real property records for the location of the Premises evidencing this
Lease, and Lessee hereby appoints Lessor as Lessee's attorney-in-fact, coupled with an interest, to execute any
such document if Lessee fails to respond to Lessor's request to do so within fifteen (15) days. The obligations of
Lessee under this Section J.1 shall survive the expiration or any earlier termination of the Lease Term.

K. MISCELLANEOUS

K.1. Notices All notices, requests, statements or payments will be made to the addresses and persons specified
below. All notices will be made in writing except where this Lease expressly provides that notice may be made
orally. Notices required to be in writing will be delivered by hand delivery, overnight delivery, facsimile, or e-
mail (80 long as a copy of such e-mail notice is provided immediately thereafier in accordance with the
requirements of this Section by hand delivery, overnight delivery, or facsimile). Notice by facsimile will (where
confirmation of successful transmission is received) be deemed to have been received on the day on which it was
transmitted (unless transmitted after 5:00 p.m. at the place of receipt or on a day that is not a Business Day, in
which case it will be deemed received on the next Business Day). Notice by hand delivery or overnight delivery
will be deemed to have been received when delivered. Notice by e-mail will be deemed to have been received
when such e-mail is transmitted, so long as a copy of such e-mail notice is delivered immediately thereafter by
hand delivery, overnight delivery, or facsimile. When notice is permitted to be provided orally, notice by
telephone will be permitted and will be deemed to have been received at the time the call is received. A Party
may change its address by providing notice of the same in accordance with the provisions of this Section. Initial
addresses for notice shall be as follows:

Lessor:

Trust #16851

2400 W 95t Street
Evergreen Park, IL 60805

Lessee:

Community Power Group LLC
4849 Rugby Avenue, Suite 1000
Bethesda, MD 20814
202-844-6423

K.2. Governing Law/Venue This Lease will be governed by the laws of Illinois without giving effect to principles
of conflicts of laws that would require the application of the law of another jurisdiction.

K.3. Entire Apreement: Amendments This Lease constitutes the entire agreement between the Parties, and shall
supersede any prior oral or written agreements between the Parties, relating to the subject matter hereof or thereof.
Any amendment, modification or change to this Lease will be void unless in writing and signed by both Parties.

K.4. Non-Waiver No failure or delay by either Party in exercising any right, power, privilege, or remedy
hereunder will operate as a waiver thereof. Any waiver must be in a writing signed by the Party making such
waiver.

K.5. Severability If any part, term, or provision of this Lease is determined by an arbitrator or court of competent
jurisdiction to be invalid, illegal, or unenforceable, such determination shall not affect or impair the validity,
legality, or enforceability of any other part, term, or provision of this Lease, and shall not render this Lease
unenforceable or invalid as a whole. Rather the part of this Lease that is found invalid or unenforceable will be
amended, changed, or interpreted to achieve as nearly as possible the same objectives and economic effect as the
original provision, or replaced to the extent possible, with a legal, enforceable, and valid provision that is as

J Community 11 Proprietary and Confidential
POWER GROUP



similar in tenor to the stricken provision, within the limits of Applicable Law or applicable court decisions, and
the remainder of this I.ease will remain in full force.

K.6. No Third Party Beneficiaries Nothing in this Lease will provide any benefit to any third party or entitle any
third party (other than any Lessor Indemnitee or Lessee Indemnitee) to any claim, cause of action, remedy or right
of any kind.

K.7. No Recourse to Affiliates This Lease is solely and exclusively between the Parties, and any obligations
created herein on the part of either Party shall be the obligations solely of such Party. No Party shall have recourse
to any parent, subsidiary, partner, member, Affiliate, Lender, director, officer or employee of the other Party for
performance or non-performance of any obligation hereunder, unless such obligations were assumed in writing,
pursuant to Section F.1 and F.2, by the Person against whom recourse is sought.

K.8. Relationships of Parties This Lease shall not be interpreted to create an association, joint venture, or
partnership between the Parties nor to impose any partnership obligation or liability upon either Party.

K.9. Counterparts This Lease may be executed in several counterparts, each of which is an original and all of
which together constitute one and the same instrument. A signature on a copy of this Lease received by either
Party by facsimile is binding upon the other Party as an original. Both Parties agree that a photocopy of such
facsimile may also be treated by the Parties as a duplicate original,

K.10. Fyrther Assurances The Parties shall do such further acts, perform such further actions, execute and deliver
such further or additional documents and instruments as may be reasonably required or appropriate to
consummate, evidence, or confirm the agreements and understandings contained herein and to carry out the intent
and purposes of this Lease.

K.11. Construction of Agreement This Lease and any ambiguities or uncertainties contained herein shall be
equally and fairly interpreted for the benefit of and against both Parties and shall further be construed and
interpreted without reference to the identity of the Party preparing this document, it being expressly understood
and agreed that the Parties participated equally in the negotiation and preparation of this Lease or have had equal
opportunity to do so. Accordingly, the Parties hereby waive the legal presumption that the language of the contract
should be interpreted most strongly against the Party who caused the uncertainty to exist.

K.12. Estoppel Either Party, without charge, at any time and from time to time, within five (5) Business Days
after receipt of a written request by the other Party, shall deliver a written instrument, duly executed, certifying
to such requesting Party, or any other Person specified by such requesting Party: (i) that this Lease is
unmodified and in full force and effect, or if there has been any modification, that the same is in full force and
effect as so modified, and identifying any such modification; (ii) whether or not to the knowledge of such Party
there are then existing any defenses in favor of such Party against enforcement of any of the terms, covenants and
conditions of this Lease and, if so, specifying the same and also whether or not to the knowledge of such Party
the other party has observed and performed all of the terms, covenants and conditions on its part to be observed
and performed, and if not, specifying the same; (iii) such other information as may be reasonably requested
by a Party hereto. Any written instrument given hereunder may be relied upon by the recipient of such instrument,
except to the extent the recipient has actual knowledge of facts contrary to the facts contained in the certificate.

K.13. Confidentiality Each Party (the “Receiving Party™) will hold in confidence any information concerning the
affairs of the other Party (the “Discloging Party”) and will not disclose, publish or make use of such information
unless (A) the Disclosing Party agrees in writing to the release of such information, (B) the Receiving Party can
establish that the information was generally available in the public domain at the time of such disclosure or was
developed independently by the Disclosing Party, or (C) such data or information is required by Applicable Law
to be disclosed; provided, however, that such disclosure will be made only to the extent required by Applicable
Law and, to the extent permitted by Applicable Law, only after providing the Disclosing Party with prior written
notice. Notwithstanding the foregoing, each Party agrees that the other Party may disclose such data and
information to its officers, directors, employees, agents, representatives, subcontractors, Lenders, investors,
potential Lenders or potential investors, on a “need to know” basis; provided, however, that such officers,
directors, employees, agents, representatives and subcontractors will be advised of the confidentiality provisions
hereof. Upon any termination or expiration of this Lease, the Receiving Party will promptly return to the

" Community 12 Proprictary and Confidential
POWER GROUP



Disclosing Party all such data and information in the Receiving Party’s possession (or in the possession of any
other person or entity permitted hereby to possess such information pursuant hereto) at such time, unless otherwise
directed by the Disclosing Party. The obligations of the Parties under this Section will survive for a period of two
(2) years from and after the termination of this Lease.

K.14. Subordination Upon the request of Lessor, to execute and deliver all such instruments as may reasonably
be requested to subordinate this Lease to any mortgages or deeds of trust securing notes or bonds executed by
Lessor and to all advances made thereunder and to the interest thereon and all renewals, replacements and
extensions thereof, provided that Lessor first obtains from Lessor's Mortgagee and delivers to Lessee a written
agreement that provides substantially that so long as no Event of Default has occurred and is then continuing and
so long as Lessee performs its obligations under this Lease, no foreclosure of|, deed given in lieu of foreclosure
of, or sale under the encumbrance, and no steps or procedures taken under the encumbrance, shall affect Lessee's
rights hereunder. Lessor's Mortgagee may at any time subordinate its mortgage or deed of trust to this Lease,
without Lessee's consent, by notice in writing to Lessee and thereupon this Lease shall be deemed prior to such
mortgage or deed of trust without regard to their respective dates of execution, delivery and recording; and in that
event such mortgagee or trustee shall have the same rights with respect to the Lease as though it had been executed
and delivered (and notice thereof recorded) prior to the execution and delivery and recording of the mortgage or
deed of trust provided Lessor obtains a subordination and non-disturbance agreement from the present mortgagee
of record in a form reasonably satisfactory to Lessee.

K.15. Nuisance At all times during the Lease Term and such further time as Lessee occupies the Premises, Lessee
agrees not to injure, overload, deface or otherwise harm the Premises; nor commit any nuisance; nor to do or
suffer any waste to the Premises; nor permit the emission of any objectionable noise or odor; nor make any use
of the Premises which is improper, or contrary to any Legal Requirement or which will invalidate any insurance
policy covering the Premises or any portion thereof, including, without limitation, the handling, storage and
disposal of any hazardous material.

K.16. Changes and Alterations Except as otherwise explicitly set forth herein, Lessee shall have no authority,
without the express written consent of Lessor, which consent shall not be unreasonably withheld, conditioned or
delayed, to alter, remodel, reconstruct, demolish, add to, improve or otherwise change the Premises, except that
Lessee shall have such authority, without the consent of Lessor, to make repairs to the Premises and do such
things as are appropriate to comply with the obligations imposed on Lessee under other provisions of this Lease
and to make "minor alterations” as set forth below.Lessee shall not construct or permit any alterations,
installations, additions or improvements including any interior or exterior signs "Alterations") to the Premises or
the Building without having first submitted to Lessor plans and specifications for Lessor's approval, which
approval shall not be unreasonably withheld or delayed. The restrictions in this provision shall not apply to the
equipment owned and operated by Lessee nor the activities associated with the normal construction and operations
of a solar facility.

K.17. Quiet Enjoyment Lessor covenants that Lessee on paying the Rent and performing Lessee's obligations
under this Lease shall peacefully and quietly have, hold and enjoy the Premises throughout the Lease Term or
until it is terminated as in this Lease provided without hindrance by Lessor or by anyone claiming by, through or
under Lessor.

“ Community 13 Proprictary and Confidential
POWER GROUP



H

WITHESS Y

EI5 WHEREOUF, Lessor und Lessee have caused 1is i_ease 10 be duly executed. under seal. by persons

reunto duly authorized, as of :his \9_day of December 2017.

<SSEE:
/:——’-——‘*

V
ymmunity Power Group, LLmkowski/Managing Member

iSSOR:

Yot Hr— Yo

ust #16851/Vickie White/Trustee

pe]
-
e

- /"‘I)

S wes f L O Y

ust #16851/Lovis Dodd/Trustee

Jst #16851/Astrid Cooper.

< : 14
¥ Sommunity

gd 4708582804

Proprictary and Confidential

[ejoH doaT yinog obyH

d/0:€0Z1 6L 98Q



EXHIBIT A
Description of Premises

LYING IN WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS, being all or a portion of Parcel #22-22-21-400-002-0000 and #22-22-
22-300-002-0000. The leased Premise is anticipated to host a solar and related energy storage as shown on the
attached map and discussed in more detail below and which may change in accordance with the final design of a
facility that has received all the necessary approvals for the Facility to operate and sell the electric and
environmental attributes generated as will be further detailed in Exhibit B upon receipt of all approvals for the
final facility design.

e

3 ELThStT—E
i

This Lease and the Premise includes the exclusive right for solar energy conversion, for the collection, storage
and transmission of electric power, and for related and incidentsl purposes and activities (collectively,
“Operations™ or “Solar Energy System Operations™), including, without limitation:

Conducting studies of solar radiation, solar energy, soils, and other meteorological and geotechnical dats;

b. Constructing, reconstructing, erecting, installing, improving, replacing, relocating and removing from time
to time, and maintaining, using, monitoring and operating, existing, additional or new (i) individual units or
arrays of solar energy collection cells, panels, mirrors, lenses and related facilities necessary to harmess
sunlight for photovoltaic energy generation, including without limitation, existing and/or future technologies
used or useful in connection with the generation of electricity from sunlight, and associated support structure,
braces, wiring, plumbing, and related equipment (“Facility™), (ii) electrical transmission and distribution
facilities, including without limitation, overhead and underground transmission, distribution or collector lines,
circuit breakers, meters, conduit, footings, towers, poles, crossarms, guy lines, anchors, cabling and wires,
(iii) overhead and underground control, communications and radio relay systems, (iv) substations,
interconnection and/or switching facilities and electric transformers and transformer pads, (v) energy storage
facilities, (vi) meteorological towers and solar energy measurement equipment, (vii) control buildings, control
boxes and computer monitoring hardware, (viii) utility installation, (ix) safety protection facilities, (x)

J COmmunity 15 Proprietary and Confidential
POWER GROUP




maintenance yards, (xi) roads and erosion control facilities, (xii) signs and fences, and (xiii) other
improvements, fixtures, facilities, machinery and equipment associated or connected with the generation,
conversion, storage, switching, metering, step-up, step-down, transmission, distribution, conducting,
wheeling, sale or other use or conveyance of electricity (all of the foregoing, including the Energy,
collectively a “Solar Energy System” or “Improvements” or “Project™);

An exclusive right for the construction, operation, maintenance, repair, replacement, relocation within the
Property and removal of a Battery Energy Storage System that will store electricity along with related
equipment, fixtures, appliances, appurtenances and improvements related thereto (collectively, the “Storage
Facility™) on, under, over and across a portion of the Property;

A non-exclusive right for the development, erection, installation, construction, improvement, interconnection,
reconstruction, enlargement, removal, relocation, replacement and repowering, and the use, maintenance,
repair and operation of, facilities for the storage, collection, distribution, step-up, step-down, wheeling,
transmission and sale of electricity and for communications in connection with the Solar Energy System,
including the following, at such locations as Lessee shall determine that are developed, constructed and/or
operated on the Property and/or on property to be acquired by leasehold or by fee purchase, by or on behalf
of Lessee: underground and/or overhead distribution, collection and transmission lines; underground and/or
overhead control, communications and radio relay systems and telecommunications equipment; energy
storage facilities; interconnection and/or switching facilities, circuit breakers, transformers; cables, wires,
fiber, conduit, footings, foundations, towers, poles, crossarms, guy lines and anchors, and any related or
associated improvements, fixtures, facilities, appliances, machinery and equipment to grant access to third
parties for transmission access (together with the Storage Facility, collectively, the “Transmission Facilities™).

Digging and excavating on the Property for the purposes of servicing, operating and maintaining the Solar
Energy System. Lessee covenants and agrees to obtain any necessary permits required in connection with
such wells;

Removing, trimming, pruning, topping or otherwise controlling the growth of any tree, shrub, plant or other
vegetation; dismantling, demolishing, and removing any improvement, structure, embankment, impediment,
berm, wall, fence or other object, on or that intrudes (or upon maturity could intrude) into the Property that
could obstruct, interfere with or impair the Solar Energy System or the use of the Property intended by Lessee
hereunder;

A non-exclusive easement for vehicular and pedestrian access, ingress and egress to, from and over the
Property, at such locations as Lessee shall determine, for purposes related to or associated with the Solar
Energy System and/or the Transmission Facilities installed or to be installed on the Property, or for
promotional or marketing purposes and a non-exclusive easement on adjacent property or elsewhere; which,
without limiting the generality of the foregoing, shall entitle Lessee to use and improve any existing and
future roads and access routes (a) from time to time located on or providing access to the Property, (b) across
any other property owned by Lessor and (c) across any access routes over which Lessor has the right to travel;

A non-exclusive right to extract soil samples, perform geotechnical tests, and conduct such other tests, studies,
inspections and analysis of or on the Property as Lessee deems necessary, useful or appropriate; and

Undertaking any other lawful activities, whether accomplished by Lessee or a third party authorized by
Lessee, that Lessee determines are necessary, helpful, appropriate or convenient in connection with,
incidental to or to accomplish any of the foregoing purposes.

Community 16 Proprietary and Confidential
J POWER GROUP



BIT

Final Facility D se

Detailed description of premise and installed MWs will be added once final facility engineering and all approvals
have been received.

J Community 17 Proprietary and Confidential
POWER GROUP



EXHIBITC

SCHEDULE OF DEFINITIONS AND RULES OF INTERPRETATION

L. Definitions. The definitions provided below and elsewhere in this Lease will apply to the defined terms
used in this Lease:

“Affiliate” means, with respect to any entity, any other entity that, directly or indirectly, through one or more
intermediaries, controls, or is controlled by, or is under common control with, such entity.

“Applicable Law” means, with respect to any governmental authority, any constitutional provision, law, statute,
rule, regulation, ordinance, treaty, order, decree, judgment, decision, certificate, holding, injunction, registration,
license, franchise, permit, authorization, guideline, governmental approval, consent or requirement of such
governmental authority, enforceable at law or in equity, along with the interpretation and administration thereof
by any governmental authority.

“Environmental Atiributes” means any and all credits, benefits, emissions reductions, offsets, and allowances,
howsoever entitled, attributable to the generation from the Facility, and its displacement of conventional energy
generation. Environmental Attributes include but are not limited to Renewable Energy Credits, as well as: (a) any
avoided emissions of pollutants to the air, soil or water such as sulfur oxides (SOx), nitrogen oxides (NOx), carbon
monoxide (CO) and other pollutants; (b) any avoided emissions of carbon dioxide (CO2), methane (CH4) nitrous
oxide, hydrofluoro carbons, perfluoro carbons, sulfur hexafluoride and other greenhouse gases (GHGs) that have
been determined by the United Nations Intergovernmental Panel on Climate Change, or otherwise by Applicable
Law, to contribute to the actual or potential threat of altering the Earth’s climate by trapping heat in the
atmosphere; and (c) the reporting rights to these avoided emissions such as Green Tag Reporting Rights. Green
Tag Reporting Rights are the right of a Green Tag Purchaser to report the ownership of accumulated Green Tags
in compliance with Applicable Law, and to a federal or state agency or any other Person at the Green Tag
Purchaser’s discretion, and include without limitation those Green Tag Reporting Rights accruing under Section
1605(b) of The Energy Policy Act of 1992 and any present or future Applicable Law, and international or foreign
emissions trading program. Green Tags are accumulated on MWh basis and one Green Tag represents the
Environmental Attributes associated with one (1) MWh of energy.

“Person” means an individual, general or limited partnership, corporation, municipal corporation, business trust,
joint stock company, trust, unincorporated association, joint venture, governmental authority, limited liability
company, or any other entity of whatever nature.

2. Rules of Interpretation. In this Lease, unless expressly provided otherwise:

(a) the words “herein,” “hereunder” and “hereof” refer to the provisions of this Lease and a reference to
a recital, Section, subsection or paragraph of this Lease or any other agreement is a reference to a
recital, Section, subsection or paragraph of this Lease or other agreement in which it is used unless
otherwise stated;

(b) references to this Lease, or any other agreement or instrument, includes any schedule, exhibit, annex
or other attachment hereto or thereto;

(c) areference to a paragraph also refers to the subsection in which it is contained, and a reference to a
subsection refers to the Section in which it is contained;

(d) a reference to this Lease, any other agreement or an instrument or any provision of any of them
includes any amendment, variation, restatement or replacement of this Lease or such other agreement,
instrument or provision, as the case may be;

(e) a reference to a statute or other law or a provision of any of them includes all regulations, rules,
subordinate legislation and other instruments issued or promulgated thereunder as in effect from time
to time and all consolidations, amendments, re-enactments, extensions or replacements of such
statute, law or provision;

“ Community 18 Proprietary and Confidential
POWER GROUP



(f) the singular includes the plural and vice versa;

() areference to a Person includes a reference to the Person’s executors and administrators (in the case
of a natural person) and successors, substitutes (including Persons taking by novation) and permitted
assigns;

(h) words of any gender shall include the corresponding words of the other gender;

() “including” means “including, but not limited to,” and other forms of the verb “to include” are to be
interpreted similarly;

() references to “or” shall be deemed to be disjunctive but not necessarily exclusive, (i.e., unless the
context dictates otherwise, “or” shall be interpreted to mean “and/or” rather than “either/or”);

(k) where a period of time is specified to run from or after a given day or the day of an act or event, it is
to be calculated exclusive of such day; and where a period of time is specified as commencing on a
given day or the day of an act or event, it is to be calculated inclusive of such day;

(1) areference to a Business Day is a reference to a period of time commencing at 9:00 a.m. local time
on a Business Day and ending at 5:00 p.m. local time on the same Business Day;

(m) if the time for performing an obligation under this Lease expires on a day that is not & Business Day,
the time shall be extended until that time on the next Business Day;

(n) areference to (i) a month is a reference to a calendar month and (ji) a year is a reference to a calendar
year,

(o) where a word or phrase is specifically defined, other grammatical forms of such word or phrase have
corresponding meanings;

(p) areference to time is a reference to the time in effect in Washington, DC on the relevant date; and if
a payment prescribed under this Lease to be made by a Party on or by a given Business Day is made
after 5:00 pm on such Business Day, it is taken to be made on the following Business

-/

Community 19 Proprietary and Confidential
POWER GROUP



DEPARTMENT OF BUILDING AND
ZONING
OF COOK COUNTY, ILLINOIS

Timothy P, Bleaher
COOMMISSIONER OF BUILDING AND ZONING
OF COOK COUNTY

County Administration Building
69 W. Washington, Suite 2830
Chicago, L 60602-3169
TEL (312) 603-0500
FAX (312) 603-9940
TDD (800) 526-0857

hitp:/iwww.cookeountvil.gov/buitding-and-zoning

DESCRIPTION OF WORK
1 Construct 0 Remode! O Repalr {1 Demclish
O Masonry O Frame 0 Garage O Shed
O Reroof O Deck 3 Fencs 0O Pool/Spa
O Flatwork O Generstor 0O HVAC O Sign
0O Cefl Sits D SisGrading O Windows O Doors

Other (Please Describe) 2MW solar PV fadliity
Estimated Cost of Work $

If applying to correct a violation, provide your Violation # A"

PROPERTY INFORMATION
Real Estats indexNo.PN) 3 2 - 16-402-002-0000
Address 900 Jod| Temrace, Chicago Helghts L6041
Exdsting Building & Uses N/A
Proposed Bullding & Uses g

REGISTERED CONTRACTORS

All contractors or homeowners performing work must
Cook County Bulding & Zoning and submit a Letier of intent

Contractor Name Trade CC Reg. #

PERMIT INSTRUGTIONS
Before Applying

Refer fo the Pemmit Requirsmants Section of he Cook County
Bullding & Zoning Webslts. Submitting ali the required
dacuments will reduce deficlencies end faciiitate faster approvel.

Complets the Application
»  Check the boxes to tha left that epply to the scope of wori.

" A Real Eslaia Index Number (PIN) is REQUIRED to spply
for a permil. You can find the PIN on a recant property tax
bill or by using the Cook Viewer Application online.

*  Provide the property address and existing use (and
proposed usa I applicable),

= Listall contractors performing work and thalr Cook County
Contractor Registration numbsr for the trade they are
performing. (f the homeowner wilt be performing work on
Mrpmpertyﬂmymmlgslmglstmasahomm
contractor with Cook County. The homecwner doing work
and ell contractors on the job, must provide signed letiers
of intent

= Provide the estimated cost of work

= All applications MUST check appiicable waler supply and
sewage disposal baxes regardiess of the scape of worik,

—— Submit the Application and Documents ——

ppiication
drawings must be scanned clesrly and saved in PDF
format. Atiach the files in en emall and send them to

intake.brz@dcookcountyil.gov
The Intake department will reply with 8 penmit review
her which will be used to track status of your permit.

PLUMBING INFORMATION
Water Supply: O Wefl O Water
State of llinols Heelth Dept. Number: N/A
Dapth of Well N/A 8. Pump Type: N/A
Sewage Disposal: O Sewer O Septic
Sanitary District Approval Number NA

Heaglth Department Approval Number _N/A
Number of Plumbing Fixtures N/A

ELECTRICAL INFORMATION
New Servica Size, Exfsting Senvice Size
No. and Amperage of all circults
Low Voltage:
[T Smoke Detectors [0 Cable O Telephons D Data O Audio
O Intercam O Secuwsity System O Central Vacuurs O Other

APPLICANT INFORMATION
lmfylhznhcmemmxhalpplmmmmmdwmthebmofmy
Imowledge and belief; and, that all construction work under the peoposed peamit will
conform to the deawings and |pea6uuounacbadmm-pphaum,md,will
confoan to the Cook County Buikding and Zoning Ondinsnce, 28 ameuded. Further,

Iarﬂyﬂul[hwmvedth:ConkCoummelﬂ!gdeamg
Oahn:mqmdmndthunmdwmmldebylpphbkpwnmmbd«q

duging and after erection,
Owner or Authorlzad Agent MDB Equity Parinars, LI C
Applicant Address 7105 Ridgewood Avenue, Chevy Chase, MD 20815
Phone No.
Emall
Architect ! Engineer (If applcable)

Phone No, Email;

View Permit Status

The link to the can be found under the
Buliding Permit Section of the Cook County Building & Zoning
Website. Starting one csiendar day after recelving your six
digit permit review number, check your permit status onfine.

Resolving Deficiencies

Woe recommend waiting until ail departments have
reviewad your applicstion befors submiifing revisions and
additional documents to the permit control department

If we request revisona fo a set of drawings, all reviaed
submittals shall include the original submitta! plus the corrected
drawings In a single file. The voided drawings will be marked
“VOID” In the upper right hand comer. The process shal be
the same for afl Architeciural, Civil and MEP drawings,

Addiional documenta fike surveys, agency approval letters,
lattars of intent, descriplions of work shafl be seperate pdf fles
from the drawings. All revisad drawings and documents go to;

itcontrol. ntyil.qov

Final Approval and Payment

Payment is made aftar the permit has been approved and
invoiced. You can pay by credit card and the permil piacard
will be mafted to you. You permit fee includes inspections

if you are picking up & permit in person, you can pay by
check or money arder and recelve the pemit same-
day. Cash and credit cards are NOT accepted.
If sppiicable, approved plans will be emalled ta the emaf
axddress provided

‘muppllumhls until 30 days to make payment for
approvad parmits from the date of lnvoice. The applicant
shall inform the Bullding Commistonor In writing f he or

sho does not intend to move forward with the projact.

OFFICE USE ONLY

Parmit # Zoning Plan Examiner

Date:




DEPARTMENT OF BUILDING AND County Administration Building
ZONING 69 W. Washington, Suite 2830
OF COOK COUNTY, ILLINOIS Chicago, IL 60602-3169
TEL (312) 603-0500
Timethy P. Bleuher FAX (312) 603-9540
COMMISSIONER OF BUILDING AND ZONING TDD (800) 526-0857
OF COOK COUNTY
hitp.//www.cookcountyil.gov/building-and-zoning

PERMIT TIPS

Would you like to have your building permit reviewed as quickly as possible?
Would you like the permit process to be stress-free?

We hope that a careful review of the following tips will help to facliitate the permit review and issuance process.

1. Before completing the permit application, please refer to the Permit Requirements page of our website for
the application submittals necessary for the type of work to be done.

2. Present a complete permit application package (see reverse side for a basie, minimum checkoff guide).
The Department of Building and Zoning now requires digital submissions for all applications and
supporting documents.  Applicants that have digital files 10MB or less are required to email their
submittals to intake bnz@cookcountyil.gov If your submiital Is larger, we accept an electronic copy on a
flash drive or CD (PDF format).

After you have received a permit application number, you can visit the link below to check the status of
your penmit as it gets reviewed. You can also register your emall to get notification as your permit status
gets updated.

hitps://secure.cookcountyil.govib_z/index.php

Please wait for the Department of Building and Zoning to send you Notification asking you to address
comments and deficiencles following the technical permit process.

The Notice will outline each department's concerns or questions (l.e., zoning, architectural, plumbing,
electrical, contractor registration, and other).

In order to best serve you and your permit process at this point, we would ask that you address the
deficiencles after you get the Notice. Send in your responses to permitcontrol.bnz@cookcountyil.gov

it is most expeditious for permit review, if the majority of deficiency items are submitted at one time rather
than in a piecemeal fashion.

3. If your appiication submittal did not have any deficiencies or upon satisfaction of all permit deficiencies,
you permit application is approved and ready for issuance, Please be advised, that you will be sent an
invoice by mail of the permit fee to be remitted. Upon receipt of payment, we will mail you the building
permit.

Of course, after notification, you can bring the permit fee, by check only, In person, and you will
immediately be Issued the bullding permit.

4. Inspections are required all during the construction process. Upon issuance of your permit, you will
receive the name and phone numbers of the fleld inspectors and the stages of construction which must
be inspected.

5. Two critical submissions are required during construction, a spot survay and a final grade survey; please
refer to the Engineering Advisory.

Your cooperation in adhering to these proceduras will help us to better serve you during the permit process. if you
have any questions or need additional assistance, please do not hesitate to contact the Department of Building
and Zoning. Thank you.

Timothy P. Bleuher
Commissioner



paniasay siybiy iy 9102 dnoig samod Apumuuo) 9 n_ D o m o m w ;On— ’
Alunwwod

uspJes Lm_om BE:EEOU ::m Lm:ummm




dNOYO ¥YIMOd C.aN
paniasay saybty 1y — 910z dnoin Jamod Apunwwo) @ 1
Auunwiwio) ‘

SJQWNSU02

01 JUNOJSIP e 1e p|osS

9q ued AdJsus ayj sueaw

yalym ‘Je|os Jo 1509

}954J0 01 pasn SI SalljiIn

AONIOVY 43MOd SIONITTI 93} 0] S}IpaJd JO 3|es
91 woJ} spaadoid ayl

palesauagd AS1aua ayl uo
. paseq ,S}paJd, aseyaind
Aayl 4amod siy3 3uisn

2Je sal3l|13n eyl anoid o]

Xiw A81aus

ul Jejos Jo \\D 0°€ dAey 01 ‘pFwo) 1| ‘sal|in salinbay
sioul|] 40 91e1s ay3 ul

Je|os J10j Aem ay3 paned uoile|siSa| mau - 9TQ¢ Joquade(

MB3IAJIBAQ JB|OS Sloul|||



- " ww dNOYD YImMod -,
paniasay siybuy 1y — 9107 dnos9 samod AHunwwo) @

WI0Sy

i

F & [

&
ﬁ

UO0NB207] Gwﬁo_n_ﬂ

oxeia|besy

ung 1aydaag — MalAISAQ J9loud




dNOYS YIMOd
Aunwiwo)

m

paniasay siybry §1v — 910z dnosn Jamod Apunwwo) Q@

|
i

Won I

| &£%¥105 =3HO334(}

L0049
= dNCES YIN0d ALINCWIKOD

M.LOLP,9E.L8 'N,SDSTE:.L

dNOHO M+

i | | > SR |

uns Jaydaag — M3aIAIDAQ 193[0ud



dNO¥Y9 ¥IMOd (-2
umimmmzzcmit<|m~d~&=aﬁgm§°m&E:EEQUQ
b_czEEoU \

ue|d adeaspuer|

ue|d Suluolssiwwod3(|

ue|d Aduasiaw] pue aodueualule| |

9J02S AJO1UDAU| 924N0S3Y |einlepN

sgulpul} ON — M3IA3J S2109dS palasuepu]

A1[13N Y2IM JUSWD343Y UOIIDBUUO0IIRU| |

sIsAjeuy uononpold Asiauj|

SWwal| 22uadI|ig anq 123load 41210



dNO¥S ¥3IMOd 4
paniasay siybry i1y — 910z dno19 Jamod Ayununwe) @ S
Aunwiwio) \

ettty Gcns ] LOERIA ) -
o gse D g ]
w83 aBawa) e Lo )il
sadaseg Addng kusutdenn -
-

BAPP OC - BIOLI T 81 QIOLR 1S Way spseg

- Saans uag) sbven) o<
= ~ s - oepais sBoney svon 4

(A11) 0825 229000 3
OISR SN Paariuy yreetpumey

0T 1t ey g s LCIr S8 O0 1) SIONTS-000

{19 VET0O8 1) (NODQT 00N 5
vy

S0RNG sy | SIE semand
Sorrn wIR0s 0D e WO PIWOI MMM

PRWOD

02 8 Wiy L0 B ReLry &

$19Q112sgns 40} |19 A}ID141D3]2 JOMO] B S| }nSal pua 3yl -

[]IJ SI9WO01SNI UO W}l dul| 91esedas e se umoys HpaJt) -

an|eA 11941 03 JuUnoJsIp e 1e Allunwwod ay} 031 yJeq p|os aJe ,SipaJd, asoyl -
p18 ayj 01 yoeq sind 11 Adiaus Jo Junowe ay3 40} ,11padd, B SOAIdaI HS) Byl -
saJloe GT Aj@iewixoisdde uo sjpued Jie|os JO suapJien .

(SDSD) suapJien Je|os Alunwwo)



dNOYs ¥3MOd a
paniasay sybry i1y — 910z dnoi9 Jamogd Ayunwwo) @ .
Ajunwwo) ‘

(p21e13083u Bulaqg S| 91e4 131 ON) SIPaId 3soyl Joj
13uUMo uapJes 1ejos Alunwiuwo) ayl Aed Asyy pue paaladal SHpPaJd 3yl Jo anjea ayy Aq paonpal si |[iq AJjiIn S19quISONS UspJIes Jejos Ajunwiwo) ay L @
111g 413y uo pasn SYAM JO Jaquunu Y3 JO %407 T 01 dn S)pald axel Aew Jaquasqnsy .
uapies Jejos e woJ) Jamod 3y} JO %0 UBY] 3J0W 3] J0UULD SI3QUISGNS JUQ  «
$12qLIasqns usapJes Jejos AJlunwiwo) ayy Jo s|jiq Axj1In ayl o3 ,SypaJd,, 9S0yl 91e20|je 03 AYjIIN 3Y] $1INJISUl uaplesd Jejos AJUNWWod 3Y3 JO JI3UMo 3y @
(um> 1ad 990£0°0%~) P18 ay1 uo 1nd pue sjaued Jejos ay1 Aq pasnpoud sejos JOUAN (IE3 10 ,11pald, Alejauow e S31eald uasawy @
p148 ay3 03 uas s| 1ey) Jamod 31esuad sjpued Jejos Y] pue SaUIYs uns ay| @

L —

0008:1Ew8
=
—e——

g 33243

il

» dVY10S ALINNWWO)

JO SIIseg ay]

suapJien Jejos AJlunwwo)



dNO¥9 ¥3Mod 2
Ppaniasay siybiy iy — 9107 dnoin 1amog Apunwiuo) @
Aunwiwo) \

3urreaR jo pioysaryy, 0
Suryiearg uewny S
0l
soIpn§ SuIpI0oay pue iseopeolg Sl
Iadsiyp a8e1oay 0z
[1eH H2ou0) Aydwg ST
WSIN 18 woo1pag 191 0¢ .
ce WOOJ 1X3U 3Y31 Ul J3Yysemysip e ueyy
A1eiqi 10 1oyeay |, Aidwy o SS9| 9q ||IM WJe} JB|OS 3Y] WOI) punos ayl ‘Y 00T IV
St
W00y JXON JOUSEMYSI 0S ,,2Ul| 93ud} 3y} Suoje suol1ed0| SWOS 1e pieay
W 1 UOHBSIIAUOD 1IN §S 9q p|N0J wny J3M3AU] Jule} B YSnoy) ‘S|aA3| punousyieq
09
W | 18 yooods [EwION e 10 ygpsy.~ 1e Ajjesauad asam sAesse Ad ayi Jo Aiepunoq
Wl ¢ J© JOUB3[) WNNOBA 0L paJuaj 9yl 8uoje S[aA3| punos,, ‘zzng |eI11IJ[D ‘MO|
w | je 3unnoys SL
w | 12 [esodsiq 23equen, o5 B 91eJ2ua8 pIp SJ91JaAUI 3Y31 3)Iym 1eyl punoy Apnis ayl
¢8 uapJeo Jejos Ajunwwo)
W 18 SpUSid pood WM pasodoid ay) 0] 9zis JejiwIs JO swiey Ad Je|os
urel] Aemqng dI0A MIN dpisu] 001 woJuj _uwum.hm:mm S| pUNos yanw moy lje pax00| Jojua)
s01 A813u3z uea|) suasnyoesse|n ayl Aq palonpuod Apnis
T — oLl 3 |D sBashy WaylAqp P pnmsy
:4yInJl ay3 Jo Moys
SIOAYT] punos soopul _Ew% |e} suosiedwod 3yl 49A3MOH "Pasned dAeY SaulgJnl puim
A
pUNOS S3NSS| 01 NP UMO|JJIA0 UIO e ISIOU SAISSIIXS JO Siea4

3SION - Je|OS JO SYSIY paJjowny



paniasay siybiy |y - 910z dnoio 1amod Apunwiwo) @

9 dNOYO ¥Y3IMOd
| Alunwwo)

\’

SspJiq 03 4o3uep asod

ued yaiym A11911109|9 91e49Ua8 03 924N0S |edIuad

e 01 1Yy31| 309|424 03 ‘sjoued Je|os J0u ‘sioldiw sasn
‘103loud pasodoud syl ji| Ad 1€|0S YIIm uaxelsiu
Ajuowwiod ‘(,,dS),,) 49MOd Je|0S Palesjuaduo)

SJOLJIW SN J0 3Y3i| 129|40.
1eay ajes2udd Jou op suapJied yejos Ajlunwwo)

S|eaiway?d ujw.ie) uowwod

Aq pa129)4e 10U B4 1BY] S924N0S POO) pue 1eligey
punou JeaA s31ea.d 3l 1eY] Ul S93q pue salj4a11nqg
‘spJiq 10} poo3d Aj|enyoe aJie suapies Ad Je|os
SpJiq 104 |ediyauaq sl ‘ds) 01 pasoddo

se ‘Ad J1e|os 1eyl 3uiisagsns ,spJig 104 pooo

S| JOMOd J4e|0S AYyMp,, 9214. J13Y] Ul Ad Je|oS

}0 uoddns uj 3no sawod sey Ala1d20S uognpny ayl

L]

:Ajjlenba
pa1B3Jd SI Je|OS ||B J0U UBAMOH °Sp4ig 03 snosasduep
SI Jejos ||e 1ey3 S uoj3daduodsiw uowwod v

spJig



dNOYD 43MOd a4
pansasay siybry |1y — 9I0Z dnoo samod Anunwwo) @ 6
Autnuiio? @

a1bue ybruns yum Auanoayel euajew [eoidAy jo sisAjeuy ¢ ainbi4 L@Hm\s t.o mC_u.Um_L.w.._
ow. o S T T 1Y3I1| 01 SS9 40 JBjIWIS 3]

$881050) WOHUNS (O djDUe JUADIDU|
o s e w e s o pjnom ,alie|3, Suluiewsal ayl

— —— (uonodnpoud
A3J4aua pue) uonndiosqe ysi|
9SeaJdul pue aJe|s yequiod
Y10g 03 s3uljeod aAl3d9)}a.
-13ue Ylm paJanod aJe
pue s|eli1ew paJjojod-diep
- asn sjaued ‘Ajjeuonippy
.|aued
A\d J1e|0s e JO uoildunj ayl 03 |esiuad S| ‘Uoilda|jad ueyl Jayiel
‘uondJiosqge 1y31|, 1eyi o uiod el pue Jejos, ‘Wodal ay|
:94e|3
1N0OQEe PauJadu0d 3SOY] 0] Jalja4 sapinosd ASiaug Jo Juswiieda(
9yl Aq pauoissiwwod 1odal y Jeay usyo am uollsanb e si alen

74

a
abejusoieg ADreu3 paayay

aJle|o



AT dNOYO 43IMOd =,
nm\:mmmzmEm.Et<1w8Nu:cGESe&b.EaEEouQ _r\_,.
B_c:EEoU \

*INOY1IM SEaJe pue swiiej Jejos YLM Seale 3yl Uusaamiag , anjea ul
92U2J3Ip 3|qeinseaw ou 031 9|11i],, Sem aJay3 1eyl pa1sadans s1uodau asay]

‘sa1149doud juadelpe uo sswoy
Ajlwe}-2|8uls yym seaue |eanyjndtide Ajuewiad ul a1am swaey Jejos 334yl ||V

L]

[

2
-
*

~A o,

%2 it euelpul ‘AJuno) uouely —
sane st —

11l 1ejos Apuj uoluiwo(
eueipu] ‘AJuno) uosipeiN —
SaNe €T —

wJed Jejos uopjuelq edw
sioul||] ‘Ayuno) ajjese] —
salle 09T —

wiied Jejos 93p1Yy puelo

:SwiJe} Jejos a3yl
punoJe saiiadoud jo spuall anjea Aluadouid 1e payoo| S21eid0SsyY
R slieg [ pJemp3] pue yo1uzay uyo) Ag palonpuod syioday

]

]

L ]

1oedw| anjeA |elluapisay



I dNOYO ¥43MOd N
paniasay siybiy 1y — 910z dnosn Jamod Apuniio) @
Auinwaios I

‘aseyd ,ui-3a13, a3yl sulinp Jomod Jo SSO| ou aq p|nom aiayl
6T0¢ dulids ul 1ue1s Aja|I| pjnom uoildnJisuo)
SjuapIsal

ay31 JO saxe) ay3 uo 1oedwi ou 3q ||IMm 3J3Y] "91IS uo pade|d
juawdinba ayj uo saxel Aluadoud Aed ||Im wJiej Jejos ay] - saxe|

Swial| JaYylQ pue saxe|



dNO¥YD 43IMOd
Auunwiwo)

paniasay swybry i1y — 910z dnosg samod Ajunwwo) @

‘.

L,Luawuopueqge,,
JO 9sed ay3 ul A3aJiaus

S} Ul w.ej Jejos e JO |[eAowdl
pue 3uluoISSIWWOoI9ap punj 0}
‘uoi1dNJlIsuod 03 Jond papinoid
‘A11und3s |eldueul) e g 03 aJay}
saJinbaJ asea| Jno ‘@sed Aue uj

waej Jejos aysy jo daaydn anunuod
031 Ad1dnJayueg-1sod wJe} Jejos ayl SUMO JIA30YM JO 1SaJalul
1S9q 9Y3] Ul 3q p|nhom 31 ‘1dnuyjueq Juam Auedwod e JI Usnj

w.ey Jejos ayj Jo uoilesado wod) suiynsal wajqold Aue yim
|eap 0] 1500 p|NOM 1 1eym puoAaq S| wJiej Jejos e Jo anjeA ay]

:pauopuedqe AjnJl JOASU dJe swiej Je|os

suluoIssiwwo29a(



To: Robert Barber, Village Administrator
Village of Beecher, lllinois

From: Pete losue, AICP, Senior Planner
Teska Associates, Inc.

Date: November 13, 2017

Re: Proposal for the Creation of a Tax Increment Financing District

Please accept the following proposal for services relating to the creation of a new Tax
Increment Financing (TIF) District for the Village of Beecher. The proposed district will
focus on the downtown area, as well as additional parcels located primarily west of Dixie
Highway (the final boundary will be determined based on eligibility). A number of targeted
parcels are currently not incorporated into the Village, and will need to be annexed prior to
approval of TIF district. A map of the initial project Study Area is included on the following

page.

The process for establishing a TIF district is established in the lliinois Tax Increment Allocation
Redevelopment Act (65 ILCS 5/Art. 11 Div. 74.4), and takes approximately 4-6 months to
complete. Teska will initially conduct a field study of the highlighted Study Area. Teska will then
prepare an eligibility report, detailing the eligibility of the proposed redevelopment area. If the
proposed redevelopment area is shown to qualify under the criteria of the Act, and the Village
wishes to proceed further, Teska will then prepare the required redevelopment plan and
coordinate the required meetings and public notices in order to approve the TIF plan.

The following proposal outlines the anticipated steps required for the establishment of a TIF
district, and the estimated cost to accomplish these tasks. Please do not hesitate to contact me
should you have any questions.

Peter losue, AICP, Senior Planner
Teska Associates, Inc.

teska associatesinc

24103 West Lockport Street, Unit 107, Plainfield, I 60544 office 815 436-9485 www.TeskaAssociates.com




Page |2

Proposed Beecher TIF Study Area

j SOUTH PABK AY

=
o
i

banrier 07
E 1
3 E
; ezmowr | | yeze )
E ACE 2
§ . =
cavsiaek || 1} :%,
i %
bacie (v
[I 2 5 '§ \
ik
== ._K.‘s epriAg DR
— u 4 4
s ER g@ ~
§ J
d
P
E
E T
E &
3
d | H
i Bl -
SAE p——————
) E
/ |
//1 H
Legend

astemonmy,

{._..i Beecher Village Boundary [ | Proposed TIF Study Area
—+—+ Railroads

teska associatesinc

24103 West Lockport Street, Unit 107, Plainfield, IL 60544 office 815 436-9485 www.TeskaAssociates.com



Page |3

SCOPE OF SERVICES

PROPOSED BEECHER TAX INCREMENT FINANCING DISTRICT

Phase 1: Initial Project Review and Eligibility Analysis

1.1 Kick-off Meeting.

TESKA will meet with Village staff to review and agree on an approach for the project.
Discussions will likely include the Study Area boundary, an overview of potential development
opportunities within the Study Area, known obstacles to development, and proposed project
approach and schedule.

Deliverables:
TESKA will attend one kick-off meeting with Village staff.

1.2 Eligibility Field Inventory.

TESKA will conduct an eligibility field survey of all parcels within the Study Area. The field survey
will document the existing land uses, site conditions, above ground public infrastructure
conditions, and the characteristics of any existing buildings in accordance with the eligibility
criteria contained in the Act. A selective photographic inventory of the properties covered in
the field survey of the Study Area will be prepared. In order to save on time and expense to the
Village, the field survey will likely be conducted on the same day as the kick-off meeting
outlined in phase 1.1, if possible.

Deliverables:
TESKA will conduct a field survey of all properties within the Study Area and surrounding areas.

1.3 Background Data Collection and Analysis.

TESKA will work with the appropriate Village Staff and Will County departments to obtain
supplemental information from official records related to the eligibility of the Study Area.
Supplemental information includes base maps with tax identifiers, age of structures, presence
of illegal uses, documented code violations, occupancy and vacancy status of structures,
infrastructure deficiencies, equalized assessed values and tax delinquencies. The information
obtained through the eligibility field survey and through the review of pertinent documents will
be tabulated and analyzed to ensure that the Study Area is eligible as a Redevelopment Project
Area in accordance with the Act.

Deliverables:
TESKA will review/analyze field data and supporting documentation.

teska associatesinc

24103 West Lockport Street, Unit 107, Plainfield, IL 60544 office 815 436-9485 www.TeskaAssociates.com




Page |4

1.4 Eligibility Findings Report.

A draft Eligibility Findings Report will be prepared for the Study Area which will outline the
eligibility status of the Study Area as a whole. The report will include maps to show the
proposed TIF boundary and will highlight all relevant eligibility criteria.

Deliverables:
TESKA will prepare draft Eligibility Report.

1.5 Eligibility Review Meeting.

TESKA will meet with the Village, either at a Village Board meeting or at a more informal staff
level meeting, to review the draft Eligibility Findings Report, and to discuss moving forward with
the Redevelopment Plan to create a new TIF district incorporating parcels highlighted in the
Eligibility Findings Report.

After reviewing the conclusions of the draft Eligibility Findings Report, the Village may
determine whether or not to proceed with Phase 2 — Preparation of Redevelopment Plan.

Deliverables:
TESKA will attend one meeting with Village staff to review the Eligibility Report.

Phase 2: Preparation of Redevelopment Plan

2.1 Plan Preparation.

TESKA will prepare a Redevelopment Plan for the Study Area that will include all required
elements as outlined in the Tax Increment Allocation Redevelopment Act (Chapter 65 ILCS
5/11-74.4-1, et seq.) of the lllinois Statutes as amended. Highlights of the amended
Redevelopment Plan elements include:

e Redevelopment Project Area boundary description, and corresponding maps;

e Redevelopment Plan and Program Goals & Objectives;

e Project Area existing and future land use plans, infrastructure, and public
improvements; and

e Project Budget based on projected incremental revenue from the Redevelopment
Project Area.

Deliverables:
TESKA will prepare draft Redevelopment Plan.

teska associatesinc

24103 West Lockport Street, Unit 107, Plainfield, IL 60544 office 815 436-9485 www.TeskaAssociates.com




Page |5

2.2 Identification of Public Notice of Meetings.

TESKA will work with Village staff (and Will County) to identify the property owners of record
and subsequent public notice list for all properties located within the TIF Redevelopment
Project Area and all properties within 750 feet of the TIF Redevelopment Project Area as
required per the Act. TESKA will prepare all required notices. The Village will execute all
required mailed and published public notification of the Joint Review Board, public hearing, and
other required notices as described in state statutes, and will keep complete records of these
notices.

Deliverables:
TESKA will research and prepare required public notice list(s).

2.3 Report Submittal and Meeting with Staff.

A draft TIF Redevelopment Plan will be prepared and submitted for review by the Village.
TESKA will attend one meeting to discuss the draft TIF Redevelopment Plan with Village staff
and any recommended changes to the draft plan.

Deliverables:
TESKA will submit draft Redevelopment Plan and attend one meeting with Village staff.

2.4 Revisions and Preparation of Final Plan.

TESKA will make one set of revisions to the draft Redevelopment Plan resulting from phase 2.3
(if necessary) and create a Final Draft. TESKA will submit a Final Draft of the Redevelopment
Plan to the Village to be used for during the TIF adoption process.

Deliverables:
TESKA will prepare Final Draft of the Redevelopment Plan.

Phase 3: Adoption

3.1 Confer with Village Attorney.

TESKA will confer with the Village Attorney and create a schedule/timeline for the adoption of
the proposed TIF district.

Deliverables:
TESKA will coordinate schedule/timeline for approval of the TIF.

teska associatesinc

24103 West Lockport Street, Unit 107, Plainfield, IL 60544 office 815 436-9485 www.TeskaAssociates.com




Page | 6

3.2 Joint Review Board Meeting.

The Village of Beecher will convene a Joint Review Board (JRB) as required by TIF statute for the
project area. (In advance of this task, TESKA will have prepared and will provide to the Village a
contact list of the affected taxing districts within the Study Area). TESKA will attend one
meeting of the JRB to present the findings of the Eligibility Study and the Redevelopment Plan
to the affected taxing districts.

Deliverables:
TESKA will prepare presentation and attend meeting of the Joint Review Board.

3.3 Public Hearing.

The Village of Beecher will provide public notice of the required public hearing. (In advance of
this task, TESKA will have prepared and will provide to the Village a taxpayer of record list for
each Property Identification Number (PIN) within the Study Area). TESKA will participate in one
formal public hearing as required by lllinois Revised Statutes to discuss the proposed
amendment to the TIF, summarize the discussion from the Joint Review Board meeting, and
respond to questions.

Deliverables:
TESKA will prepare presentation and attend public hearing to present the proposed TIF.

3.4 Revisions.

TESKA will perform revisions to the Redevelopment Plan as needed based on feedback from the
public hearing and public comment and Village Board (and staff) recommendations. TESKA will
submit to the Village a Final approved Redevelopment Plan and associated Eligibility Study in
print as well as electronic format.

Deliverables:
TESKA will prepare final approved Redevelopment Plan suitable for filing with Will County.

3.5 Filing of Required Documents.
TESKA will assist the Village in submitting all required forms and data to the Will County
Clerk/Recorder and the lllinois Department of Commerce and Economic Opportunity.

Deliverables:
TESKA will assist with filing of TIF documents.

teska associatesinc

24103 West Lockport Street, Unit 107, Plainfield, IL 60544 office 815 436-9485 www.TeskaAssociates.com




Page |7

COST ESTIMATE

PROPOSED VILLAGE OF BEECHER TAX INCREMENT FINANCING DISTRICT

The total estimated cost for preparation of the proposed Beecher TIF district is $18,000 -
$20,000, depending on the number of meetings required. This cost represents a 20% discount
from the typical $25,000 cost for preparation and adoption of a TIF plan. The low end of the
range is more likely, but a range is presented in case it is necessary to attend multiple Joint
Review Board or Village Board meetings in order to facilitate approval of the plan. (All costs
associated with preparation of the TIF plan are TIF eligible expenses and can be reimbursed by
the TIF).

Additional expenses will be incurred by the Village for mailing and publishing of notices and for
creation of a legal description (the Village Engineer can likely provide the legal description).

Notes:

* Additional meetings and/or services not outlined in this Scope of Services will be billed at an
hourly rate of 5120/hr.

** The Village is responsible for postage/publishing expenses for required notices.

*** The Village is responsible for providing a legal description of the final Redevelopment Area.

teska associatesinc

24103 West Lockport Street, Unit 107, Plainfield, IL 60544 office 815 436-9485 www.TeskaAssociates.com




VILLAGE OF BEECHER, WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS
ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING BUILDING REGULATIONS CODE
PROVISIONS OF THE VILLAGE OF BEECHER, AND REPEALING
ALL VILLAGE CODE SECTIONS AND ORDINANCES, OR PARTS
THEREOF, IN CONFLICT THEREWITH.

WHEREAS, the Corporate Authorities of the Village of Beecher, Will County, Illinois,
have been advised that most national building regulations have been updated; and

WHEREAS, the Corporate Authorities of this Village of Beecher, Will County, Illinois,
have reviewed current national building regulations and the current Village Code as it relates to
building requirements; and

WHEREAS, the Corporate Authorities of the Village of Beecher, Will County, Illinois,
now concur that is advisable, necessary, and in the best interests of the residents of the Village of
Beecher that Village Code Building Regulations be amended to update and adopt the current
building regulations.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE PRESIDENT AND BOARD
OF TRUSTEES OF THE VILLAGE OF BEECHER, WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS, AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION ONE: That Section 4-1-1, entitled “BUILDING CODES ADOPTED” of
Chapter 1, entitled “BUILDING CODE”, of Title 4, entitled “BUILDING REGULATIONS”, of
the Village Code of the Village of Beecher, be, and the same is hereby amended to read and
provide as follows, namely:

“4-1-1: BUILDING CODES ADOPTED:

Each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of the following codes
are hereby adopted for the Village of Beecher and made a part hereof, as if fully set forth herein,
with the amendments provided below each code:

(A)2015 International Building Code, with the following amendment:

1. Section 101.1 - delete “[NAME OF JURISDITION]” and replace with
“Village of Beecher”.

2. Section 101.1.4.3 — delete “International Plumbing Code” and replace with
“Illinois Plumbing Code (77 Illinois Administrative Code 890) published by
the Illinois Department of Health, as amended from time to time”.

3. Section 102.2 — add “The Village of Beecher Zoning Ordinance shall prevail
over any conflicts in this code pertaining to zoning regulations, signs,
performance standards, accessory uses, and other matters.”

4. Section 110 — add “There will be a 24 hour grace period between the passing
the final inspection and the issuance of the certificate of occupancy. The
contractor shall schedule the final inspection with a minimum 24 hour notice.”

5. Section 113.1- delete entire section and replace with “The Planning and

1



10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

Zoning Commission of the Village of Beecher shall hear and decide appeals
of orders, decisions or determinations made by the building official relative to
the application and interpretation of this code.”

Section 113. 3 — delete entire section.

Section 301.2 — add “The Village of Beecher Zoning Ordinance shall prevail
over any conflicts in this code pertaining to zoning regulations, signs,
performance standards, accessory uses, and other matters.”

Section 406.3.4.1 - delete entire section and replace with “Private garages,
located beneath rooms in residential buildings shall have walls, partitions,
floors, ceilings, and structural steel members separating the garage space
from the adjacent interior spaces constructed to a minimum one-hour fire
resistance rating. All bearing and non-bearing walls under the garage shall
have a one-hour fire rating. The sills of all door openings between the
garage and adjacent interior spaces shall be raised not less than four (4)
inches above the garage floor.”

Section 903.2.8 — amend Group R to provide “An automatic sprinkler
system shall be provided through all building with a Group R fire area
except Group R-3 occupancies constructed in accordance with 2015
International Residential Code.”

Chapter 11 — delete entire chapter and replace with “The Illinois
Accessibility Code, as amended from time to time.”

Section 1805.1.1 — add “All footings and walls to be poured in place concrete.
Alternative methods may be approved by the Building Official.”

Section 1805.4.2 — add to the end of the section “All foundation drains shall
incorporate the use of a minimum four inch (4”) perforated tile.”

Section 2111.14 add new section “Factory Manufactured fireplaces: Hearth
extensions for approved factory manufactured fireplaces shall extend not less
than sixteen inches in front and at least eight inches beyond each side of the
fireplace opening.”

Chapter 26 and 27 — add new section “All components, such as boxes,
conduit, wire ways, luminaries, ductwork, equipment, ceiling grid or other
items, shall not be supported from the roof deck or the bottom cord of the bar
joist, unless the licensed design professional of record specifically designed
the structure to support he load of the additional components and it is
specifically noted on the applicable building plan sheets.”

(B) 2015 International Residential Code, with the following amendments:

1.

2.
3.

Section R101.1 - delete “[NAME OF JURISDITION]” and replace with
“Village of Beecher”.
Section R105.2 — delete entire section.
Table R301.2(1) The following information shall be inserted into the
table:
i. Ground Snow Load — 25
ii. Wind Speed — 115
iii. Seismic Design Category — B
iv. Weathering — severe
v. Frost Depth — 42~



NS

vi. Termite — moderate to heavy
vii. Decay — slight to moderate
viii. Winter Design Temp - -10

ix. Ice shield-underlayment — required

x. Air freezing index — 1700

xi. Mean Annual Temp - 50
Section R309 — add “Garage Gas Curbs-A four (4) inch minimum height
gas curb shall be provided at each wall common with the attached garage
and residence. A foundation wall may be utilized as a gas curb only if
four (4) inches of foundation exposed above the garage floor slab at each
common wall.”
R309.5 — delete entire section.
R313 - delete entire section.
Section R401.1 - delete entire section and replace with “The provisions of
this chapter shall control the design and construction of the foundation and
foundation spaces for buildings. In addition to the provisions of this
chapter, the design and construction of foundations in flood hazard areas
as established by Table R301.2(1) shall meet the provisions of Section
R322. All columns supported by concrete to be structural steel or
approved material by the building official.”
Section E3602.2 — add to the end of section “Every single-family unit
exceeding twelve hundred (1,200) square feet erected subsequent to the date
of the adoption of this code shall utilize a minimum two hundred-ampere
service. Every single-family unit exceeding four thousand (4,000) square feet
erected subsequent to the date of the adoption of this code shall utilize a
minimum four hundred-ampere service. If two (2) separate 200 ampere panels
are utilized to form a 400 ampere service, a separate sized grounding electrode
conductor is required from each panel to the street side of the incoming metal
water service. A jumper conductor between each panel forming a single
grounding electrode conductor is prohibited. The downsizing of the service
entrance neutral conductor is prohibited.”

(C) 2015 International Mechanical Code, with the following amendments:

1.

N

SNk w

Section 101.1 - delete “[NAME OF JURISDITION]” and replace with
“Village of Beecher”.

Section 106.5.2 — delete entire section and replace with “See Village of
Beecher Fee schedule.”

Section 108.4 — delete entire section.

Section 603.5 - delete provisions referencing Fibrous Duct Construction.
Section 603.5.1 - delete entire section.

Section 603.6.1.1 -delete entire section and replace with “Flexible air ducts
shall be limited to six feet (6') in length.”

Section 603.6.2.1 — delete entire section and replace with “Flexible air
connectors shall be limited in length to six feet (6').”



(D)2015 International Fire Code, with the following amendment:
1. Section 101.1 - delete “[NAME OF JURISDITION]” and replace with
“Village of Beecher”.

(E) 2015 Life Safety Code , with the following amendment:
1. Section 24.3.5 - delete entire section. (which is a reference to new one- and
two-family dwellings shall be protected throughout by an approved automatic
sprinkler system)

(F) The Illinois Accessibility Code, as amended.

(G)2015 International Fuel Gas Code, with the following amendments:
1. Section 101.1 - delete “[NAME OF JURISDITION]” and replace with
“Village of Beecher”.
2. Section 106.6 — delete entire section and replace with “See Village of Beecher
Fee schedule.”
3. Section 108.4 - delete entire section.

(H)2015 International Energy Conservation Code as adopted with the State of Illinois
amendments, with the following amendment:
1. Section 101.1 - delete “[NAME OF JURISDITION]” and replace with
“Village of Beecher”.

Notwithstanding anything contained in the codes adopted in this Chapter 4, the Village of
Beecher is the jurisdictional authority for all such adopted codes. A copy of all such codes
adopted herein shall be on file with the Village Clerk.”

SECTION TWQ: That Section 4-2-1, entitled “ADOPTION OF PLUMBING CODE”
of Chapter 2, entitled “PLUMBING CODE”, of Title 4, entitled “BUILDING
REGULATIONS”, of the Village Code of the Village of Beecher, be, and the same is hereby
amended to read and provide as follows, namely:

“4-2-1: ADOPTION OF PLUMBING CODE:

“The Illinois Plumbing Code, as amended from time to time by the State of Illinois is adopted as
the plumbing code of the Village of Beecher with a copy of the same being on file with the
Village Clerk. Each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said
plumbing code are hereby adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set forth herein.”

SECTION THREE: That Section 4-3-1, entitled “ADOPTION OF ELECTRICAL
CODE” of Chapter 2, entitled “ELECTRICAL CODE”, of Title 4, entitled “BUILDING
REGULATIONS”, of the Village Code of the Village of Beecher, be, and the same is hereby
amended to read and provide as follows, namely:

“4-3-1: ADOPTION OF ELECTRICAL CODE:

“The 2014 National Electrical Code (NEC) and 2015 ICC Electric Code are hereby adopted as
electrical code of the Village of Beecher with a copy of the same being on file with the Village
Clerk. Each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said

4



electrical codes are hereby adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set forth herein, with the
additions, insertions, deletions and changes for the 2015 National Electrical Code prescribed in
section 4-3-2 of this chapter.”

SECTION FOUR: That Section 4-3-2, entitled “STANDARD WIRING” of Chapter 3,
entitled “ELECTRICAL CODE”, of Title 4, entitled “BUILDING REGULATIONS”, of the
Village Code of the Village of Beecher, be, and the same is hereby amended to read and provide
as follows, namely:

“4-3-2: ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS AND CHANGES
The following sections of the 2014 National Electrical Code are hereby amended:

(A) Any reference in this code to the “Authority Having Jurisdiction (AHJ)” shall
mean the Village of Beecher.

(B) Section 210.8(A)(5) Add to this section the following: “Ground fault Circuit
Interrupter Protection will not be required for ejector pumps, sump pumps and
furnaces.”

(C) Section 210.8(A)(6) Add to this section the following: “Ground fault Circuit
Interrupter Protection will not be required for refrigerators. Refrigerators must
be on separate circuit.”

(D)Section 310.106(B) - delete entire section and replace with:

All Conductors in this article shall be of copper only. Aluminum conductors are
prohibited.

(E) Section 406.12(A) — delete entire subsection

(F) Notwithstanding anything contained in this code to the contrary, all new electric
services in the village shall be underground, where available, unless otherwise
approved by the village.

(G)Notwithstanding anything contained in this code to the contrary, an approved
nonferrous metal tag shall be attached to the ground electrode clamp giving
warning against its removal.

(H)Notwithstanding anything contained in this code to the contrary, Nonmetallic-
sheathedcable (Romex) shall not be permitted in the Village.”

SECTION FIVE: That Section 4-4-1, entitled “ADOPTION OF PROPERTY
MAINTENANCE CODE” of Chapter 4, entitled “PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE”, of
Title 4, entitled “BUILDING REGULATIONS”, of the Village Code of the Village of Beecher,
be, and the same is hereby amended to read and provide as follows, namely:

4-4-1: ADOPTION OF PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE:

“The 2015 International Property Code is hereby adopted as maintenance code of the Village of
Beecher with a copy of the same being on file with the Village Clerk. Each and all of the
regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said international property
maintenance code are hereby adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set forth herein, with the
additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in section 4-4-2 of this chapter.”

SECTION SIX: That Section 4-4-2, entitled “ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS AND
CHANGES?” of Chapter 4, entitled “PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE”, of Title 4, entitled

5




“BUILDING REGULATIONS”, of the Village Code of the Village of Beecher, be, and the same
is hereby amended to read and provide as follows, namely:

4-4-2: ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS AND CHANGES
“The following sections of the 2015 International Property Maintenance Code are hereby
amended:

(A)Section 101.1 - delete “[NAME OF JURISDITION]” and replace with “Village of
Beecher”.”

(B) Section 111.1 — delete “board of appeals” and replace with “The Planning and Zoning
Commission of the Village of Beecher”.

(C) Section 112.4 —delete section and replace with “Any person who shall continue any work
after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed
to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than
$250.00 and not more than $750.00 per violation.”

(D) Section 302.10 is added to read as follows:

“Section 302.10 Landscaping.
1. Duty to Prune. Trees, bushes and other shrubbery on private property
adjacent to a street right-of-way shall be pruned in such a manner that it
will not obstruct or shade the streetlights, obstruct the passage of
pedestrians or vehicles on the street, obstruct ability to see traffic signs,
obstruct the view of any intersection or create a public safety hazard.
2. Turf Maintenance. Areas where grass has been established shall be
maintained without bare areas or soil or ruts caused by pedestrian or
vehicle use.”

(E) Section 302.11 is added to read as follows:

“Section 302.11. Trees on Commercial Properties. Trees on commercial
properties are the responsibility of the property owner and shall be maintained
in a healthy condition. Trees on commercial properties are subject to all zoning
regulations and any applicable development agreements with the Village of
Beecher.”

(F) Section 302.4 - Insert “8”

(G) Section 304.14, 602.3, and 602.4 - Insert dates “May 1” to “October1.”

(H)Chapter 5 - Delete the “International Plumbing Code” and insert the “Illinois

9 99

Plumbing Code™.

SECTION SEVEN: That Section 4-5-3, entitled “PUBLIC SWIMMING POOL
CONTROL” of Chapter 3, entitled “SWIMMING POOLS”, of Title 4, entitled “BUILDING
REGULATIONS?”, of the Village Code of the Village of Beecher, be, and the same is hereby
amended to read and provide as follows, namely:

“4-5-3: ADOPTION OF SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE

The 2015 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is hereby adopted the Village of Beecher
with a copy of the same being on file with the Village Clerk. Every swimming pool hereinafter
constructed, installed, altered, maintained, removed or demolished in the village shall comply

with the provisions of this chapter. The International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is amended
as following: Section 101.1 - delete “[NAME OF JURISDITION]” and replace with “Village of

6



9% 9%

Beecher”.

SECTION EIGHT: The following sections of the Village Code of the Village of
Beecher, be, and the same are hereby deleted in their entirety as follows:

4-1-3 entitled “FRAMING REQUIREMENTS”

4-1-9 entitled “FRAMING IN INDUSTRIAL ZONED AREAS AND PARCELS
HAVING A SPECIAL USE PERMIT FOR PUBLIC UTILITES”

4-1-12 entitled “ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS AND CHANGES”

4-1-13 entitled “ADDITIONAL BUILDING REQUIREMENTS FOR DETACHED
STRUCTURES OVER ONE HUNDRED FORTY FOUR SQUARE FEET”

4-3-3 entitled “ELECTRICAL SERVICE”
SECTION NINE: That all existing Ordinances and Village Code provisions, or parts

thereof, in conflict with the provisions of this Ordinance, are hereby deemed null, void, and of no
legal effect, and are specifically repealed.

SECTION TEN: If any section, clause, provision or portion of this Ordinance shall be
held to be invalid or unconstitutional by any Court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall
not affect any other section, clause, provision or portion of this Ordinance, and this Village Board
hereby expressly acknowledges that it would have enacted this Ordinance even with the invalid
portion deleted.

SECTION ELEVEN: That this Ordinance shall be in effect as of July 1, 2018, after its
passage by the Village Board, its approval by the President, its publication as required by law,
and its submission to the Illinois Capital Development Board as required by law.

PASSED and APPROVED this __ day of May, 2018.

Yeas:

Nays:

Abstain:

Present:

Greg Szymanski, Village President
ATTEST:

Janett Conner, Village Clerk



