MEMORANDUM

TO: Village President and Board of Trustees

FROM: Robert O. Barber, Village Administrator

DATE: Friday, January 6, 2023

RE: VILLAGE ADMINISTRATOR MATERIALS FOR VILLAGE BOARD MEETING

BOARD MEETING DATE: Monday, January 9", 2023 at 7:00 p.m.

A G END A

L PLEDGE TO THE FLAG
II. ROLL CALL
IIl. APPROVAL OF MINUTES
IV. RECOGNITION OF AUDIENCE
V. VILLAGE CLERK REPORT
VI. REPORTS OF VILLAGE COMMISSIONS
1. BEAUTIFICATION COMMISSION - Matt Conner
2. FOURTH OF JULY COMMISSION - Todd Kraus
a. CONSIDER A MOTION AUTHORIZING THE WAIVING OF
A FORMAL BID PROCESS FOR THE PURCHASE OF A RAFFLE CAR
AS LONG AS SEALED PROPOSALS ARE SOUGHT FROM

DIFFERENT DEALERS AND OPENED AT THE SAME TIME. This
will allow the Fourth of July Commission car raffle committee to pick



which type of vehicle they wish to raffle off for 2023 and is the same
process used last year. This process is required because it is so difficult to
obtain a bid on a specific make and model at one time due to inventory
issues. This hybrid process actually produces more bids. Bid results will
then be provided to the Commission for a recommendation by electronic
mail or at a meeting and then will be sent to the Village Board agenda
sometime in March. The vehicle will then be delivered for the raffle
process to begin. Bids are going to be sought at or below $30,000 which is
the budget amount for the car. Dealers can also submit more than one bid
allowing for more bids to be obtained. New and used inventory will also
be considered, but new is preferred.

3. YOUTH COMMISSION - Ben Juzeyszyn

4. HISTORIC PRESERVATION COMMISSION - Jonathan Kypuros

VII. VILLAGE PRESIDENT REPORT

1. CONSIDER REFERRAL OF INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT WITH THE FIRE
DISTRICT FOR INSPECTIONS AND PLAN REVIEWS TO THE PUBLIC SAFETY
COMMITTEE FOR REVIEW AND DISCUSSION WITH THE DISTRICT. The agreement is
enclosed. The Village President will explain this referral in her report.

Vill. COMMITTEE REPORTS

A. FINANCE AND ADMINISTRATION COMMITTEE - Jonathan Kypuros Chair, Ben
Juzeszyn

1. CONSIDER A MOTION APPROVING THE TREASURER’S REPORT
2. VARIANCE REPORTS for the previous month are enclosed for your review.

3. CONSIDER A MOTION APPROVING THE BILLS AND PAYROLL FOR THE
PREVIOUS MONTH

4. CONSIDER AN ORDINANCE PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF GENERAL
OBLIGATION BONDS, SERIES 2023, OF THE VILLAGE FOR THE PURPOSE OF
BUILDING AND EQUIPPING A PUBLIC SAFETY FACILITY FOR THE BEECHER POLICE
DEPARTMENT AND THE PAYMENT OF THE EXPENSES INCIDENT THERETO,
PROVIDING FOR THE LEVY AND COLLECTION OF A DIRECT ANNUAL TAX
SUFFICIENT FOR THE PAYMENT OF THE PRINCIPAL AND INTEREST OF SAID
BONDS, AND AUTHORIZING THE SALE OF SAID BONDS TO THE PURCHASER
THEREOF. The ordinance will be presented at the meeting by the placement agent and the entire



bond process will be explained at that time.

5. COMMITTEE TO HOLD A WORKSHOP ON THE FIVE YEAR PLAN AND THE
REQUEST TO REVIEW SATURDAY OR EXTENDED OFFICE HOURS AT THE VILLAGE
HALL immediately following the regular Board meeting. All are invited to stay and participate.

6. PERSONNEL MANUAL HAS BEEN REVIEWED BY LABOR COUNSEL and a second
draft will be presented to the Committee for review very soon.

7. BUDGET PROCESS SET TO BEGIN. We would like to follow the same process we have
used in the past which will begin with the a Finance Committee budget workshop on Saturday,
February 25" beginning at 7am here at the Village Hall. All are invited to attend this workshop.

8. CONSIDER A MOTION TO HOLD A PUBLIC HEARING ON THE PROPOSED BUDGET
FOR 7PM ON MONDAY, APRIL 24™,

9. CONSIDER RELOCATION AND NEW TIME FOR VILLAGE BOARD MEETING ON
MONDAY, MARCH 27™ TO BE AT THE PUBLIC WORKS GARAGE, 30200 CARDINAL
CREEK BLVD, AT 6:00 P.M. Only items which need to be voted upon will be handled at this
special meeting followed by work on the budget.

B. PUBLIC BUILDINGS AND PROPERTIES, PARKS AND RECREATION COMMITTEE
- Joe Gianotti Chair, Todd Kraus

1. CONSIDER A MOTION APPROVING THE PURCHASE OF LIGHT FIXTURES AND
POLES FOR THE PATH IN FIREMEN’S PARK USING ARPA FUNDS IN THE AMOUNT OF
$27,322.00 FROM LIGHTMART. Please see the enclosed proposals for the purchase of these
items.

2. CONSIDER A MOTION AUTHORIZING THE PURCHASE OF THREE PICNIC TABLES,
EIGHT PARK BENCHES AND TWO GARBAGE RECEPTACLES FOR FIREMEN’S PARK
FROM KIRBYBUILT IN THE AMOUNT OF §8,781.95. Please see the enclosed proposal for
the purchase of these items.

3. PEDESTRIAN BRIDGE REPLACEMENT UPDATE. The Supt. met with the Chair and
they believe the best course of action for this bridge is to replace the steel plates with TREX
decking and aluminum side rails mounted to the beams. This can be done within the budget
provided.

4. PUBLIC SAFETY FACILITY UPDATE. The architect and the engineer met on December
21% to gameplan the design of the building with a May or June completion date. The decision will
be made then by all of us as to when to go to bid on the project and several factors weigh into that
decision. The architect then met with the Chief and several officers to fine tune the floor plan and
a new draft of that plan will be provided to the Board once we receive it. Much attention was
placed on how to properly design a facility to safely process and bond out an arrestee.



5. PROJECT PICKLE UPDATE. The Supt. met with HCA Sports Flooring and they
recommended a new coat of asphalt be put on before they apply their product. The Administrator
and School Supt. met and verbally agreed to the contents of an IGA (outline enclosed) and the
Village Attorney is drafting it for adoption by both parties later this month.

C. PLANNING, BUILDING AND ZONING COMMITTEE - Roger Stacey Chair, Joe Tieri
1. BUILDING DEPARTMENT MONTHLY REPORT for December is enclosed for your
review.

D. PUBLIC SAFETY COMMITTEE - Joe Tieri Chair, Jonathan Kypuros

1. POLICE DEPARTMENT MONTHLY REPORT is enclosed for your review.

2. EM.A. MONTHLY REPORT is enclosed for your review.

3. CODE ENFORCEMENT MONTHLY REPORT is enclosed for your review.

4. RESULTS OF “HOLIDAY WITH HEROES” PROJECT

5. RESULTS OF NEW SNOW PARKING ORDINANCE ENFORCEMENT

6. STATUS OF PART-TIME OFFICERS

7. CONSIDER A MOTION AUTHORIZING THE PURCHASE OF A 2021 FORD
EXPLORER HAVING 22,754 MILES AND A 150,000 MILE WARRANTY FROM D’ORAZIO
FORD OF WILMINGTON, IL. We were researching the price of a used car for the proposed
budget to replace the Chief’s current vehicle (a 2011 Chevy Traverse) when we were offered the
vehicle shown in the enclosed packet by this Ford Dealer for $25,000. It is not a police package
but we do not need the larger engine for the Chief’s car. This 4WD SUV should last for about 6-8
years in the role of chief’s car and solves our problem in this tight vehicle market. We would use
funds remaining in the Police CESFA for this purchase and re-align our annual payments back into
the fund moving forward. The 2011 Traverse will be sold by silent bid and those funds placed
back into the CESFA. We were looking at spending around $40,000 later this year for about the
same vehicle we have here. We will be running a CARFAX report on this VIN and will have it
for the meeting.

E. PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE — Todd Kraus Chair, Roger Stacey

1. PUBLIC WORKS MONTHLY REPORT is enclosed for your review.

2. WATER DEPARTMENT MONTHLY REPORT is enclosed for your review.



3. SEWER DEPARTMENT MONTHLY REPORT is enclosed for your review.

4. WATER BILLING REGISTER for the months of November and December is enclosed for
your review. We are happy to report that our billed to pump ratio was over 75% during this
period compared to 70% for the same period last year and the 10 year average of 64%.

5. CONSIDER PAYMENT IN THE AMOUNT OF $27,844.96 TO BRANDT EXCAVATING
AS FINAL PAYMENT ON THE LEAD LINE REMOVAL PROGRAM SUBJECT TO
RECEIPT OF FUNDS BY THE IEPA LOAN PROGRAM. The invoice and recommendation for
payment is enclosed.

6. COUNTY ADVISES VILLAGE THAT INDIANA AVENUE WILL BE RESURFACED
FROM DIXIE TO ROUTE #50 IN 2023. Please see the enclosed letter. The village may be on
the hook for some ADA requirement as part of this project and the Supt. will explain this.

7. CMAP RELEASES A REPORT ON THE BEECHER URBAN FOREST. CMAP released a
report of each municipality in the Chicago area and Beecher’s chapter is enclosed. Using infrared
imaging CMAP has been able to identify the correlation between surface temperature and tree
canopy. Our situation has gotten worse due to the loss of many trees due the emerald ash borer.

This data is being used to secure federal grant funding for urban re-forestation which may be
forthcoming.

F. ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT AND COMMUNITY RELATIONS COMMITTEE
- Ben Juzeszyn Chair, Joe Gianotti

No report

G. OLD BUSINESS

H. NEW BUSINESS

1. ADJOURN INTO EXECUTIVE SESSION (if necessary)

J. ADJOURNMENT



MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING OF THE PRESIDENT
& BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE VILLAGE OF BEECHER
HELD AT THE BEECHER VILLAGE HALL,

625 DIXIE HIGHWAY, BEECHER, ILLINOIS
DECEMBER 12, 2022 -- 7:00 P.M.

All present joined in the Pledge to the Flag.
President Meyer called the meeting to order.

ROLL CALL
PRESENT: President Meyer and Trustees Kypuros, Juzeszyn, Gianotti, Tieri, Stacey and Kraus.
ABSENT: None.

STAFF PRESENT: Clerk Janett McCawley, Administrator Robert Barber, Public Works
Superintendent Matt Conner, Treasurer Donna Rooney, Chief Terry Lemming and EMA Director
Bob Heim. Officer Jeff Young and other Beecher Police officers were present at the beginning of
the meeting to attend Officer Young’s certificate presentation.

GUESTS: Jennifer Young, Frank Cochrane, Sr., Frank Cochrane, Jr., Erik Gardner and George
Schuitema.

President Meyer asked for consideration of the minutes of the November 28, 2022 Board meeting.
Trustee Tieri made a motion to approve the minutes as written. Trustee Gianotti seconded.
AYES: (5) Trustees Kypuros, Juzeszyn, Gianotti, Tieri and Kraus.

NAYS: (0) None.

ABSTAIN: (1) Trustee Stacey.

Motion carried.

RECOGNITION OF AUDIENCE

Chief Lemming honored part-time police officer Jeff Young for 30 years of service to the Village
of Beecher with a certificate and thanked him for his long service.

Frank Cochrane, Sr. and Frank Cochrane, Jr. explained that they are opening a business in town
and running into some differences of opinion as to what the Fire Inspector is requiring. They
purchased 516 Hodges Street and are going to use the building for computer equipment for crypto
currency mining. They only will be using 5% of the building at this point and will not be open to
the public. They showed the Board the type of equipment they will be putting in the building. They
upgraded to 800 amp electric service on 3-phase electric to plan for future expansion of the
business and haven’t done any other work inside the building. Frank Cochrane, Jr. explained how
the equipment will work. They only plan to have 5-10 machines to start which would only require
150 amps. They met with Fire Inspector in June and he told them he wouldn’t need to do much to
comply with the Fire District but the inspector has changed what he is requiring over the last few

Village of Beecher -- Minutes of 12-12-22 Board Meeting



months. They always planned to put in a fire alarm. The inspector is classifying the business as a
data center, but they said that is not the intent of this business. It was unknown how many
computers there needs to be to designate it as a data center and the Fire Inspector has not provided
documentation on how to answer that question. There have been many discussions between the
business owner and Fire Inspector and they claim the inspector is asking for things to be done he
has not proved is in the code and keeps changing the requirements. Also, some of the requirements
he is asking for would exceed the value of what they paid for the property.

President Meyer attended a meeting between the business owners and the Fire District the previous
week to learn about the problem. She is concerned with changing requirements from the Fire
District and asked for input from the Board. Trustee Kypuros questioned if this business needs to
be licensed. In June the Fire Inspector only requested a fire alarm and is now requesting a two-
hour fire wall and fire suppression system. The Intergovernmental Agreement (IGA) was for the
2015 fire code but a later edition was being requested by the Fire Inspector. President Meyer felt
the Village may need to go back to the IGA and clean up some things. Trustee Kypuros requested
that termination of the Intergovernmental Agreement be placed on the Board agenda for the first
meeting in January. Another meeting will be held with the Fire Chief and Fire Inspector on
Wednesday to discuss this further. Interpretation of what qualifies as a data center is main issue.
The Village will be in touch with the owners about this issue.

CLERK’S REPORT

1) A report was provided of income received in November, 2022. 2) Clerk McCawley reported
that dog tags are now on sale for $10 each and can be purchased in person at the Village Hall or
on-line through the EPay system. The deadline is March 15, 2023.

REPORTS OF VILLAGE COMMISSIONS

There was no report for Beautification Commission.

Trustee Gianotti provided a list of the planned improvements to be made in Firemen’s Park by the
4™ of July Commission in the coming year.

Trustee Kraus made a motion approving a three-year contract for a fireworks display with
Pyrotecnico in the amounts of $35,000 in 2023 and 2024, and $38,500 in 2025. The Commission
voted unanimously to recommend approval of the contract. A copy of the contract was provided
in the packet for review. Trustee Tieri seconded the motion.

AYES: (6) Trustees Kypuros, Juzeszyn, Gianotti, Tieri, Stacey and Kraus.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion carried.

Trustee Juzeszyn provided a Youth Commission report. BYC provided candy donations and
volunteer labor for the Lions Club Breakfast with Santa. Their next meeting is December 20",

Clerk McCawley reported that the next meeting of the Historic Preservation Commission will be
held on Wednesday, January 18",

Village of Beecher -- Minutes of 12-12-22 Board Meeting



VILLAGE PRESIDENT REPORT

President Meyer met with the County and Eastern Will County mayors to discuss east-west truck
traffic movements through the County. A map of proposed east-west truck routes from the County
was provided for review but it was learned at the meeting that Crete-Monee Road was selected as
the preferred route by the County and that an environmental study may soon begin. There were
many concerns regarding this proposed route including how trucks will move through Monee and
how they will get over to IL-394. There was also much discussion about traffic issues along the
state line.

President Meyer reminded the Board that there we be no meeting on December 26" and that the
next regular Village Board meeting will be on Monday, January 9.

President Meyer announced the resignations of Hebah Arroyo from the Youth Commission, and
Nelson Collins, Barb Hodgett, Margie Cook and Debbie Falaschetti from the 4th of July
Commission. The Village is accepting applications for anyone interested in becoming part of either
commission.

President Meyer appointed Todd Kraus and Tom Johnson as the at-large representatives to the
newly-created Police Commission. Their terms would run until April 30, 2023. Trustee Kypuros
made a motion to approve President Meyer’s appointments. Trustee Tieri seconded the motion.
AYES: (6) Trustees Kypuros, Juzeszyn, Gianotti, Tieri, Stacey and Kraus.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion carried.

A. FINANCE AND ADMINISTRATION COMMITTEE

Trustee Kypuros made a motion to approve the Treasurer’s report of financial activity in the prior
month. Treasurer Rooney was present and provided a report. Trustee Juzeszyn seconded.

AYES: (6) Trustees Kypuros, Juzeszyn, Gianotti, Tieri, Stacey and Kraus.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion carried.

Variance reports for the previous month were included in the packet for review.

Trustee Kypuros read aloud bills added to the list since Friday. Trustee Kypuros made a motion to
approve payment of the list of bills in the amount of $509,883.87 and payrolls for the previous
month. Trustee Juzeszyn seconded the motion.

AYES: (6) Trustees Kypuros, Juzeszyn, Gianotti, Tieri, Stacey and Kraus.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion carried.

The five-year financial plan first draft is complete and will be presented to the Committee for
review and amendment before going to the full Board on January 9™.

Village of Beecher -- Minutes of 12-12-22 Board Meeting



A bond sale update was provided. First Midstate is presenting our bond offering to approximately
300 potential bond purchases in hopes that a private placement can be recommended to the Village
Board. We should be able to get a rate below 5.9%. The bond will most likely be sold at the
January 9™ meeting by adopting an ordinance accepting the private placement recommendation.
Bond Counsel will be present at that meeting to walk through the process of adopting the necessary
ordinances. By the end of January the funds will be placed in escrow and ready for use on the
project. The two local banks will be offered bond placement.

B. PUBLIC BUILDINGS AND PROPERTIES, PARKS AND RECREATION
COMMITTEE

A public safety facility update was provided by Trustee Gianotti. A coordination meeting between
the architect and engineer will occur before the first of the year. Survey work won’t be done until
after the first of the year. Meeting will be held on December 21* to go over floorplan layout.

Trustee Gianotti provided a “project pickle” (pickle ball courts) update. Trustee Kraus reported
that the school had a facilities meeting and School Board liked the project and plans to approve it.
The location is at the existing tennis courts at the high school. An IGA with the school needs to be
drafted for the project. Administrator Barber recommended to talk to company who puts these
courts together to determine how long the court should last and determine on-going maintenance
costs since Village plans to perpetually maintain the courts.

A park improvement plan update was provided. Trustee Gianotti and Superintendent Conner
marked out light poles in Firemen’s Park, and are awaiting prices. Moving backstops in Welton
Stedt Park to Firemen’s Park was discussed. The Superintendent will have a company provide a
proposal for moving the backstops. A meeting will also be set up regarding playground equipment.

There was nothing new to report on a HVAC grant for the food stand.

C. PLANNING, BUILDING AND ZONING COMMITTEE

The Building Department monthly report was provided in the packet for review.

D. PUBLIC SAFETY COMMITTEE

The Police Department, EMA and Code Enforcement monthly reports were provided in the packet
for review.

Chief Lemming reported that the new squad car came in today and graphics have been put on.
Equipment will be installed this week. Old squad will be given to EMA.

The new snow season parking ban is now in effect. No parking is allowed for 24 hours after a
snowfall of 2 or more. Chief Lemming said warnings will be issued the first time, and tickets the
second time. It was discussed to have Code Enforcement provide a list of license plates given
warnings the first time to be referenced the second snowfall, so residents who never received
warnings aren’t issued tickets.

Village of Beecher -- Minutes of 12-12-22 Board Meeting

4-



EMA Director Heim provided an update on the Holiday with Heroes program. He contacted 12
families through the school and eight families responded, 21 children. Over $1,700 was made at
the Dunkin’ fundraiser. Letters were also sent out to businesses that are still sending in donations.
Volunteers are out shopping for the families. Families are to be given gifts this Saturday at the Fire
Station.

It was reported that Santa will be riding the streets of town on Christmas Eve in a fire engine.

Trustee Tieri requested an Executive Session be held at the end of the meeting to discuss the
resignation of a part-time Police officer.

E. PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE

The Public Works, Water Department and Sewer Department monthly reports were provided in
the packet for review.

Trustee Kraus made a motion to approve a payment in the amount of $201,956.88 to Brandt
Excavating as partial payment on the lead service line replacement program contingent on receipt
of IEPA funds. Trustee Kypuros seconded.

AYES: (6) Trustees Kypuros, Juzeszyn, Gianotti, Tieri, Stacey and Kraus.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion carried.

The Village leaf collection program has ended for the year. The Public Works Department has
received a donation of a leaf machine from the Village of Thornton. The machine needs work and
will act as a backup machine.

A Penfield Street STP update was provided. The Will County Governmental League
Transportation Committee approved an additional $570,542 in federal funds for the Penfield Street
project which reduced our local match from $1,757,622 to $1,187,080.

F. ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT AND COMMUNITY RELATIONS COMMITTEE

Trustee Juzeszyn provided a report on the Will County Center for Economic Development meeting
he attended. A 2022 Annual Report book was provided to the Board members for review. Trustee
Juzeszyn thanked Administrator Barber for driving to the meeting.

G. OLD BUSINESS

Trustee Kraus asked about extending Village Hall hours as he previously asked. This was referred
to committee. Staff will provide the committee a recommendation for discussion.

Clerk McCawley thanked Public Works for replacing the stairs at the caboose by the Depot.

Village of Beecher -- Minutes of 12-12-22 Board Meeting



I. NEW BUSINESS

Chief Lemming thanked Public Works for quickly installing “slow, children playing” signs with
the spinner on top, in response to a speeding complaint discussed at previous meeting.

Superintendent Conner noted that a fire hydrant repair needed to be done when an unmarked
ComkEd line was hit. He is working on resolving this with ComEd, who is claiming lights are not
theirs.

President Meyer commented on Juan Hernandez’s purchase of the building south of the Amvets
Hall. He is opening a karate studio and community center. Mr. Hernandez plans to have a room
for senior events, a room for children with autism and other underserved members of the
community. President Meyer stated that Mr. Hernandez is doing great work on the building and
services to be provided, all done by donations and to be free to the public.

There being no further business to discuss in regular session, Trustee Tieri made a motion to
adjourn into Executive Session at 8:33 p.m. to discuss the resignation of a part-time Police officer.
Trustee Kraus seconded.

AYES: (6) Trustees Kypuros, Juzeszyn, Gianotti, Tieri, Stacey and Kraus.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion carried.

Trustee Tieri made a motion to return to regular session at 9:14 p.m. Trustee Stacey seconded.
AYES: (6) Trustees Kypuros, Juzeszyn, Gianotti, Tieri, Stacey and Kraus.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion carried.

There being no further business, President Meyer asked for a motion to adjourn. Trustee Kypuros
made a motion to adjourn the meeting. Trustee Tieri seconded the motion.

AYES: (6) Trustees Kypuros, Juzeszyn, Gianotti, Tieri, Stacey and Kraus.

NAYS: (0) None.

Motion carried.

Meeting adjourned at 9:14 p.m.

Respectfully submitted by:

Janett McCawley
Village Clerk

Village of Beecher -- Minutes of 12-12-22 Board Meeting



VILLAGE OF BEECHER, WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS
ORDINANCE No. /304

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING THE EXECUTION OF AN
INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN THE VILLAGE OF
BEECHER AND THE BEECHER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT FOR
ENFORCEMENT OF THE BUILDING AND FIRE PREVENTION CODES

WHEREAS, the Corporate Authorities of the Village of Beecher, Will County, Illinois
(the “Village”), are authorized by the “Intergovernmental Cooperation Act” (5 ILCS 220/1) to
enter into contracts or otherwise associate with other public agencies in any manner not
prohibited by law or ordinance; and

WHEREAS, the Village and the Beecher Fire Protection District (the Fire District”)
have had a long term working relationship for the benefit of the residents of the Village and the
Village and Fire District seek to coordinate and share the enforcement of the Building and Fire
Prevention Codes; and

WHEREAS, the Village have been advised that it is in their best interests to enter into an
intergovernmental agreement with the Fire District, which is a public agency pursuant to 5 ILCS
220/2, to coordinate and share the enforcement of the Building and Fire Prevention Codes; and

WHEREAS, the Village having reviewed the Illinois Compiled Statutes, as amended from
time to time, the proposed Intergovernmental Agreement, now concur that it is advisable,
necessary, and in the best interests of the residents of the Village of Beecher to authorize the
President and Clerk to execute an Intergovernmental Agreement with the Fire District to
coordinate and share the enforcement of the Building and Fire Prevention Codes.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE PRESIDENT AND BOARD
OF TRUSTEES OF THE VILLAGE OF BEECHER, WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS, AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION ONE: That the Village Board of the Village of Beecher, Will County,
[llinois, does hereby approve the document entitled “AN INTERGOVERMENTAL
AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE VILLAGE OF BEECHER AND THE BEECHER FIRE
PROTECTION DISTRICT REGARDING THE ENFORCEMENT OF BUILDING AND
FIRE PREVENTION CODES” by and between the Village of Beecher and the Beecher Fire
Protection District, a true, correct and complete copy of which is marked as Exhibit A, attached
hereto, and incorporated by reference as if fully set forth herein, and the Village Board does
hereby further authorize the Village President and the Village Clerk to execute Exhibit A on
behalf of the Village of Beecher and to perform any other action as may be necessary or
convenient to effectuate this Ordinance.

SECTION TWQO: That all existing Ordinances and Village Code provisions, or parts
thereof, in conflict with the provisions of this Ordinance, are hereby deemed null, void, and of no
legal effect, and are specifically repealed.




SECTION THREE: If any section, clause, provision or portion of this Ordinance shall be
held to be invalid or unconstitutional by any Court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall
not affect any other section, clause, provision or portion of this Ordinance, and this Village Board
hereby expressly acknowledges that it would have enacted this Ordinance even with the invalid
portion deleted.

SECTION FOUR: That this Ordinance shall be in effect immediately after its passage
by the Village Board, its approval by the President, and its publication as required by law, and
recording.

L
PASSED and APPROVED this25 “dby of ez, ,2018.
Yeas: [/
Nays: O
Abstain: [
Present: O //
Gr(g Szyp#driski, Village President
ATTEST:

L ( <
Jéjett Conner, Village Clerk



INTERGOVERMENTAL AGREEMENT
BETWEEN THE VILLAGE OF BEECHER AND
THE BEECHER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
REGARDING THE ENFORCEMENT OF BUILDING AND
FIRE PREVENTION CODES

This Intergovernmental Agreement is made and entered on the last date set forth next to
the signatures of the Village of Beecher, Illinois ( the “Village”) and the Beecher Fire Protection
District (the “Fire District”) (collectively the “Parties”), that have approved this Agreement in
the manner provided by law.

RECITALS

WHEREAS, Article VII, Section 10 of the Illinois Constitution of 1970 authorizes units
of local government “to obtain or share services and to exercise, combine, or transfer any power
or function, in any manner not prohibited by law or ordinance”; and

WHEREAS, the Intergovernmental Cooperation Act, 5 ILCS 220/3, provides that any
power or powers, privileges, functions, or authority exercised or which may be exercised by a
public agency may be exercised, combined, transferred and enjoyed jointly with any other public
agency of the State except where specifically and expressly prohibited by law; and

WHEREAS, the Parties are both public agencies as defined by state statute; and

WHEREAS, the Village of Beecher and the Beecher Fire Protection District both
possess the power to establish regulations regarding fire protection and fire safety within their
respective boundaries; and

WHEREAS, the governing bodies of both the Village and the Fire District desire to
coordinate their enforcement of the legally adopted Building and Fire Prevention Codes to the
greatest extent possible; and

WHEREAS, the Village is desirous of sharing its powers of Code enforcement with the
Fire District.

COVENANTS

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT AGREED between the Village of Beecher and the
Beecher Fire Protection District, as follows:

SECTION ONE:

A. The Fire District agrees to make inspections of existing commercial, institutional,
industrial and multi-family buildings having common interior areas and/or three or more
dwelling units as requested by the Village to enforce the provisions of the Village’s Fire
Prevention Code and those portions of the Village’s Building Code relating to fire safety and/or



life safety, and any and all amendments or revisions hereto, within the common boundaries of
the Village and the District.

B. The District shall, upon the request of the Village, perform such inspection
services and provide all equipment that may be necessary for the performance of such
inspections and the proper enforcement of the Village’s Fire Prevention Code and those portions
of the Village’s Building Code relating to fire safety and/or life safety, within the common
boundaries of the District and the Village.

C. The Village shall make available to the District all available plans, specifications
and such other data and information in the possession of the Village as may be necessary for the
performance of the District’s inspection services under this Agreement.

D. The Village shall make reasonable arrangements with the District to assist the
District in the performance of the inspection services provided for herein.

E. The number of inspections required at any time, the inspection assignment and the
shifts to be worked shall be determined by the District. No person performing inspection or other
services hereunder at the direction of the District shall be deemed to be an employee of the
Village as a result of the performance of such services.

F. All inspections by the District provided for in this Agreement shall only be
performed to the extent the District is able to do so and has the necessary resources.

SECTION TWO: The Village and Fire District shall coordinate their enforcement
activities as they relate to matters concerning the construction, alteration, addition, repair,
removal, demolition, use, location, occupancy and maintenance of all buildings and structures
within the Village and shall apply these efforts to existing or proposed buildings and structures.

SECTION THREE: It shall be the responsibility of the Village to issue building
permits, collect fees pertaining to building construction, issue stop work orders, post structures,
maintain inspection reports and issue certificates of use and occupancy. Any legal fees connected
with the enforcement of the Building Code shall be assumed by the Village.

SECTION FOUR: The Village shall be responsible for the administration and
enforcement of the International Building Code 2015 as amended, and further be responsible for
providing the Fire District with one copy of all approved building plans of all non-residential
buildings.

SECTION FIVE: The Fire District will assist with the administration and enforcement
of the International Fire Code 2015 as amended. Any legal fees connected with the enforcement
of the Fire Prevention Code shall be assumed by the Village.

SECTION SIX: The Fire District agrees to provide written comments for the plan
review within seven (7) days of receipt of the original plans from the Village and inspection




services for the Village for the Sections of the International Building Code 2015 pertaining to the
following:

Fire Department Access

Special Hazards

Flammable and Combustible Liquids
Fire Protection Systems

Means of Egress

N W -

SECTION SEVEN: The Village shall not issue a final Certificate of Occupancy until it
receives a final inspection report from the Fire District, which shall be forwarded to the Village
within 48 hours of the request for final inspection. All violations of the approved plans and
permit shall be noted and it shall be the responsibility of the Village to notify the holder of the
permit of any discrepancies.

SECTION EIGHT: The Village and Fire District agree that any dispute regarding this
agreement (not specific Code issues) which has not been resolved by staff, shall be resolved by a
meeting between the Village President and the President of the Fire District at a mutually agreed-
to time and location.

SECTION NINE: Changes in the International Building Code 2015 as amended or the
International Fire Code 2015 as amended, as they relate to this Agreement, shall only be made
with the concurrence of the other party and legally adopted by an amending ordinance.

SECTION TEN: The Village Administrator or designee shall be responsible for
administering and enforcing this agreement.

SECTION ELEVEN: The Fire District shall identify its Code Official and designee who
is responsible for administering this agreement.

SECTION TWELVE: The Inspection Form to be utilized by the Fire District for annual
inspections is hereby attached as Exhibit B. Any additional or updated forms used by the District
for its annual inspection s shall be provided to the Village for review prior to use.

SECTION THIRTEEN: This intergovernmental agreement may be terminated by either
party hereto by the giving of thirty (30) days written notice to the governing body of the
respective local government unit. This Agreement shall be in full force and effect after its
passage by the Village Board of Trustees and by the Fire District Board of Trustees and the
affixing of the signatures of the appropriate officials of those parties to this agreement.

SECTION FOURTEEN: To the extent permitted by law, the District agrees to hold
harmless, indemnify and defend the Village from any and all claims, demands, liabilities, and
suits in law or equity that may arise from or out of the District’s performance of this Agreement.
The Villagg-agrees to hold harmless, indemnify and defend the District from any and all claims,
demands, iabilities and suits in law or in equity that may arise from or out of the Village’s
performance of this Agreement. Nothing in this paragraph shall be deemed a waiver by either

2



party of its right to claim or assert statutory and common law immunities as to third parties. The
indemnification provisions herein shall extend to the parties and their officers, employees and
agents.

SECTION FIFTEEN: This Agreement shall be binding upon and inure the benefit of
any successor governmental legal entity that may assume and perform the duties of either party
hereto. Notwithstanding the foregoing, this Agreement shall not be assigned by either party
hereto without the prior written consent of the other party to this Agreement.

SECTION SIXTEEN: The invalidity of any provision of this Agreement shall not
impair the validity of any other provisions. If any provision of this Agreement is determined by a
court of competent jurisdiction to be unenforceable, provisions severed or modified by the court
shall not affect the validity of enforceability of the remaining provisions hereof.

SECTION SEVENTEEN: This Agreement sets forth the entire understanding of the
parties, and may only be amended, modified or terminated by a written instrument signed by the
parties.

SECTION EIGHTEEN: This Agreement shall be interpreted and construed in
accordance with the laws of the State of Illinois.

SECTION NINETEEN: All notices hereunder shall be in writing and must be served with
personally or registered or certified mail to:

a. Village at: Village of Beecher
625 Dixie Highway
Beecher, IL 60401
Attention: Village Administrator

b. District at: Beecher Fire Protection District
711 Penfield St.
Beecher, IL 60401
Attention: Fire Chief

c. To such other person or place which either party hereto by its prior written notice shall
designate for notice to it from the other party hereto.

SECTION TWENTY: This Agreement is executed in multiple counterparts, each of which
shall be deemed to be and shall constitute one and the same instrument.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Parties, pursuant to proper and necessary authorization,
have executed this Agreement on the dates shown below.



APPROVED:

Village of Beeche

Attest: Luﬁ ( (:QL{

Dated: 324" / ?

APPROVED:
Beecher Fire Protection District

By:

President, Board of Trustees

Attest:
Secretary, Board of Trustees

Dated:




[N
sxizerr B’

Inspection Form

Beecher Fire Protection District

711 Penfield Street P.O. Box 759 Beecher, 1. 60401
708.946.6585 ~ Fax 708.946.3723
Name of Occupancy Date Occupancy ID#
Address Phone#
Affiliated Person Phone#
1.0UTSIDE Arrangement 2.8 EXTENSION CORDS 8. SPRINKLER SYSTEM
FD CONNECTION FIRE WALLS Condition 4.8 Test Certificate 81
Accessible 1.1 Condition 29 Improper Use 4.9 Valves Acces/Oper. 82
Swivels Working 1.2 Penetration 2.10 EMERGENCY LIGHTS Labeled 84
Caps & Plugs 1.3 STORAGE 211 Coverage 4.10 Spare Heads 8.4
PARKING Condition 212 Install 4.1 Wrench 86
Fire Lane Access 1.4 Height 2.13 Not Working 412 Room Condition 87
EXITWAYS Housekeeping 214 EXIT SIGNS FIRE PUMP
Clear 1.5 CEILING Install 413 Test Certificate 8.8
Level 16 Condition 2.15 Not Working 4.14 BACKFLOW
Lead to Open Area 1.7 Continuous Ceiling 2.16 5. Flammable Liquid Test Certificate 8.9
GAS METERS COMPRESS. GAS Storage 5.1 9.FIRE ALARM
Labeled 1.8 Cylnd. Chained 217 Dispensing 5.2 Test Certificate 9.1
Protection 19 3.HVAC EQUIPT No Smoking Signs 53 FACP PANEL
ELECTRICAL MTRS. Access 31 Class B Fire Ext 54 Condition 9.2
Labeled 1.10 Shut Offs 3.2 6.ELEVATORS Clear/No Trouble 9.3
Protection 1.1 Inspect. Cert. 33 Test Cert. 6.1 Pull station/AV Working 94
ADDRESS Clear of debris 3.4 Firefighter Service 6.2 10.KITCHEN
Visible from Street 112 Labeled 35 Debris in pit 6.3 K Class Ext. 10.1
HYDRANT DUCTS Drop/Lunar Key 6.4 Exhaust hood Clean 10.2
Location 1.13 Fusible Link 3.6 MACHINE ROOM Test Certificate 10.3
Obstruction 1.14 Condition 37 No storage 6.5 11.Key Box
2. INSIDE Access Marked 3.8 Machine labeled 6.6 Keys work in doors 11.1
EXITWAYS 4. Electrical Disconnects Labeled 6.7 Location 1.2
Proper # 2.1 CONTROL PANEL| 4.1 Emergency Phone 6.8 12.SPECIAL
Obstructed 22 Access 4.2 7.FIRE EXT. Occupant Load Sign 12.1
Door Swing 23 Labeled Condition 71 Emergency Info 12.2
Locks 24 CIRCUITS 43 Location 7.2 AED
Panic Hardware 25 Labeled 4.4 4A60BC 7.3 Batteries 123
AISLES 26 Locks 46 Access 74 Pad Expiration 12.4
Proper Width 27 Unused Opening 47 Yearly Inspection 7.5

I hereby authorize the Beecher Fire Protection District to make an inspection of the building located at the address indicated at the top of this torm.
You are hereby notified that upon inspection of the above premises, the violations indicated on the attached ficld correction notice have been found in
violation of local fire codes. Because this condition is a fire hazard and would seriously hinder the proper handling ol a fire by the Beecher Fire
Protection District, and is also contrary to law. you are hereby notified that you must have these violations corrected immediately. A re-inspection

All be made within fifteen (30) days. Failure to correct the violations may result in the issuance of a formal citation with a penalty of not less than

J.00 or more than $1000.00, as well as other penalties of the vielated ordinance. for cach day the prohibited conditions continue to exist. As well.
failure to correct these conditions may nullify your insurance. [ have received a copy of this notice of ordinance violation. and have read and
understand its contents.

Owner/Occupant /Manager Signature BFPD Fire Inspector

WHITE: Occupancy / YELLOW: Fire Prevention Bureau



BEECHER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT ’

711 PENFIELD STREET  BEECHER, ILLINOIS 60401
PHONE: 708-946-6585 www.beecherfire.org

Dear Business Owner,

Starting in January 2019 we will be conducting FREE annual Fire Safety Inspections of
your business. This is one of the lowest-cost resources available to protect your property
and the lives of your employees that occupy your premises. Thanks to this inspection
program, the residents and business owners within the Beecher Fire Protection District
will continue to have an extremely low fire loss rating for a fire district of its size. The
additional benefit is a lower overall property insurance rates compared to other villages
and/or fire districts.

Whether your business is a small property, small retail store, low-rise apartment building,
or an institutional campus with highly technical life-safety systems, your annual
inspection helps you ensure that your property is in compliance with the Village of
Beecher and/or Will County adopted Fire and Life Safety Codes and therefore national
safety standards.

Our Fire Inspectors will check your building’s exits, emergency lighting, exit signs,
components of fire-resistive separation, and we also look at access roadways and fire
lanes and testing maintenance records of fire-safety systems. We will also make sure
there is an emergency evacuation plan in place.

If the crews find any conditions that violate village or county ordinance, they will notity
you. If the conditions cannot be corrected on the spot, they will mark it on the form
requesting that the condition is corrected as soon as possible. A re-inspection will be
scheduled to confirm that the violation has been corrected within thirty (30) days of the
initial inspection. No additional fee is charged for the first re-inspection.

Emergency Pre-Plan Walk-through

In addition to receiving an annual Fire Safety Inspection, many businesses and
commercial occupancies in the Beecher Fire Protection District receive an annual
Emergency Pre-Plan Walk-through. Crews from the fire station visit the facility to
conduct pre-emergency planning. This ensures that their response is efficient and
effective as possible in the event of an emergency. The inspection and this service are
provided at no charge as well.

If you have any questions about the Fire Safety Inspection Program. please feel free to

contact me at (708) 946-6585 or jfalaschetti@beecherfire.org . We thank you for your
efforts in helping us keep the Village of Beecher, Washington Township and Will
Township a safe place in which to work. live and visit.

'\:V'?LI

Joseph M. Falaschetti Jr.

Fire Chief



BEECHER FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

711 PENFIELD STREET ~ BEECHER, ILLINOIS 60401
PrioNE: 708-946-6585 www.beecherfire.org

Dear Business Owner,

Starting in June 2019 we will be conducting FREE annual Fire Safety Inspections of
your business. This is one of the lowest-cost resources available to protect your property
and the lives of your employees that occupy your premises. Thanks to this inspection
program. the residents and business owners within the Beecher Fire Protection District
will continue to have an extremely low fire loss rating for a fire district of its size. The
additional benefit is a lower overall property insurance rates compared to other villages
and/or fire districts.

Whether your business is a small property, small retail store, low-rise apartment building.
or an institutional campus with highly technical life-safety systems. your annual
inspection helps you ensure that your property is in compliance with the Village of
Beecher and/or Will County adopted Fire and Life Safety Codes and therefore national
safety standards.

Our Fire Inspectors will check your building’s exits, emergency lighting. exit signs,
components of fire-resistive separation, and we also look at access roadways and fire
lanes and testing maintenance records of fire-safety systems. We will also make sure
there is an emergency evacuation plan in place.

[f the crews find any conditions that violate village or county ordinance, they will notify
you. If the conditions cannot be corrected on the.spot, they will mark it on the form
requesting that the condition is corrected as soon as possible. A re-inspection will be
scheduled to contirm that the violation has been corrected within thirty (30) days of the
initial inspection. No additional fee is charged for the first re-inspection.

Emergency Pre-Plan Walk-through

In addition to receiving an annual Fire Safety Inspection, many businesses and
commercial occupancies in the Beecher Fire Protection District receive an annual
Emergency Pre-Plan Walk-through. Crews from the fire station visit the facility to
conduct pre-emergency planning. This ensures that their response is efficient and
effective as possible in the event of an emergency. The inspection and this service are
provided at no charge as well.

If you have any questions about the Fire Safety Inspection Program. please feel free to
contact me at (708) 946-6585 or jfalaschetti@beecherfire.org . We thank you for your
efforts in helping us keep the Village of Beecher. Washington Township and Will
Township a safe place in which to work. live and visit.

Joseph M. Falaschetti Jr.
Fire Chief
Beecher Fire Protection District



MEETING OF THE PUBLIC SAFETY COMMITTEE
FRIDAY, JANUARY 18,2019 AT 9:30 A.M.
BEECHER VILLAGE HALL
625 DIXIE HIGHWAY

The meeting was called to order by Chairman Kraus at 9:32 a.m.

Present: President Szymanski, Trustees Meyer, Kraus and Wehling, Fire Chief Joe Falaschetti,
Bob Barber

The purpose of the meeting was to discuss a proposal from the fire district to assist the Village
with plan reviews for commercial and industrial buildings and annual inspections of all
businesses and multi-family rental units. An intergovernmental agreement was presented and
discussed. The Chief explained that an inspection program was needed for life safety and for
pre-planning fire response.

Trustee Wehling wanted the agreement to specify exactly who was going to be inspected. It was
agreed that Paragraph #7 of the agreement be moved up to Paragraph #1. Both parties agreed
that once a final draft of the agreement was completed that both parties” legal counsels would
review the document prior to presentation to the governing boards.

Bob Barber stated that regardless of the agreement’s wording, the Village and the Fire District
would work together collaboratively to provide a valuable (but not unreasonable) plan review
and inspection program. Voluntary compliance is the first objective.

President Szymanksi stated that he would prefer that the Village’s appointed Code Official be a
sworn officer so that tickets could be issued and complaints signed when necessary. The Village
would use its local Prosecutor for cases. However, he wanted every step be taken to achieve
voluntary compliance before a citation is issued.

Trustee Wehling wanted to make sure that proper notifications be made prior to inspections and
that the Village and Fire District post the inspection programs on their web pages to let those
purchasing property to know about the program.

Chairman Kraus agreed to have a mock inspection of his building on Penfield which has both
multi-family and business rentals to see how the program will work.



The meeting adjourned at 10:58 a.m.

Robert Barber
Secretary



VILLAGE OF BEECHER, WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS
ORDINANCE NO. A7

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING BUILDING REGULATIONS CODE
PROVISIONS OF THE VILLAGE OF BEECHER, AND REPEALING
ALL VILLAGE CODE SECTIONS AND ORDINANCES, OR PARTS
THEREOF, IN CONFLICT THEREWITH.

WHEREAS, the Corporate Authorities of the Village of Beecher, Will County, Illinois,
have been advised that most national building regulations have been updated; and

WHEREAS, the Corporate Authorities of this Village of Beecher, Will County, Illinois,
have reviewed current national building regulations and the current Village Code as it relates to
building requirements; and

WHEREAS, the Corporate Authorities of the Village of Beecher, Will County, Illinois,
now concur that is advisable, necessary, and in the best interests of the residents of the Village of
Beecher that Village Code Building Regulations be amended to update and adopt the current
building regulations.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE PRESIDENT AND BOARD
OF TRUSTEES OF THE VILLAGE OF BEECHER, WILL COUNTY, ILLINOIS, AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION ONE: That Section 4-1-1, entitled “BUILDING CODES ADOPTED” of
Chapter 1, entitled “BUILDING CODE?”, of Title 4, entitled “BUILDING REGULATIONS”, of
the Village Code of the Village of Beecher, be, and the same is hereby amended to read and
provide as follows, namely:

“4-1-1: BUILDING CODES ADOPTED:

Each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of the following codes
are hereby adopted for the Village of Beecher and made a part hereof, as if fully set forth herein,
with the amendments provided below each code:

(A)2015 International Building Code, with the following amendment:

1. Section 101.1 - delete “[NAME OF JURISDITION]” and replace with
“Village of Beecher”.

2. Section 101.1.4.3 — delete “International Plumbing Code” and replace with
“Illinois Plumbing Code (77 lllinois Administrative Code 890) published by
the Illinois Department of Health, as amended from time to time”.

3. Section 102.2 — add “The Village of Beecher Zoning Ordinance shall prevail
over any conflicts in this code pertaining to zoning regulations, signs,
performance standards, accessory uses, and other matters.”

4. Section 110 — add “There will be a 24 hour grace period between the passing
¥ the final inspection and the issuance of the certificate of occupancy. The
} contractor shall schedule the final inspection with a minimum 24 hour notice.”

5. Section 113.1- delete entire section and replace with “The Planning and

1



.

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

Zoning Commission of the Village of Beecher shall hear and decide appeals
of orders, decisions or determinations made by the building official relative to
the application and interpretation of this code.”

Section 113. 3 — delete entire section.

Section 301.2 — add “The Village of Beecher Zoning Ordinance shall prevail
over any conflicts in this code pertaining to zoning regulations, signs,
performance standards, accessory uses, and other matters.”

Section 406.3.4.1 - delete entire section and replace with “Private garages,
located beneath rooms in residential buildings shall have walls, partitions,
floors, ceilings, and structural steel members separating the garage space
from the adjacent interior spaces constructed to a minimum one-hour fire
resistance rating. All bearing and non-bearing walls under the garage shall
have a one-hour fire rating. The sills of all door openings between the
garage and adjacent interior spaces shall be raised not less than four (4)
inches above the garage floor.”

Section 903.2.8 — amend Group R to provide “An automatic sprinkler
system shall be provided through all building with a Group R fire area
except Group R-3 occupancies constructed in accordance with 2015
International Residential Code.”

Chapter 11 — delete entire chapter and replace with “The Illinois
Accessibility Code, as amended from time to time.”

Section 1805.1.1 — add “All footings and walls to be poured in place concrete.
Alternative methods may be approved by the Building Official.”

Section 1805.4.2 — add to the end of the section “All foundation drains shall
incorporate the use of a minimum four inch (4”) perforated tile.”

Section 2111.14 add new section “Factory Manufactured fireplaces: Hearth
extensions for approved factory manufactured fireplaces shall extend not less
than sixteen inches in front and at least eight inches beyond each side of the
fireplace opening.”

Chapter 26 and 27 — add new section “All components, such as boxes,
conduit, wire ways, luminaries, ductwork, equipment, ceiling grid or other
items, shall not be supported from the roof deck or the bottom cord of the bar
joist, unless the licensed design professional of record specifically designed
the structure to support he load of the additional components and it is
specifically noted on the applicable building plan sheets.”

(B) 2015 International Residential Code, with the following amendments:

1.

2.
3.

Section R101.1 - delete “[NAME OF JURISDITION]” and replace with
“Village of Beecher”.
Section R105.2 — delete entire section.
Table R301.2(1) The following information shall be inserted into the
table:
i. Ground Snow Load - 25

ii. Wind Speed — 115

iii. Seismic Design Category — B

iv. Weathering — severe

v. Frost Depth — 42”



o v

vi. Termite — moderate to heavy
vii. Decay — slight to moderate
viii. Winter Design Temp - -10

ix. Ice shield-underlayment — required

x. Air freezing index — 1700

xi. Mean Annual Temp - 50
Section R309 — add “Garage Gas Curbs-A four (4) inch minimum height
gas curb shall be provided at each wall common with the attached garage
and residence. A foundation wall may be utilized as a gas curb only if
four (4) inches of foundation exposed above the garage floor slab at each
common wall.”
R309.5 — delete entire section.
R313 - delete entire section.
Section R401.1 - delete entire section and replace with “The provisions of
this chapter shall control the design and construction of the foundation and
foundation spaces for buildings. In addition to the provisions of this
chapter, the design and construction of foundations in flood hazard areas
as established by Table R301.2(1) shall meet the provisions of Section
R322. All columns supported by concrete to be structural steel or
approved material by the building official.”
Section E3602.2 — add to the end of section “Every single-family unit
exceeding twelve hundred (1,200) square feet erected subsequent to the date
of the adoption of this code shall utilize a minimum two hundred-ampere
service. Every single-family unit exceeding four thousand (4,000) square feet
erected subsequent to the date of the adoption of this code shall utilize a
minimum four hundred-ampere service. If two (2) separate 200 ampere panels
are utilized to form a 400 ampere service, a separate sized grounding electrode
conductor is required from each panel to the street side of the incoming metal
water service. A jumper conductor between each panel forming a single
grounding electrode conductor is prohibited. The downsizing of the service
entrance neutral conductor is prohibited.”

(C) 2015 International Mechanical Code, with the following amendments:

1.

AN bW

Section 101.1 - delete “[INAME OF JURISDITION]” and replace with
“Village of Beecher”.

Section 106.5.2 — delete entire section and replace with “See Village of
Beecher Fee schedule.”

Section 108.4 — delete entire section.

Section 603.5 - delete provisions referencing Fibrous Duct Construction.
Section 603.5.1 - delete entire section.

Section 603.6.1.1 -delete entire section and replace with “Flexible air ducts
shall be limited to six feet (6') in length.”

Section 603.6.2.1 — delete entire section and replace with “Flexible air
connectors shall be limited in length to six feet (6').”



(D)201S5 International Fire Code, with the following amendment:
1. Section 101.1 - delete “[NAME OF JURISDITION]” and replace with
“Village of Beecher”.

(E) 2015 Life Safety Code , with the following amendment:
1. Section 24.3.5 - delete entire section. (which is a reference to new one- and
two-family dwellings shall be protected throughout by an approved automatic
sprinkler system)

(F) The Illinois Accessibility Code, as amended.

(G)2015 International Fuel Gas Code, with the following amendments:
1. Section 101.1 - delete “[INAME OF JURISDITION]” and replace with
“Village of Beecher”.
2. Section 106.6 — delete entire section and replace with “See Village of Beecher
Fee schedule.”
3. Section 108.4 - delete entire section.

(H)2015 International Energy Conservation Code as adopted with the State of Illinois
amendments, with the following amendment:
1. Section 101.1 - delete “[NAME OF JURISDITION]” and replace with
“Village of Beecher”.

Notwithstanding anything contained in the codes adopted in this Chapter 4, the Village of
Beecher is the jurisdictional authority for all such adopted codes. A copy of all such codes
adopted herein shall be on file with the Village Clerk.”

SECTION TWO: That Section 4-2-1, entitled “ADOPTION OF PLUMBING CODE”
of Chapter 2, entitled “PLUMBING CODE”, of Title 4, entitled “BUILDING
REGULATIONS”, of the Village Code of the Village of Beecher, be, and the same is hereby
amended to read and provide as follows, namely:

“4-2-1: ADOPTION OF PLUMBING CODE:

“The Illinois Plumbing Code, as amended from time to time by the State of Illinois is adopted as
the plumbing code of the Village of Beecher with a copy of the same being on file with the
Village Clerk. Each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said
plumbing code are hereby adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set forth herein.”

SECTION THREE: That Section 4-3-1, entitled “ADOPTION OF ELECTRICAL
CODE” of Chapter 2, entitled “ELECTRICAL CODE”, of Title 4, entitled “BUILDING
REGULATIONS?”, of the Village Code of the Village of Beecher, be, and the same is hereby
amended to read and provide as follows, namely:

“4-3-1: ADOPTION OF ELECTRICAL CODE:

“The 2014 National Electrical Code (NEC) and 2015 ICC Electric Code are hereby adopted as
electrical code of the Village of Beecher with a copy of the same being on file with the Village
Clerk. Each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said

4



electrical codes are hereby adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set forth herein, with the
additions, insertions, deletions and changes for the 2015 National Electrical Code prescribed in
section 4-3-2 of this chapter.”

SECTION FOUR: That Section 4-3-2, entitled “STANDARD WIRING” of Chapter 3,
entitled “ELECTRICAL CODE?”, of Title 4, entitled “BUILDING REGULATIONS”, of the
Village Code of the Village of Beecher, be, and the same is hereby amended to read and provide
as follows, namely:

“4-3-2: ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS AND CHANGES
The following sections of the 2014 National Electrical Code are hereby amended:

(A) Any reference in this code to the “Authority Having Jurisdiction (AHJ)” shall
mean the Village of Beecher.

(B) Section 210.8(A)(5) Add to this section the following: “Ground fault Circuit
Interrupter Protection will not be required for ejector pumps, sump pumps and
furnaces.”

(C) Section 210.8(A)(6) Add to this section the following: “Ground fault Circuit
Interrupter Protection will not be required for refrigerators. Refrigerators must
be on separate circuit.”

(D)Section 310.106(B) - delete entire section and replace with:

All Conductors in this article shall be of copper only. Aluminum conductors are
prohibited.

(E) Section 406.12(A) — delete entire subsection

(F) Notwithstanding anything contained in this code to the contrary, all new electric
services in the village shall be underground, where available, unless otherwise
approved by the village.

(G)Notwithstanding anything contained in this code to the contrary, an approved
nonferrous metal tag shall be attached to the ground electrode clamp giving
warning against its removal.

(H)Notwithstanding anything contained in this code to the contrary, Nonmetallic-
sheathedcable (Romex) shall not be permitted in the Village.”

SECTION FIVE: That Section 4-4-1, entitled “ADOPTION OF PROPERTY
MAINTENANCE CODE” of Chapter 4, entitled “PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE”, of
Title 4, entitled “BUILDING REGULATIONS?”, of the Village Code of the Village of Beecher,
be, and the same is hereby amended to read and provide as follows, namely:

4-4-1: ADOPTION OF PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE:
“The 2015 International Property Code is hereby adopted as maintenance code of the Village of
Beecher with a copy of the same being on file with the Village Clerk. Each and all of the
regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said international property
maintenance code are hereby adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set forth herein, with the
additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in section 4-4-2 of this chapter.”
F
SECTION SIX: That Section 4-4-2, entitled “ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS AND
CHANGES?” of Chapter 4, entitled “PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE”, of Title 4, entitled

5




“BUILDING REGULATIONS?”, of the Village Code of the Village of Beecher, be, and the same
is hereby amended to read and provide as follows, namely:

4-4-2: ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS AND CHANGES
“The following sections of the 2015 International Property Maintenance Code are hereby
amended:

(A)Section 101.1 - delete “[NAME OF JURISDITION]” and replace with “Village of
Beecher”.”

(B) Section 111.1 — delete “board of appeals” and replace with “The Planning and Zoning
Commission of the Village of Beecher”.

(C) Section 112.4 —delete section and replace with “Any person who shall continue any work
after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed
to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than
$250.00 and not more than $750.00 per violation.”

(D) Section 302.10 is added to read as follows:

“Section 302.10 Landscaping.
1. Duty to Prune. Trees, bushes and other shrubbery on private property
adjacent to a street right-of-way shall be pruned in such a manner that it
will not obstruct or shade the streetlights, obstruct the passage of
pedestrians or vehicles on the street, obstruct ability to see traffic signs,
obstruct the view of any intersection or create a public safety hazard.
2. Turf Maintenance. Areas where grass has been established shall be
maintained without bare areas or soil or ruts caused by pedestrian or
vehicle use.”

(E) Section 302.11 is added to read as follows:

“Section 302.11. Trees on Commercial Properties. Trees on commercial
properties are the responsibility of the property owner and shall be maintained
in a healthy condition. Trees on commercial properties are subject to all zoning
regulations and any applicable development agreements with the Village of
Beecher.”

(F) Section 302.4 - Insert “8”

(G) Section 304.14, 602.3, and 602.4 - Insert dates “May 1’ to “Octoberl.”

(H)Chapter 5 - Delete the “International Plumbing Code” and insert the “Illinois

99 99

Plumbing Code”.

SECTION SEVEN: That Section 4-5-3, entitled “PUBLIC SWIMMING POOL
CONTROL” of Chapter 3, entitled “SWIMMING POOLS”, of Title 4, entitled “BUILDING
REGULATIONS?”, of the Village Code of the Village of Beecher, be, and the same is hereby
amended to read and provide as follows, namely:

“4-5-3: ADOPTION OF SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE

The 2015 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is hereby adopted the Village of Beecher
with a copy of the same being on file with the Village Clerk. Every swimming pool hereinafter
constructed, installed, altered, maintained, removed or demolished in the village shall comply
with the provisions of this chapter. The International Swimming Pool and Spa Code is amended

as following: Section 101.1 - delete “[NAME OF JURISDITION]” and replace with “Village of
6



3% 9

Beecher”.

( SECTION EIGHT: The following sections of the Village Code of the Village of
Beecher, be, and the same are hereby deleted in their entirety as follows:

4-1-3 entitled “FRAMING REQUIREMENTS”

4-1-9 entitled “FRAMING IN INDUSTRIAL ZONED AREAS AND PARCELS
HAVING A SPECIAL USE PERMIT FOR PUBLIC UTILITES”

4-1-12 entitled “ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS AND CHANGES”

4-1-13 entitled “ADDITIONAL BUILDING REQUIREMENTS FOR DETACHED
STRUCTURES OVER ONE HUNDRED FORTY FOUR SQUARE FEET”

4-3-3 entitled “ELECTRICAL SERVICE”
SECTION NINE: That all existing Ordinances and Village Code provisions, or parts

thereof, in conflict with the provisions of this Ordinance, are hereby deemed null, void, and of no
legal effect, and are specifically repealed.

SECTION TEN: If any section, clause, provision or portion of this Ordinance shall be

held to be invalid or unconstitutional by any Court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall

A not affect any other section, clause, provision or portion of this Ordinance, and this Village Board

( hereby expressly acknowledges that it would have enacted this Ordinance even with the invalid
i portion deleted.

SECTION ELEVEN: That this Ordinance shall be in effect as of July 1, 2018, after its
passage by the Village Board, its approval by the President, its publication as required by law,
and its submission to the Illinois Capital Development Board as required by law.

PASSED and APPROVED this E%& of May, 2018,

Yeas: (0
Nays: O
Abstain: O
Presnt: O 7

G{eg Séythanski, Village President

EST:
C;:r;(/_/\
& Japett Conner, Village CM



(2£°86€'v9€)

(20" 12L'Y)

8.°cY
vz 98
(08'9v9)
6801
LevL
19°C

00'S
91’8l
(9z's52°€)

(0g°222'09¢€)

£0°'v9
69'28¢
ve'SLE L
€591
(65°00.V12)
(2e'sve‘szt)
¥8'SZL'S
(s8'v€9)
89'26LCY
(82"000°86)
99'256'9¢
(88°2L1L'Y)
(90°221°€1)
00°6EL0L

abuey)

L2

L4 L2 - - A - - O @

L - I - - - 7 A A A A

0€'SLE°CIY'Y

28°Ev6°9Ee

6Z'282'9¢
90°122's
l2°189°€h
88°520°6
2L 02LLL
6L291C
00'S
€8°€1L6'L6
2o'Le6'0€L

ceoc/iefel

8y LEV'SLO‘Y

15'891'8p
15°580°L1E
€2°015°L
LL'669°EL
LT 18E°L
or'oLEL2L'L
99°€9€°'6.2
LL70€5‘2S
95y ‘ee
[AA:T4N 157
50'6.8°192
S0°9€0‘V 1L
8€°2.L6‘S
ZL'8LEY9
9£°668°'82.

ceoe/iefel

L4

& N hHh &BHhHhHh&hHhBHH N L4

LA - - g - - R

L9°€LL'9LL'y $ 9.°0.t'8€S‘E
68'¥90°LYE $ cL'ees'vee
Ly'8ee ot $ 8.°220'9¢
zZ8veL’'s $ 08°220‘v
10'82€‘vb $ SE'v86‘vh
66'710°6 $ ov'2sLolL
1904 LL $ 29'691°Sl
81°091°C $ 9°009°L L
19°S6.°26 $ 82°085'81
82°989'vEL $ v'666'€8
2202/0E/1L 120c/LEfCL
8L°80L'GEV'Y  $ £9°/€6°ELEE
vS'voL‘sy $

26°20L9LE $ 26°€29°10E
68vElL $ 256608
81°€89°CL $ S8°100‘S

L2 18E°L $ L0°6.€°L
so'Lioere't $ 20°€/9°P0L L
€0°60€‘S0Y $ £0°2€0°602
£6'v0Y‘LY $ 8L'vee'9
Lrell'ee $ LS'¥50°'6¢C
0'€E6°E6E $ 8.'ce8'0ve
£€°6/8°65€ $ 9.°v0v‘802
6€°€80°229 $ GE'288°219
92°060°01 $ €1°005'81
8L'shy'LL $ LL°GS9‘SH
9€°09.'8LL $ 98°/G60'81LS
¢20Z/0E/1 L L20e/LERL

S3IONVIVE LNNODJV

H3HO339 40 IDVTIIA

L - B - - - - s - -

1685
Sv.LE
£0€e
vv.i6
S68S
cS.L6
8/¢c8
£9S0
686¢

10
O
0
O
O

30

R(e]
10
0

Bquny

€80 "
18¢l °
88LY -
98LY °
6¥90 °
8006 -
¥200 "
819¢
609 "
€v0c
0L -
689/ °
100 -
2696 -
9106 -

BqunN

ejol Iiv
S100y 99dg % uoIsSIWWOoY

"pu| 0L MoIdST
JONIISMBAN

MO012ST 19)4onjuepN
uoljealasald jeriowap
uoISSIWWOo) YInoA
ad aimvpo4 19ssy
alnziag adljod

MO042s3 siapling

Aine yiy

$)00Y 9adg B UOISSIWWO)
SUN029y abejiA 11V

v4S30 3dljod
spund vddv
ATL
punjjuisdinbgdesn
uondwapay puog
)9 |e4audx)
ainyonansedul
leqjuan

lended s/M
aoejday ulep S/M
W=20

1930 S/M

len4 uiop

asnjay

14N

unoody



Date Account
12/02/2022 4th July,ck102989
12/02/2022 4th July,ck102989
12/02/2022 4th July,ck102989
12/15/2022 4th July,ck102989

4th July,ck102989 Total

12/01/2022 Central_ck62618
12/01/2022 Centrai_ck62618
12/07/2022 Central_ck62618
12/07/2022 Central_ck62618
12/07/2022 Central_ck62618
12/09/2022 Central_ck62618
12/09/2022 Central_ck62618
12/09/2022 Central_ck62618
12/09/2022 Central_ck62618
12/21/2022 Central_ck62618
12/21/2022 Central_ck62618
12/21/2022 Central_ck62618
12/21/2022 Central_ck62618
12/21/2022 Central_ck62618
12/21/2022 Central_ck62618
12/21/2022 Central_ck62618
12/22/2022 Central_ck62618
12/23/2022 Central_ck62618
12/23/2022 Central_ck62618

Central_ck62618 Total

12/30/2022 General,ck9008

General,ck9008 Total

12/01/2022 Joint Fuel,ck70041
12/01/2022 Joint Fuel,ck70041
12/02/2022 Joint Fuel,ck70041
12/09/2022 Joint Fuel,ck70041
12/15/2022 Joint Fuel,ck70041
12/21/2022 Joint Fuel,ck70041
12/30/2022 Joint Fuel,ck70041

Joint Fuel,ck70041 Tota!l

Commission Bills / Non AP Payments

Num
3687
3688
3689
3690

ACH
ACH
35192
ACH
ACH
ACH
ACH
ACH
ACH
35262
35263
35264
35265
35266
ACH
ACH
35267
ACH
ACH

ACH

1624
TXFR
1625
1626
1627
1628
1629

12/07/2022 Nantucket Escrow,ck153303 1049
Nantucket Escrow,ck153303 Total

12/07/2022 O & M,ck9210

0 & M,ck9210 Total

12/12/2022 Refuse,ck59692
12/14/2022 Refuse,ck59692

Refuse,ck59692 Total
12/15/2022 W. Main Replacement,ck16:

8382

ACH
ACH

1029

12/01/22 - 12/31/22

Description
Lightmart

Ken Bobowski
Beecher Hardware
Home Depot

IPBC

IMRF

John Hernandez

Net Pay

Seniority Pay

Fed Payroll Taxes

Fed Payroll Taxes

State Of lllinois

State Of Illinois

John Hernandez

Mission Square Retirement
Operating Engineers Local 399
Teamsters Union Local # 700
NCPERS Group Life Ins.
AFLAC

Net Pay

Local 399 Health Insurance
Fed Payroll Taxes

State Of Illinois

IDES

Washington Township
Village Of Beecher
Co-Alliance Cooperative Inc.
Co-Alliance Cooperative Inc.
Co-Alliance Cooperative Inc.
Co-Alliance Cooperative Inc.
Co-Alliance Cooperative Inc.

Lamp Post Globes - VOB
Beecher Postmaster

Credit Card Charges
Star / A&J Disposal

Brandt Excavating, Inc.

W. Main Replacement,ck162043 Total

Grand Total

Memo

light poles
PA materials
PA materials
8' ladder

Health Ins auto debit
Retirement contribution
net pay

Net Pay payroll 12/07/22
seniority pay

fed taxes seniority pay
Fed w/h, ss, med payroll
ILw/h tax payroll

state taxes seniority pay
net pay

Retirement

PW & Clerical Union Dues
p.d. union dues

supp. life ins.

Aflac suplimental ins

Net Pay payroll 12/21/22
Health Insurance

Fed w/h, ss, med payroll
ILw/h tax payroll

unemployment ins. 4th qtr 2022

Monthly internet and electric
monthly admin fee

Inv 295878 / 295879

Inv 295954 / 295955

Inv 296007 - 296008

Inv 296067 / 296068

Inv 296116

lamp post - dec accts payable
late water bilis

credit card fees November
refuse pick up

Lead line

Amount
(3,758.00)
(116.24)
(32.54)
(69.88)
(3,976.66)
(28,203.72)
(12,965.29)
(1,981.02)
(49,206.37)
(5,660.71)
(1,738.71)
(21,158.32)
(3,474.75)
(336.87)
(1,997.02)
(2,772.27)
(575.50)
(569.00)
(80.00)
(203.90)
(47,837.08)
(8,309.00)
(19,675.63)
(3,289.00)
(210,034.16)
(540.72)
(540.72)
{100.00)
(400.00)
(4,430.93)
(4,191.00)
(5,682.26)
(4,763.88)
(1,786.00)
(21,354.07)
(699.68)
(699.68)
(66.44)
(66.44)
(400.55)
(31,148.32)
(31,548.87)
(201,965.88)
(201,965.88)

(470,186.48)



22 99@2e AONgg 1002z desee Bnvee Ainge sungg Aepnge 1dvze JeNse 9e-£e Ueriz 98dg AONLE 1001z 1deg z Bnylg AinfLg aunpg AepLg Jdy L2 Jellg godlg ueroz 9ed

e — - 1

0$
e — 000°'002$
. : 000°00¥$
I \/'ll 000°'009%
\ 000'008%
€L9'V0T'T 7l|||L S0z'sz8 o
A-{I.l-/[ \ 000°000°L$
000'002'1$
00000 1$
000'009°L$
- 000'008°L$
B - B Pu3 YluojA 1e pund jesauan T

,l o 000100228
S o PaN 000°00t'2$

— - \.\\.\ Ny~ 000°009'2$
000'008'2$
) st— s 000°'000'€$

— S \\ 000'002°€$

) i £998ES E 000°00V'€$
S , A Py

‘ /-\-\ = 000°009°€$
S A N - 000'008°€$
S A A 000°000't$

— / N 000°'002'v'$
/ SR \ 000'00%'$

o 000'009‘v$
- B pu3 Yluow 1e syunoddy ase||IA MMM.MMM,MH

000°002°5$




Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/L Number G/L Title FY 23 Month's FY 23 Fiscal YTD FY 23 Budget FY 23 F/IY
Activity Activity Over/Under
01-00-311 REAL ESTATE TAX $6,926.88  $996,644.99  $998,734.00 -$2,089.01
01-00-321 LIQUOR LICENSES $.00 $7,775.00 $13,950.00 -$6,175.00
01-00-323 BUSINESS LICENSES $.00 $590.00 $3,450.00 -$2,860.00
01-00-324 ANIMAL LICENSES $540.00 $2,070.00 $9,165.00 -$7,095.00
01-00-325 CONTRACTORS LICENSES $.00 $10,750.00 $23,350.00 -$12,600.00
01-00-326 AMUSEMENT DEVICE LICENSES $.00 $12,875.00 $14,450.00 -$1,575.00
01-00-327 VIDEO GAMING TAX $8,676.23 $63,837.25 $93,780.00 -$29,942.75
01-00-331 BUILDING PERMITS $1,695.80 $39,348.54 $41,400.00 -$2,051.46
01-00-332 RE-INSPECTION FEES $.00 $.00 $100.00 -$100.00
01-00-341 STATE INCOME TAX $43,194.39  $514,833.28  $623,059.00 -$108,225.72
01-00-343 REPLACEMENT TAX $1,262.83 $12,285.77 $10,232.00 $2,053.77
01-00-345 SALES TAX $53,144.52  $415,769.86  $640,818.00 -$225,048.14
01-00-347 STATE USE TAX $16,900.67  $120,395.97  $160,221.00 -$39,825.03
01-00-348 CANNABIS EXCISE TAX $574.27 $4,969.35 $8,483.00 -$3,513.65
01-00-353 AUTO THEFT TASK FORCE GRANT $13,474.01 $72,624.76  $115,774.00 -$43,149.24
01-00-354 COVID GRANTS $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
01-00-356 IPRF SAFETY GRANT $.00 $4,135.00 $4,135.00 §$.00
01-00-359 INTERGOVERNMENTAL REVENUES $4,696.85 $47,313.78 $58,292.00 -$10,978.22
01-00-361 COURT FINES $4,509.05 $33,217.86 $44,972.00 -$11,754.14
01-00-362 LOCAL ORDINANCE FINES $.00 $2,875.00 $3,805.00 -$930.00
01-00-363 TOWING FEES $.00 $24,000.00 $23,000.00 $1,000.00
01-00-381 INTEREST INCOME $.00 $2,404.60 $2,450.00 -$45.40
01-00-382 TELECOMM/EXCISE TAX $4,486.25 $35,537.29 $50,000.00 -$14,462.71
01-00-383 FRANCHISE FEES - CATV $.00 $58,604.45 $76,798.00 -$18,193.55
01-00-384 REIMBURSEMENTS - ENGINEERING $.00 $.00 $20,000.00 -$20,000.00
01-00-385 AGGREGATION FEES-ELIGO $778.58 $6,228.64 $9,343.00 -$3,114.36
01-00-386 MOSQUITO ABATEMENT FEES $610.64 $13,519.00 $20,724.00  -$7,205.00
01-00-387 MISC INCOME - POLICE DEPT $.00 $1,146.50 $2,695.00 -$1,548.50
01-00-389 MISCELLANEOUS INCOME $.00 $12,460.79 $10,435.00 $2,025.79
01-00-390 IPBC TERMINAL RESERVE $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
01-00-392 FIXED ASSET SALES $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
01-00-393 INTERFUND OPERATING TRANS $.00 $.00 $204,334.00 -$204,334.00
01-00-394 LOAN PROCEEDS-SPLASH PAD $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
01-00-396 RESERVE CASH $.00 $.00 $160,000.00 -$160,000.00
01-00-397 ENCUMBRANCES $.00 $.00 $58,785.00 -$58,785.00
Department 00 Totals

Revenues $161,470.97 $2,516,212.68 $3,506,734.00 -$990,521.32

Expenses $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
01-01-441 ELECTED OFFICIALS SALARIES $.00 $11,450.00 $22,900.00 $11,450.00
01-01-442 APPT OFFICIALS SALARIES $.00 $.00 $16,500.00 $16,500.00
01-01-461 SOCIAL SECURITY $.00 $875.93 $3,015.00 $2,139.07
01-01-462 IMRF $.00 $.00 $754.00 $754.00
01-01-536 DATA PROCESSING SERVICES $.00 $.00 $500.00 $500.00
01-01-552 TELEPHONE $.00 $600.00 $600.00 $.00
01-01-561 DUES AND PUBLICATIONS $289.00 $1,797.47 $8,650.00 $6,852.53
01-01-565 CONFERENCES $190.00 $2,477.26 $7,000.00 $4,522.74
01-01-566 MEETING EXPENSES $.00 $17.00 $250.00 $233.00

Department 01 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Expenses $479.00 $17,217.66 $60,169.00 $42,951.34

Page | Generated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/L Number G/LTitle FY 23 Month's FY 23 Fiscal YTD FY 23 Budget FY 23 F/Y
Activity Activity Over/Under
01-02-533 ENGINEERING SERVICES $.00 $2,827.50 $29,000.00 $26,172.50
01-02-561 DUES AND PUBLICATIONS $.00 $167.03 $175.00 $7.97
Department 02 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Expenses $.00 $2,994.53  $29,175.00  $26,180.47
01-03-421 SALARIES FULL-TIME $20,219.74  $147,492.81  §$223,856.00 $76,363.19
01-03-422 SALARIES PART-TIME $851.50 $4,810.00 $8,112.00 $3,302.00
01-03-451 HEALTH INSURANCE $4,185.33 $32,754.55 $54,145.00 $21,390.45
01-03-461 SOCIAL SECURITY $1,605.79 $12,084.79 $17,746.00 $5,661.21
01-03-462 IMRF $924.04 $6,740.29 $10,230.00 $3,489.71
01-03-532 AUDITING SERVICES $.00 $8,700.00 $12,600.00 $3,900.00
01-03-534 LEGAL SERVICES $2,530.50 $13,424.85 $24,000.00 $10,575.15
01-03-536 DATA PROCESSING SERVICES $5,300.75 $10,866.86 $16,200.00 §5,333.14
01-03-539 CODIFICATION $500.00 $1,462.00 $1,500.00 $38.00
01-03-551 POSTAGE $124.80 $1,098.97 $1,950.00 $851.03
01-03-552 TELEPHONE $593.34 $4,323.86 $7,120.00 $2,796.14
01-03-555 COPYING AND PRINTING $1,976.73 $4,211.85 $4,750.00 $538.15
01-03-558 LEGAL NOTICES $.00 $1,798.50 $2,525.00 $726.50
01-03-561 DUES AND PUBLICATIONS $.00 $.00 $1,290.00 $1,290.00
01-03-566 MEETING EXPENSES $.00 $.00 $250.00 $250.00
01-03-567 PROFESSIONAL DEVELOPMENT $530.00 $1,470.50 $4,000.00 $2,529.50
01-03-595 OTHER CONTRACTUAL SERV $686.25 $2,051.55 $2,220.00 $168.45
01-03-651 OFFICE SUPPLIES $.00 $1,044.22 $1,750.00 $705.78
01-03-830 NEW EQUIPMENT $.00 $8,899.83 $8,900.00 $.17
Department 03 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
EXpenses $40,028.77 $263,235.43  $403,144.00 $139,908.57
01-04-595 OTHER CONTRACTUAL SERVICES $7,010.00 $34,506.06 $39,000.00 $4,493.94
Department 04 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Expenses $7,010.00 $34,506.06 $39,000.00 $4,493.94
01-05-422 PART-TIME SALARIES $.00 $3,619.53 $7,618.00 $3,998.47
01-05-461 SOCIAL SECURITY $.00 §276.88 $583.00 $306.12
01-05-471 UNIFORMS $.00 $748.17 $1,000.00 $251.83
01-05-512 MAINT SERVICE - EQUIP. $.00 $1,720.00 $2,556.00 $836.00
01-05-513 MAINT SERVICE - VEHICLES $.00 $982.25 $2,500.00 $1,517.75
01-05-561 DUES AND PUBLICATIONS $100.00 $100.00 $200.00 $100.00
01-05-563 TRAINING (ESDA) $.00 $314.76 $500.00 $185.24
01-05-595 OTHER PROFESSIONAL SERVICES $.00 $2,250.00 $2,600.00 $350.00
01-05-652 FIELD SUPPLIES $.00 $155.96 $1,000.00 $844.04
Department 05 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Expenses $100.00 $10,167.55 $18,557.00 $8,389.45
01-06-421 SALARIES FULL-TIME $69,342.43  §$553,356.80  $826,382.00  $273,025.20
01-06-422 SALARIES PART-TIME $4,378.50 $47,321.00 $73,560.00  $26,239.00
01-06-423 OVERTIME $15,265.27  $102,721.79  $136,020.00 $33,298.21
01-06-451 HEALTH INSURANCE $15,217.88 $93,747.77  $157,930.00 $64,182.23
01-06-461 SOCIAL SECURITY $6,636.47 $52,486.14 $79,251.00 $26,764.86
01-06-462 IMRF $3,956.36 $31,205.85 $45,993.00 $14,787.15
01-06-471 UNIFORM ALLOWANCE $366.00 $5,372.29 $12,800.00 $7,427.71
01-06-513 MAINT. SERVICE - VEHICLES $604.85 $4,371.35 $15,445.00 $11,073.65

Page 2 Generated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/L Number G/L Title FY 23 Month's FY 23 Fiscal YTD FY 23 Budget FY 23 FIY
Activity Activity Over/Under
01-06-521 MAINT. SERVICE - EQUIP $1,796.54 $10,020.09 $16,415.00 $6,394.91
01-06-534 LEGAL SERVICES $1,162.50 $7,850.13 $18,000.00 $10,149.87
01-06-536 DATA PROCESSING SERVICES $262.50 $3,412.50 $25,200.00 $21,787.50
01-06-549 OTHER PROFESSIONAL SERVICES $75.00 $4,593.99 $9,700.00 $5,106.01
01-06-551 POSTAGE $.00 $.00 $950.00 $950.00
01-06-552 TELEPHONE $666.67 $4,593.30 $8,000.00 $3,406.70
01-06-555 COPYING AND PRINTING $.00 $562.90 $1,200.00 $637.10
01-06-556 DISPATCHING SERVICES $10,837.40 $75,861.80  $132,758.00 $56,896.20
01-06-561 DUES AND PUBLICATIONS $790.00 $2,338.59 $9,060.00 $6,721.41
01-06-563 TRAINING $.00 $5,557.13 $13,490.00 $7,932.87
01-06-566 MEETING EXPENSES $.00 $.00 $300.00 $300.00
01-06-567 PROFESSIONAL DEVELOPMENT $.00 $.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
01-06-613 MAINT. SUPPLIES - VEHICLES $.00 $2,421.90 $3,400.00 $978.10
01-06-651 OFFICE SUPPLIES $157.13 $1,735.50 $2,000.00 $264.50
01-06-652 FIELD SUPPLIES $891.09 $8,798.83 $15,950.00 $7,151.17
01-06-656 UNLEADED FUEL $2,728.05 $22,663.20 $44,352.00 $21,688.80
01-06-820 BUILDING $.00 $.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
01-06-830 NEW EQUIPMENT $.00 $14,916.40 $47,083.00 $32,166.60
01-06-840 NEW VEHICLE $1,167.02 $81,167.02 $80,000.00 -$1,167.02
01-06-929 MISC EXPENSES $.00 $.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00
Department 06 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
EXxpenses $136,301.66 $1,137,076.27 $1,833,239.00 $696,162.73
01-07-538 MOSQUITO ABATEMENT SERV $.00 $2,022.99 $9,700.00 $7,677.01
01-07-595 OTHER CONTRACTUAL SERV $.00 $.00 $1,950.00 $1,950.00
Department 07 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
EXpenses $.00 $2,022.99 $11,650.00 $9,627.01
01-08-421 SALARIES FULL-TIME $6,668.38 $51,931.09 $90,334.00 $38,402.91
01-08-422 SALARIES PART-TIME $.00 $8,895.00 $15,000.00 $6,105.00
01-08-423 OVERTIME $1,248.45 $8,460.88 $11,727.00 $3,266.12
01-08-451 HEALTH INSURANCE $1,990.00 $8,340.24 $24,064.00 $15,723.76
01-08-461 SOCIAL SECURITY $576.26 $5,076.90 $8,955.00 $3,878.10
01-08-462 IMRF $361.80 $2,760.18 $4,664.00 $1,903.82
01-08-512 MAINT. SERVICE - EQUIPMENT $1,863.53 $2,925.00 $2,925.00 $.00
01-08-513 MAINT. SERVICE - VEHICLES $7,161.23 $15,855.73 $25,944.00 $10,088.27
01-08-514 MAINT. SERVICE - STREET $100.00 $10,229.38 $17,600.00 $7,370.62
01-08-533 ENGINEERING $.00 $1,987.50 $2,900.00 $912.50
01-08-572 STREET LIGHTING $9,189.84 $63,243.73  $113,763.00 $50,519.27
01-08-576 RENTALS $755.96 $6,213.63 $10,211.00 $3,997.37
01-08-612 MAINT. SUPPLIES EQUIPMENT $581.64 $2,624.11 $3,200.00 $575.89
01-08-613 MAINT. SUPPLIES - VEHICLES $48.07 $1,042.36 $3,500.00 $2,457.64
01-08-614 MAINT. SUPPLIES - STREET $1,254.49 $15,890.97 $29,110.00 $13,219.03
01-08-653 SMALL TOOLS $.00 $.00 $500.00 $500.00
01-08-656 UNLEADED FUEL $2,224.15 $21,049,88 $46,092.00 $25,042.12
01-08-830 CAPITAL OUTLAY- EQUIP. $.00 $12,201.00 $18,751.00 $6,550.00
Department 08 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Expenses $34,023.80 $238,727.58 $429,240.00 $190,512.42
01-09-511 MAINT. SERVICE - BUILDING $1,083.00 $6,203.80 $16,350.00 $10,146.20
01-09-611 MAINT. SUPPLIES - BUILDING $.00 $91.87 $1,200.00 $1,108.13

Page 3 Generated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/L Number G/L Title FY 23 Month's FY 23 Fiscal YTD FY 23 Budget FY 23 F/Y
Activity Activity Over/Under
01-09-654 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES $197.79 $446.73 $1,200.00 $753.27
01-09-820 BUILDING $.00 $7,028.21 $8,560.00 $1,531.79
01-09-821 DEPOT RENT $.00 $2,344.51 $2,356.00 $11.49
Department 09 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Expenses $1,280.79 $16,115.12 $29,666.00 $13,550.88
01-10-820 CAPITAL OUTLAY - BUILDING $.00 $43,561.75  $180,000.00  $136,438.25
01-10-830 CAPITAL OUTLAY-EQUIPMENT $.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $.00
01-10-840 CAPITAL PURCHASE - LAND $.00 -$19.81 $.00 $19.81
01-10-860 CAPITAL OUTLAY-INFRASTRUCT. $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Department 10 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Expenses $.00 $93,541.94 $230,000.00 $136,458.06
01-11-451 HEALTH INSURANCE $953.09 $7,179.76  $14,358.00 $7,178.24
01-11-453 UNEMPLOYMENT INSURANCE $540.72 $4,890.38 $15,077.00 $10,186.62
01-11-534 LEGAL SERVICES $.00 $19,034.99 $20,000.00 $965.01
01-11-549 OTHER PROFESSIONAL SERVICES $.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $.00
01-11-592 COMPREHENSIVE INSURANCE $97,054.00 $97,054.00  $97,054.00 $.00
01-11-595 OTHER CONTRACTUAL SERV $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
01-11-730 FISCAL AGENT FEES $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $.00
01-11-915 PROPERTY TAX REIMB $.00 $1,461.49 $1,925.00 $463.51
01-11-954 INTERFUND TRANS- GO BOND ACCT $75,075.00 $85,018.55 $85,150.00 $131.45
01-11-955 INTERFUND TRANS-CAP EQUIP $.00 $21,212.00 $21,212.00 $.00
01-11-956 INTERFUND TRANS - ARPA $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Department 11 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Expenses $175,622.81 $241,851.17 $260,776.00 $18,924.83
01-13-422 SALARIES PART-TIME $.00 $6,345.00 $9,690.00 $3,345.00
01-13-461 SOCIAL SECURITY $.00 §.00 $742.00 $742.00
01-13-515 MAINT SERVICE - PARKS $.00 $1,896.64 $8,900.00 $7,003.36
01-13-549 OTHER PROFESSIONAL SERVICES $1,569.68 $13,878.22 $15,000.00 $1,121.78
01-13-571 ELECTRIC POWER $62.61 $935.03 $2,250.00 $1,314.97
01-13-595 CONTRACTUAL SERVICES $.00 $4,155.00 $4,155.00 $.00
01-13-614 MAINT SUPPLIES - PARKS $.00 $394.84 $3,300.00 $2,905.16
01-13-715 DEBT SERVICE-SPLASH PAD LOAN $.00 $17,493.24 $29,296.00  $11,802.76
01-13-860 CAPITAL OUTLAY-PARKS $.00 $81,114.20 $88,785.00 $7,670.80
Department 13 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Expenses $1,632.29 $126,212.17 $162,118.00 $35,905.83
Fund 01 Totals
Revenues $161,470.97 $2,516,212.68 $3,506,734.00 -$990,521.32
Expenses $396,479.12 $2,183,668.47 $3,506,734.00 $1,323,065.53

Page 4 Generated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/L Number

02-00-354
02-00-381
02-00-389
02-00-393
02-00-396

02-10-393
02-10-951

G/LTitle

ARPA ENTRANCHMENTS
ARPA FUND INTEREST INCOME
MISCELLANEOUS INCOME
INTERFUND OPERATING TRANS
RESERVE CASH
Department 00 Totals
Revenues
Expenses
INTERFUND TRANSFERS
CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT CONTRIB
Department 10 Totals
Revenues
Expenses
Fund 02 Totals
Revenues
EXpenses

FY 23 Month's

Activity

$.00
$.00
$.00
$.00
$.00

$.00
$.00
$.00
$.00

FY 23 Fiscal YTD
Activity

$301,223.38
$1,420.39
$.00

$.00

$.00

$302,643.77
$.00

$.00
$59,505.20

$.00
$59,505.20

$302,643.77
$59,505.20

Page 5 Gencrated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25

FY 23 Budget

$304,000.00
$1,900.00
$.00

$.00
$304,000.00

$609,900.00
$.00

$300,000.00
$309,900.00

$.00
$609,900.00

$609,900.00
$609,900.00

FY 23 F/Y
Over/Under

-$2,776.62
-$479.61
$.00

$.00
-$304,000.00

-$307,256.23
$.00

$300,000.00
$250,394.80

$.00
$550,394.80

-$307,256.23
$550,394.80



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022
625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

Activity Activity Over/Under
11-00-381 CESFA INTEREST INCOME $.00 $101.44 $100.00 $1.44
11-00-392 PROCEEDS - FIXED ASSET SALES $.00 $7,151.00 $.00 $7,151.00
11-00-393 INTERFUND TRANSFERS $.00 $65,135.00 $65,135.00 $.00
11-00-396 RESERVE CASH $.00 $.00 $4,765.00 -$4,765.00
Department 00 Totals
Revenues $.00 $72,387.44 $70,000.00 $2,387.44
EXpenses $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
11-11-800 REPAIRS/MAINTENANCE $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
11-11-830 CAPITAL OUTLAY - EQUIPMENT $.00 $65,256.18 $70,000.00 $4,743.82
Department 11 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Expenses $.00 $65,256.18 $70,000.00 $4,743.82
Fund 11 Totals
Revenues $.00 $72,387.44  $70,000.00 $2,387.44
EXpenses $.00 $65,256.18 $70,000.00 $4,743.82

Page 6 Generated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/L Number G/LTitle FY 23 Month's FY 23 Fiscal YTD FY 23 Budget FY 23 F/Y
Activity Activity Over/Under
12-00-377 REFUSE CHARGES $12,228.93  $260,168.51  $399,495.00 -$139,326.49
12-00-381 REFUSE FUND INTEREST INCOME $.00 $272.80 $500.00 -$227.20
12-00-389 MISCELLANEQUS INCOME $.00 $1,020.95 $1,200.00 -$179.05
12-00-396 RESERVE CASH $.00 $.00 $6,454.00 -$6,454.00
Department 00 Totals
Revenues $12,228.93  $261,462.26 $407,649.00 -$146,186.74
Expenses $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
12-07-573 REFUSE DISPOSAL §31,148.32  $245,322.38  $372,859.00  $127,536.62
12-07-574 CREDIT CARD USER FEES $.00 $3,662.62 $7,200.00 $3,537.38
12-07-578 YARD WASTE BAGS $.00 $.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00
12-07-953 INTERFUND OPERAT TRANS $.00 $.00 $26,390.00 $26,390.00
Department 07 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Expenses $31,148.32  $248,985.00 $407,649.00 $158,664.00
Fund 12 Totals
Revenues $12,228.93 $261,462.26  $407,649.00 -$146,186.74
EXpenses $31,148.32 $248,985.00 $407,649.00 $158,664.00

Page 7 Generated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/L Number G/LTitle FY 23 Month's FY 23 Fiscal YTD FY 23 Budget FY 23 F/Y
Activity Activity Over/Under
13-00-311 TIF REAL ESTATE TAX DISTRIB $1,374.68 $49,773.00 $70,000.00 -$20,227.00
13-00-381 TIF FUND INTEREST INCOME $.00 $96.65 $500.00 -$403.35
Department 00 Totals
Revenues $1,374.68 $49,869.65 $70,500.00 -$20,630.35
Expenses $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
13-11-915 TIF DISBURSEMENTS $.00  $57,000.00  $70,500.00  $13,500.00
Department 11 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Expenses $.00  $57,000.00  $70,500.00  $13,500.00
Fund 13 Totals
Revenues $1,374.68 $49,869.65 $70,500.00 -$20,630.35
Expenses $.00  $57,000.00  $70,500.00  $13,500.00

Page 8 Gencrated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/L Number

14-00-344
14-00-345
14-00-354
14-00-381
14-00-395
14-00-396

14-08-533
14-08-614

14-10-861
14-10-951

G/L Title

MOTOR FUEL TAX
MFT - NEW COLLECTIONS
IDOT SAFE ROUTES TO SCHOOLS
INTEREST
MFT ANTICIPATION NOTES
MFT RESERVE CASH
Department 00 Totals
Revenues
EXpenses
ENGINEERING
MAINT. SUPPLIES - STREET
Department 08 Totals
Revenues
Expenses
CAPITAL PROJECTS
CAPITAL RESERVE CONTRIBUTION
Department 10 Totals
Revenues
Expenses
Fund 14 Totals
Revenues
EXpenses

FY 23 Month's
Activity

$6,986.64
$9,096.35
$.00
$.00
$.00
$.00

$16,082.99
$.00

$.00
$6,822.36

$.00
$6,822.36
$.00

$.00

$.00
§.00

$16,082.99
§6,822.36

FY 23 Fiscal YTD FY 23 Budget FY 23 F/Y
Activity Over/Under

$52,489.49  $108,399.00  -$55,909.51
$117,957.97  $175,409.00 -$57,451.03
$.00 $250,000.00 -$250,000.00
$2,951.60 $1,500.00 $1,451.60
$.00 $650,000.00 -$650,000.00

$.00 $267,242.00 -$267,242.00

$173,399.06 $1,452,550.00-$1,279,150.94
$.00 $.00 $.00

$1,250.00 $36,900.00 $35,650.00
$13,249.23 $99,000.00 $85,750.77

$.00 $.00 $.00
$14,499.23  $135,900.00 $121,400.77

$.00  $250,000.00  $250,000.00
$.00 $1,066,650.00 $1,066,650.00

$.00 $.00 $.00
$.00 $1,316,650.00 $1,316,650.00

$173,399.06 $1,452,550.00-$1,279,150.94
$14,499.23 $1,452,550.00 $1,438,050.77

Page 9 Generated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/L.Number G/L Title FY 23 Month's FY 23 Fiscal YTD FY 23 Budgct FY 23 F/Y
Activity Activity Over/Under
15-00-381 PD CESFA INTEREST INCOME $.00 $355.04 $250.00 $105.04
15-00-393 INTERFUND TRANSFERS $.00  $130,000.00  $130,000.00 §.00
Department 00 Totals
Revenues $.00 $130,355.04 $130,250.00 $105.04
Expenses $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
15-15-830 CAPITAL OUTLAY - EQUIPMENT $.00  $82,250.50  $80,000.00  -$2,250.50
15-15-957 CAPITAL RESERVE CONTRIB $.00 $.00  $50,250.00  $50,250.00
Department 15 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Expenses $.00 $82,250.50  $130,250.00 $47,999.50
Fund 15 Totals
Revenues $.00 $130,355.04  $130,250.00 $105.04
Expenses $.00 $82,250.50  $130,250.00 $47,999.50

Page 10 Generated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/L.Number G/L Title FY 23 Month's FY 23 Fiscal YTD FY 23 Budget FY 23 F/Y
Activity Activity Over/Under
16-00-358 JOINT FUEL FUND REIMBURSEMENTS $17,220.65  $166,894.21  $257,950.00 -$91,055.79
16-00-381 INTEREST $.00 $70.47 $.00 $70.47
Department 00 Totals
Revenues $17,220.65 $166,964.68 $257,950.00 -$90,985.32
Expenses $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
16-12-577 FUEL PAYMENTS $21,354.07  $174,784.56  $257,950.00 $83,165.44
Department 12 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Expenses $21,354.07 $174,784.56  $257,950.00 $83,165.44

Fund 16 Totals
Revenues $17,220.65 $166,964.68 $257,950.00 -$90,985.32

Expenses $21,354.07 $174,784.56  $257,950.00 $83,165.44

Page 11 Generated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/L Number G/LTitle FY 23 Month's FY 23 Fiscal YTD FY 23 Budget FY 23 FiY
Activity Activity Over/Under
18-00-381 GO BOND INTEREST INCOME $.00 $6.14 $.00 $6.14
18-00-393 INTERFUND OPERATING TRANS $75,075.00 $75,075.00 $85,150.00 -$10,075.00
18-00-710 PRINCIPAL & INTEREST $75,075.00 $75,075.00 $85,150.00 $10,075.00
18-00-711 INTEREST $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Department 00 Totals
Revenues $75,075.00 $75,081.14 $85,150.00 -$10,068.86
EXpenses $75,075.00  $75,075.00  $85,150.00  $10,075.00
Fund 18 Totals
Revenues $75,075.00 $75,081.14 $85,150.00 -$10,068.86
Expenses $75,075.00 $75,075.00 $85,150.00 $10,075.00

Page 12 Generated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/L Number G/L Title FY 23 Month's FY 23 Fiscal YTD FY 23 Budget FY 23 FIY
Activity Activity Over/Under
19-00-346 1/2 PERCENT INFRASTRUCTURE SALES $17,479.29  $143,012.24  $203,512.00 -$60,499.76
19-00-355 GRANT REVENUE $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
19-00-356 PENFIELD ST STP PE II REIMB $.00 $25,687.95  $384,800.00 -$359,112.05
19-00-357 DCEO MAIN ST ARPA GRANT $.00 $.00 $1,300,000.00-$1,300,000.00
19-00-381 INTEREST INCOME $.00 $1,626.31 $1,000.00 $626.31
19-00-396 RESERVE CASH $.00 $.00 $356,688.00 -$356,688.00
Department 00 Totals
Revenues $17,479.29 $170,326.50 $2,246,000.00-$2,075,673.50
Expenses $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
19-19-533 ENGINEERING $.00 $.00  $481,000.00 $481,000.00
19-19-600 OPERATING LEASE $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
19-19-860 CAPITAL OUTLAY - LAND $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
19-19-861 CAPITAL OUTLAY - INFRA. $143,837.00  $150,077.00 $1,765,000.00 $1,614,923.00
Department 19 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Expenses $143,837.00 $150,077.00 $2,246,000.00 $2,095,923.00
Fund 19 Totals
Revenues $17,479.29  $170,326.50 $2,246,000.00-$2,075,673.50
EXpenses $143,837.00 $150,077.00 $2,246,000.00 $2,095,923.00

Page 13 Generated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/L Number G/L Title FY 23 Month's FY 23 Fiscal YTD FY 23 Budget FY 23 F/Y
Activity Activity Over/Under
51-00-371 WATER CHARGES $26,159.63  $648,907.91  $935,796.00 -$286,888.09
51-00-375 WATER SERVICE CONNECTION FEES $160.00 $4,010.00 $5,700.00 -$1,690.00
51-00-381 INTEREST INCOME $.00 $476.85 $1,000.00 -$523.15
51-00-387 RENTAL INCOME $225.00 $1,800.00 $2,700.00 -$900.00
51-00-389 MISCELLANEQUS INCOME $400.00 $3,200.00 $9,700.00 -$6,500.00
51-00-390 IPBC TERMINAL RESERVE $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
51-00-396 RESERVE CASH $.00 $.00 $2,957.00 -$2,957.00
Department 00 Totals
Revenues $26,944.63 $658,394.76  $957,853.00 -$299,458.24
EXpenses $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
51-20-421 SALARIES FULL-TIME $22,643.14  $181,216.68  $260,201.00 $78,984.32
51-20-423 SALARIES OVERTIME $854.37 $15,693.32 $16,963.00 $1,269.68
51-20-451 HEALTH INSURANCE $5,388.49 $39,909.26 $57,271.00 $17,361.74
51-20-461 SOCIAL SECURITY $1,727.29 $14,477.94 $21,203.00 $6,725.06
51-20-462 IMRF $1,073.83 $8,998.70 $12,667.00 $3,668.30
51-20-471 UNIFORMS $435.00 $435.00 $.00 -$435.00
51-20-513 MAINT. SERVICE- VEHICLES $.00 $2,465.18 $4,500.00 $2,034.82
51-20-517 MAINT. SERVICE - WATER SYSTEM $3,900.00 $9,964.01 $25,800.00 $15,835.99
51-20-532 AUDIT $.00 $6,300.00 $6,300.00 $.00
51-20-534 LEGAL SERVICES $.00 $.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00
51-20-536 DATA PROCESSING SERVICES $.00 $2,440.00 $5,700.00 $3,260.00
51-20-537 LABORATORY ANALYSIS $286.68 $2,153.35 $5,120.00 $2,966.65
51-20-551 POSTAGE $33.22 $1,153.63 $2,200.00 $1,046.37
51-20-552 TELEPHONE $298.45 $2,379.63 $4,700.00 $2,320.37
51-20-561 DUES AND PUBLICATIONS $.00 $404.56 $990.00 $585.44
51-20-563 TRAINING $570.00 $3,071.00 $3,120.00 $49.00
51-20-571 ELECTRIC POWER $2,600.76 $15,311.90 $26,500.00 $11,188.10
51-20-574 NATURAL GAS $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
51-20-592 COMPREHENSIVE INSURANCE $48,527.00 $48,527.00 $48,527.00 $.00
51-20-595 OTHER PROFESSIONAL SERVICES $.00 $744.11 $1,300.00 $555.89
51-20-599 DEPRECIATION EXPENSE $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
51-20-611 MAINT. SUPPLIES - BUILDING $.00 $357.16 $350.00 -$7.16
51-20-616 MAINT. SUPPLIES-WATER SYSTEM $599.04 $54,961.86 $60,299.00 $5,337.14
51-20-651 OFFICE SUPPLIES $.00 $1,516.81 $1,900.00 $383.19
51-20-653 SMALL TOOLS $.00 $.00 $500.00 $500.00
51-20-657 DIESEL FUEL $.00 $.00 $600.00 $600.00
51-20-659 CHEMICALS $130.00 $25,024.34 $38,050.00 $13,025.66
51-20-830 CAPITAL OUTLAY - EQUIPMENT $.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $.00
51-20-953 INTERFUND TRANS $.00 $173,910.00  $313,892.00 $139,982.00
Department 20 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
EXpenses $89,067.27 $646,415.44  $957,853.00 $311,437.56
Fund 51 Totals
Revenues $26,944.63 $658,394.76  $957,853.00 -$299,458.24
Expenses $89,067.27 $646,415.44  $957,853.00 $311,437.56

Page 14 Generated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/L Number G/L Title FY 23 Month's FY 23 Fiscal YTD FY 23 Budget FY 23 F/Y
Activity Activity Over/Under
52-00-372 SEWER CHARGES $16,342.68  $391,415.89  §$588,530.00 -$197,114.11
52-00-373 LIFT STATION CHARGES $484.41 $9,680.93 $14,900.00 -$5,219.07
52-00-374 DEBT SERVICES CHARGES $3,160.63 $72,435.97  $113,100.00 -$40,664.03
52-00-381 INTEREST INCOME $.00 $60.10 $.00 $60.10
52-00-389 MISC. INCOME $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
52-00-390 IPBC TERMINAL RESERVE $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Department 00 Totals
Revenues $19,987.72  $473,592.89 $716,530.00 -$242,937.11
EXpenses $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
52-21-421 SALARIES FULL-TIME $17,224.28  $135,348.48  $157,227.00 $21,878.52
52-21-422 SALARIES PART-TIME $.00 $1,755.00 $.00 -$1,755.00
52-21-423 OVERTIME $1,274.67 $16,162.56 $20,410.00 $4,247.44
52-21-451 HEALTH INSURANCE $3,822.07 $32,280.22 $36,096.00 $3,815.78
52-21-461 SOCIAL SECURITY $1,358.83 $11,280.34 $13,589.00 $2,308.66
52-21-462 IMRF $845.39 $6,924.01 $8,118.00 $1,193.99
52-21-471 UNIFORM ALLOWANCE $517.71 $7,121.25 $10,400.00 $3,278.75
52-21-512 MAINT. SERVICE - EQUIPMENT $192.50 $15,072.65 $14,900.00 -$172.65
52-21-513 MAINT. SERVICE - VEHICLES $.00 $508.44 $1,400.00 $891.56
52-21-518 MAINT SERVICE SEWER SYSTEM $.00 $6,953.07 $22,200.00 $15,246.93
52-21-532 AUDIT $.00 $6,300.00 $6,300.00 $.00
52-21-533 ENGINEERING $.00 $840.00 $2,900.00 $2,060.00
52-21-534 LEGAL SERVICES $.00 $2,646.25 $4,200.00 $1,553.75
52-21-536 DATA PROCESSING SERVICES $.00 $2,045.11 $5,700.00 $3,654.89
52-21-537 LABORATORY ANALYSIS $835.70 $20,992.48 $27,200.00 $6,207.52
52-21-549 OTHER PROFESSIONAL SERVICES $800.00 $1,133.00 $1,950.00 $817.00
52-21-551 POSTAGE $33.22 $1,153.62 $1,700.00 $546.38
52-21-552 TELEPHONE $254.12 $1,417.96 $1,920.00 $502.04
52-21-562 IEPA PERMIT FEES $.00 $18,500.00 $18,500.00 $.00
52-21-563 TRAINING $.00 $40.00 $900.00 $860.00
52-21-571 ELECTRICAL POWER $2,566.60 $29,014.04 $63,697.00 $34,682.96
52-21-574 NATURAL GAS $679.49 $3,817.56 $5,900.00 $2,082.44
52-21-592 COMPREHENSIVE INSURANCE $47,716.00 $47,716.00 $48,527.00 $811.00
52-21-595 OTHER PROFESSIONAL SERV $.00 $13,980.49 $47,500.00 $33,519.51
52-21-611 MAINT. SUPPLIES - BUILDING $.00 $390.94 $500.00 $109.06
52-21-612 MAINT. SUPPLIES - EQUIPMENT $.00 $2,513.85 $2,700.00 $186.15
52-21-616 METER REPLACEMENT PROGRAM $.00 §.00 $.00 $.00
52-21-617 MAINT. SUPPLIES-SEWER SYSTEM $.00 $11,032.52 $10,900.00 -$132.52
52-21-651 OFFICE SUPPLIES $266.66 $433.66 $900.00 $466.34
52-21-657 DIESEL FUEL $.00 $451.30 $3,500.00 $3,048.70
52-21-659 CHEMICALS $90.12 $13,305.88 $34,307.00  $21,001.12
52-21-830 CAPITAL OUTLAY- EQUIPMENT $4,655.32 $21,028.28 $24,517.00 $3,488.72
52-21-953 INTERFUND TRANS $.00 $4,872.00 $117,972.00  $113,100.00
Department 21 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
EXpenses $83,132.68 $437,030.96 $716,530.00 $279,499.04
Fund 52 Totals
Revenues $19,987.72 $473,592.89 $716,530.00 -$242,937.11
Expenses $83,132.68 $437,030.96 $716,530.00 $279,499.04

Page 15 Generated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/L Number G/L Title FY 23 Month's FY 23 Fiscal YTD FY 23 Budget FY 23 F/Y
Activity Activity Over/Under
53-00-381 WATER-SEWER CAPITAL INTEREST $.00 $107.86 $.00 $107.86
53-00-396 RESERVE CASH - CAPITAL $.00 $.00 $10,500.00 -$10,500.00
Department 00 Totals
Revenues $.00 $107.86 $10,500.00 -$10,392.14
Expenses $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
53-22-393 INTERFUND TRANSFERS $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
53-22-535 PLANNING SERVICES $663.13 $972.22 $6,000.00 $5,027.78
53-22-595 OTHER PROFESSIONAL SERVICES $.00 $2,500.00 $4,500.00 $2,000.00
53-22-600 INTEREST $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Department 22 Totals
Revenues $.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
Expenses $663.13 $3,472.22 $10,500.00 $7,027.78
Fund 53 Totals
Revenues $.00 $107.86  $10,500.00 -$10,392.14
Expenses $663.13 $3,472.22 $10,500.00 $7,027.78

Page 16 Generated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/LNumber

54-00-336
54-00-346
54-00-381
54-00-393
54-00-394

54-22-533
54-22-534
54-22-535
54-22-616
54-22-713
54-22-830
54-22-953

G/LTitle

WATER-SEWER FUND UTILITY TAX
HALF PERCENT SALES TX FOR WWTP
INTEREST INCOME
TRANSFER FROM WATER FUND
TRANSFER FROM SEWER FUND
Department 00 Totals
Revenues
Expenses

ENGINEERING SERVICES
LEGAL SERVICES
REPAIRS & MAINTENANCE
METER REPLACEMENT PROGRAM
2018 IEPA LOAN
CAPITAL OUTLAY - EQUIPMENT
INTERFUND TRANSFERS
Department 22 Totals
Revenues
Expenses
Fund 54 Totals

Revenues
Expenses

FY 23 Month's
Activity

$18,627.69
$17,479.29
$.00
$.00
$.00

$36,106.98
$.00

$.00
$.00
$.00
$.00
$.00
$.00
$.00

$.00
$.00

$36,106.98
$.00

FY 23 Fiscal YTD FY 23 Budget FY 23 FIY
Activity Over/Under

$153,360.74  §195,000.00 -$41,639.26
$143,012.21  $203,512.00  -$60,499.79
$3,253.70 $2,800.00 $453.70
$.00 $10,362.00  -$10,362.00

$.00  $113,100.00 -$113,100.00

$299,626.65 $524,774.00 -$225,147.35

$.00 $.00 $.00
$862.50 $.00 -$862.50
$11,720.54 $13,952.00 $2,231.46
§$.00 $.00 $.00

$.00 $.00 $.00
$201,438.61  $402,878.00  $201,439.39
$.00 $.00 $.00

§.00 $107,944.00  $107,944.00

$.00 $.00 $.00
$214,021.65 $524,774.00 $310,752.35

$299,626.65 $524,774.00 -$225,147.35
$214,021.65 $524,774.00 $310,752.35

Page 17 Generated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/L Number

55-00-381
55-00-389
55-00-393
55-00-394
55-00-395
55-00-396
55-00-397

55-21-422
55-21-533
55-21-714
55-21-830
55-21-861

G/LTitle

WATERMAIN REPL FUND INTEREST INC

MISC INCOME

INTERFUND TRANS
LOAN PROCEEDS - IEPA DRINK WAT
DCEO CAPITAL BILL GRANT

RESERVE CASH
IEPA GRANT

FY 23 Month's FY23 Fiscal YTD  FY 23 Budget FY 23 F/Y
Activity Activity Over/Under
$.00 $1,281.76 $405.00 $876.76
$.00 $805.56 $.00 $805.56
$.00 $139,506.00  $499,126.00 -$359,620.00
$243,515.88  $956,753.98 $4,372,000.00-%3,415,246.02
§.00 $966,719.41  $967,000.00 -$280.59
§$.00 $.00 $65,420.00  -$65,420.00
$.00 $.00 $.00 $.00

Department 00 Totals
Revenues
Expenses

SALARIES PART-TIME
ENGINEERING
DEBT SERV - 2017 IEPA LOAN
CAPITAL OUTLAY - EQUIPMENT
CAPITAL OUTLAY-WATERMAINS
Department 21 Totals
Revenues
Expenses
Fund 55 Totals
Revenues
Expenses

$243,515.88 $2,065,066.71 $5,903,951.00-$3,838,884.29

$.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
$.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
$.00 $134,419.59  $611,200.00 $476,780.41
$.00 $32,651.99 $65,304.00  $32,652.01
$.00 $4,647.00 $4,647.00 $.00

$201,965.88 $1,868,736.11 $5,222,800.00 $3,354,063.89

$.00 $.00 $.00 $.00
$201,965.88 $2,040,454.69 $5,903,951.00 $3,863,496.31

$243,515.88 $2,065,066.71 $5,903,951.00-$3,838,884.29
$201,965.88 $2,040,454.69 $5,903,951.00 $3,863,496.31

Page 18 Generated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Village of Beecher VARIANCE REPORT for Dec of 2022

625 Dixie Hwy Beecher IL 60401

G/L Number G/L Title FY 23 Month's FY 23 Fiscal YTD FY 23 Budget FY 23 F/Y
Activity Activity Over/Under

Grand Totals
Revenues $627,487.72 $7,415,491.09$16,950,291.00-$9,534,799.91
Expenses $1,049,544.83 $6,452,496.10$16,950,291.00§10,497,794.90

Page 19 Gencerated by the Locis Software...(GBC) printed 01/05/23 08:25



Lightmart

LisutMarT.com 1881 Rose Road Q
i3 e Lake Zurich IL 60047 United States u Ote
#QUO18021

(,_ 11/22/2022
Bill To TOTAL

Joe Gianotti
Village Of Beecher

égiggxegalzdé%ioﬁraiﬁtgg/gtates $1 9, 266.00

(708) 946-2261 Expires: 1/18/2022

Expires Exp. Close Shipping Method
1/18/2022 11/22/2022
QTY Item Options Rate Amount
15 15A455125-Tenon-DBZ $745.00 $11,175.00

15 Foot 4 Inch Square Straight Aluminum Light Pole,
125, Anchor Base, Dark Bronze

15 10034 $151.00 $2,265.00
Low Profile Steel Bullhorn with 2 Tenons, Inline, Dark
Bronze
30 SBOX80 $228.00 $6,840.00
( 80 Watt LED Shoebox Light, 11200 Lumens, 5000K,
Type 3, 100-277V, ---- Dark Bronze Finish

--1lens -

---- Mounting Bracket is separate ---

30  SBOX-LENS4 $0.00 $0.00
Type 4 Lgns for SBOX Series Lights
1 FSH $0.00 $0.00

Free Shipping
Estimated to Ship: 6 Weeks

1 Discount ($1,014.00) ($1,014.00)
Subtotal $19,266.00

Tax Total (%) $0.00

Total $19,266.00

DELIVERY INFORMATION: Lightmart and its freight carriers do not unload products. Unloading is the sole responsibility of the
recipient and/or customer and recipient and/or customer is required to provide all necessary equipment and/or manpower at
the time of delivery. DELIVERY CLAIMS: Claims must be made within 7 days of delivery to avoid claim denial. Please make sure
allitems are received in good condition and that there is no concealed damage prior to signing for the delivery. Notation of
damage must be made on the carrier's delivery document. RETURNS: New products with their packaging intact may be
returned at customer's expense only if you notify us in writing within 14 days of receipt of product and you obtain a Return

k\ Authorization number. A minimum restocking fee of 25% will' apply to all returns. All poles, brackets, and custom or built-to-
order products are NON-RETURNABLE and NON-REFUNDABLE.

AN AR RR RN

QUO18021



c

LisutMagT.com 1551 Roge Road Q uote

ey Lake Zurich IL 60047 United States
#QUO18516
12/19/2022
Bill To TOTAL
Joe Gianotti
gg!angCOf geec'her k Blvd
2 ardinal Creek Blv
Beecher IL 60401 United States $8,056-00

(708) 946-2261 Expires: 1/18/2023

Expires Exp. Close Shipping Method
1/18/2023 12/19/2022
QTY Item Options Rate Amount
5  15A455125-Tenon-DBZ $745.00 $3,725.00

15 Foot 4 Inch Square Straight Aluminum Light Pole,
.125, Anchor Base, Dark Bronze

5 10035 $267.00 $1,335.00
Low Profile Steel Bullhorn with 3 Tenons, Inline, Dark
Bronze

15 SBOX80 $228.00 $3,420.00

80 Watt LED Shoebox Light, 11200 Lumens, 5000K,
Type 3, 100-277V, ---- Dark Bronze Finish

---1lens ---

---- Mounting Bracket is separate ---

15  SBOX-LENS4 $0.00 $0.00
Type 4 Lens for SBOX Series Lights
1 FSH $0.00 $0.00

Free Shipping
Estimated to Ship: 6 Weeks

1 Discount ($424.00) ($424.00)
Subtotal $8,056.00

Tax Total (%) $0.00

Total $8,056.00

DELIVERY INFORMATION: Lightmart and its freight carriers do not unload products. Unloading is the sole responsibility of the
recipient and/or customer and recipient and/or customer is required to provide all necessary equipment and/or manpower at
the time of delivery. DELIVERY CLAIMS: Claims must be made within 7 days of delivery to avoid claim denial. Please make sure
all items are received in good condition and that there is no concealed damage prior to signing for the delivery. Notation of
damage must be made on the carrier's delivery document. RETURNS: New products with their packaging intact may be
returned at customer's expense only if you notify us in writing within 14 days of receipt of product and you obtain a Return
Authorization number. A minimum restocking fee of 25% will apply to all returns. All poles, brackets, and custom or built-to-
order products are NON-RETURNABLE and NON-REFUNDABLE.

i iy
QUO18516 =

i




Robert Barber

From: Joseph Gianotti

Sent: Wednesday, December 21, 2022 10:.08 AM
To: Robert Barber; Matthew Conner

Subject: FW: KirbyBuilt Sales: Quote# QUOKSA4416

Here's the quote for the picnic tables, benches and trash cans from Kirby.

Joe Gianotti
Village Trustee
Park's and Public Buildings Chairman

———————— Original message --------

From: KirbyBuilt <keyaccounts@kirbybuilt.com>
Date: 12/21/22 9:37 AM (GMT-06:00)

To: Joseph Gianotti <JGianotti@villageofbeecher.org>
Subject: KirbyBuilt Sales: Quote#f QUOKSA4416

Dear Joe,

Thank you for your interest in KirbyBuilt Sales. Below is the quote you have requested. Please advise if any changes are required or
when you are ready to place the order.

We look forward to doing business with you.
Thank you,

Leticia
KirbyBuilt Sales
Key Accounts Rep
630-845-5468
Please review our company's Product Warranty, Shipping Policy, and Return Policy as stated at the bottom of our
website: www.kirbybuilt.com before placing your order.

CKIRBYBUILT Quote

KirbyBuilt Sales Account Number - 320832
222 State Street

Batavia IL 60510 Estimate # QUOKSA4416

(866) 965-4729
keyaccounts@kirbybuilt.com 12/20/2022

Customer Ship To

Robert Barber Robert Barber
Vilage of Beedher Village of Beedher

1



625 Dixie Highway 625 Dixie Highway

Beecher IL 60401 Beecher IL 60401
(708) 946-2261 (708) 946-2261
item Qty
VCL1005-RD 3
City Commercial Picnic Tables/ 8' Table/ Portable - Surface Mount/ Red
VCL1009-RD 4
City Series Benches/ 6' Bench/ Portable/ Red
VCL1012-RD 4
City Series Benches/ 8' Bench/ Portable/ Red
VCL1033-RD 2
The City™ Series Waste Receptacle/ 32 Gallon/ Red/ with Black Rain Bonnet Lid & Liner
Vi
L5408 )

Receptacle Surface Mount Kit

Subtotal

Tax Total (%)

Shipping

Total

Rate

$963.71

$493.74

$559.70

$477.25

$67.02

Amount

$2,891.13

$1,974.96

$2,238.80

$954.50

$134.04

Estimated Lead Time

Ships in 3 to 5 Days

Shipsin 3 to 5 Days

Ships in 3 to 5 Days

Shipsin 3 to 5 Days

Ships in 3 to 5 Days

$8,193.43

$0.00

$588.52
—
58,781.95

e, e

e

*Estimated lead time is based on normal fulfillment time of an order at this moment. Orders with large quantities may require additional time. These estimates are

subject to change based on the nationwide supply chain issue.

PRICING FOR THIS QUOTE IS LOCKED IN FOR 30 DAYS

/



Box 7075
Westchester, IL 60154
708-579-9055
708-579-0109 (fax)
Leisure Products 1-800-526-6197
ORDER FORM/PROPOSAL

Please verify the Bill To and Ship To address information when ordering.

December 8, 2022 (Revised December 19, 2022)

BILL TO: SHIP TO:
Village of Beecher To Be Provided
PROJECT NAME:

CALL 24 HOURS PRIOR TO DELIVERY: Please provide
CUSTOMER PURCHASE ORDER #:

QTyY. NO. DESCRIPTION EACH TOTAL
4 934-301-091  6' Champion Expanded Metal Freestanding with 601 2,404.00
Back, Black Frame, Red Seats
3 950-501-091  8' Champion Expanded Metal Surface Mount 1,171 $ 3,513.00

Accessible Freestanding Picnic Table, Black Legs
and Frame, Red Top and Seats

4 934-501-091  8' Champion Expanded Metal Freestanding Bench 668 2,672.00
with Back, Black Legs and Frame, Red Top and
Seats
Subtotal $ 8,589.00
Shipping Cost 1,121.00
Total Delivered Price $ 9,710.00

NOTE: Due to the volatile cost of raw materials, supply chain, and labor shortages, prices and lead times can
change without notice. Unfortunately, we cannot guarantee or hold prices quoted at this time.

Above prices are in effect for 45 days.
Please include a copy of your Sales Tax Exemption Certificate with Order Placement. Sales Tax will
Above prices include shipping but not installation.

NOTE: Receiving Party is responsible for removing product from truck to ground upon delivery. Please keep
this in mind when providing the Ship To Address, Contact Name and Phone Number. Liftgate and/or Inside
delivery are available upon request at additional cost.

|TERMS: Our terms are net 30 from date of shipment to tax supported institutions or those who have an account with
us. 1-1/2% per month interest will be charged on past due accounts.
W
Signature Title
Signature Printed Date
BCH22VIL2.JLR

mn




IGA WITH SCHOOL DISTRICT FOR USE OF TENNIS COURTS

1. Term of 20 years with automatic annual renewal unless written notice provided by either
party prior to renewal date.

2. Reciprocal indemnification with each agency listing the other as an additional insured party. [
believe we already do this.

3. Village will maintain all improvements on the tennis court property as long as this agreement
is in effect.

4. First come-first serve to all amenities unless the school district has specific dates and times
for use and are posted for same.

5. Hours of operation will be sunrise to 10 pm. Lights will be on a photo cell or timer and lights
shut off at 10 pm.

6. Rules to be posted on fence and all parties and patrons must obey the rules.

7. School district to provide six public parking spaces, with one of the spaces being
handicapped-accessible, close to the entrance to the courts. Village to stripe and sign the spaces
accordingly.

8. Village will improve the tennis court area according to Exhibit A.

9. If for some reason the area is locked or secured the school district will be provided access.



PMALNE \/

Frars
senool




00°05+'e8r$

00'S9€°L1L$
00°008°L1$
00'922'GE$
00'602'8EL$
00°000°082$

IANTVA

08'9ev'v$

00°20€$
08'G61$
00°¥97$
00°626°t$
00°00S°+$

1S02

apeibdn ou109|3
liedal |lem Juswaeseg
Jejos doyooy
Aepano Buljooy
SWOH MaN

NOILdIHOS3a

¢c0¢ H38IN303a - S1IINd3d ONIaing

¢c0c/StHel
LL0e/SL/gL
caoe/el/et
¢c0¢/s0/¢t
¢coc/Lo/et

3lvad

sebpoH 91§
Ano) vy
PIeY2IO LES

ueduswy yoing /gct
ssed Buljjoy 0051

ss3daav

SIV.1OL ATHLNOW

aueiyoon
snizynio
[00D9IN

snid s,uaJpiiuyd
siapjing adiiyd

JNVN HINMO

3cl-¢c-SLt
aci-ce-vil
Jgaci-¢c-cLt
gcl-cc-clt
Hd3gl-¢e-LLL

# 11INH3d



December 2nd

December 6™

December 7t

December 9%

December 14t

December 17t

December 18

December 215

December 28t

December 30t

December 2022, Police Department Monthly Report

The new Ford Explorer was picked up at Morrow Brother’s Ford in Greenfield
lllinois. It is currently at Chicago Communications being fitted. It should be in
service by January 12*. This car will be shared by Officers Drew and Smycz. The
last remaining sedan (Taurus) will be retired and transferred to EMA.

Lt. Emerson and Officers Ingram & Smycz attended Responding to Stalking class
in Kankakee.

The chief attended the lllinois Drug Enforcement Officers Association meeting in
Darien, lilinois.

Police department and public works personnel met to discuss where to put
“slow children playing” signs on Hunters Drive.

The Metropolitan Area Narcotics Squad, (MANS) along with Beecher PD served a
search warrant on County Lane and seized marijuana.

EMA, the fire department, police personnel and elected officials participated in
the Holiday with Heroes event at the fire department.

All officers participated in active threat training at Beecher Junior High.

Police personnel met with architects and an engineer to finalize the layout of
the new police station.

Officers Hanson and Smycz attended Solo Response to Active Threats class in
Westmont.

Village Administrator Barber, Chief Lemming and Lt. Emerson attended the
evening farewell retirement celebration of Peotone Police Chief Bill Mort.



Monthly Ticket Report
Dec-22
I i
‘ ‘ Current |Aggregate
’ Total | Total
Driving under the influence of alcohol/drugs 1 10
Driving with bac over .08 | 0
Driving under the influence of drugs in urine 0
Illegal transportation of alcohol 0
Suspended registration ‘ 8 68
Improper display of registration 0 10
Improper use of regstration | 1 7
Operation of uninsured motor vehicle 11 159
No valid registration | 113
No valid drivers license \ 4 50
Driving while license suspended or revoked 7 65
I
Speeding j ’ 25 275
Disobey traffic control device 0 13
Seat belt violation | 1 5
Improper lane usage 4 28
Adult cannabis in motor vehicle 3 28
Truck violation (size/weight/load) 3 113
Overweight | 0
Overweight / registration 0
Overwidth / Overlength 1
No safety test 2
Permit Violation 0
No valid CDL
Equipment violation 8 81
Fail to yield - emergency vehicle 0 2
Cell Phone Violation 2 26
All others l 4 48
Total tickets 90 1115
Total violators }' 56 795
Current % Aggregate %
M/W 19 34% 278 35% F/wW
M/B 9 16% 133 17% F/B
M/Hispanic 12 21% 191 25% F/Hispanic
M/Other 0 0% 4 1% F/Other
Current % Aggregate %
Total White ‘ 26 | 46% | 363 | 46% |
Total Black | 14 25% 192 24%
Total Hispanic 16 29% 234 29%
Total Other 0 | 0% 6 1%

Beecher Police Department

% Aggregate %

89 11%
51 6%
47 5%
2 1%




December 2( :
Officer _Citaiions | Warnings | I;-tigkets Compromise Total
107 0 4 0 0 4
108 4 4 0 0 8
149 19 38 0 1 58
157 8 8 0 0 16
169 0 5 0 0 5
171 23 48 0 0 71
172 1 3 0 0 4
173 15 27 0 0 42
175 7 23 0 0 30
| 178 9 56 0 0 65
179 4 28 0 0 32
98 0 0 0 4 4
Totals 90 244 0 5 339




Beecher Police Department

Accidents by Location
12/1/2022 12:00:00 AM to 1/1/2023 12:00:00 AM

B1-22-0000475 - Control # 20220475 12/3/2022 10:16:00 PM 30136 S Autumn Dr

Inv. By: Szwab, Krzysztow 171
1 - Driver Speagle, Eric J O - No Apparenty Injury
13 - Parked

B1-22-0000478 - Control # 20220478 12/42022 9:07:00 PM | 827 Pine St
Inv. By: Szwab, Krzysztow 171
1 - Driver Purdy, Kevm F K Fatal

B1-22-0000499 - Control # 20220499

T 12/19/2022 11:11:00AM 375 Aherns Ave
inv. By: Drew, Ryan 173
1 - Driver HARTWELL JARRETT C O - No Apparenty Injury

3 TP YT e e e

B1-22-0000512 - Control # 20220512 12/31/2022 1:50:00 PM 722 Dixie Hwy

Inv. By: Smycz, Gabriel 179
1 - Driver Prete, Christine M O - No Apparenty Injury
1 - Driver Henson Linda A O-No Apparenty In]ury

B1-22-0000501 - Control # 20220501

12/21/2022 8:07:00AM  Dixie Hwy/ Country Ln T
Inv. By: Dacorte, Aaron 157
1 - Driver Lambert, Tammy O - No Apparenty Injury
1 - Driver Shultz, AdnanA O -No Apparenty Injury

B1-22-0000505 - Control # 20220505 12/25/2022 9:21:00 AM " Penfield St/ Dunbar St T S
Inv. By: Drew, Ryan 173

1 - Driver Znavor, Anthony R O - No Apparenty Injury

1 - Driver Hunte GarryD O No Apparenty Injury

B1-22-0000503 - Control # 20220503 12/23/2022 8:46:00 AM S Dixie Hwy/ Hunters D
Inv. By: Drew, Ryan 173
1 - Driver Martinez, Agripina M O - No Apparenty Injury

13 Parked

1/5/2023 9:59:23 AM 10of1



€ Jo | abed

Nd 90-¥E:1 €20¢/E/1

L9tve

0842 6bL# ueug ‘loaeld  pY Bujuiod M/ AmH aixig S 1S d1314N3d / AMH 3IX1Aa WV €1:95:¢ 220¢/et/cl [el8 STMJ 88+0000-22-19d

<099

8099

Live LLL# mozsAzly ‘qemzs PY U2Inyd M/ AMH aixig PY YaInyd M / AMH aIXIQ INd 22:61:6 2202/L L/21 INd Z8+¥0000-¢2-19

8199

1€99

19v2 ia

(VAZ4 6vL# ueug ‘|oAely  spoom 86e|lIA / N ¥6E 1H S AMH a1x1Q I8 00062 INd 92:9v:8 2202/0L/21 le 1@ 71d plleA ON  98+0000-¢¢-+9

G/l4# Sswer HoooueH uloyeig e Wd e ¥¥-L 220c/6/C} Aousby me isissy  5870000-22-14

8196 /Gl# uoley ‘apodeq PY ydInyd 3 Lot PH yaInyd 3 10t NV €€:25-L 2202/6/C| lealy| |ooyds +8+0000-¢c-14

Seve 3JoIya 00| Ul Ssigeuuen)

29te /Sl# uoley ‘apooeq uq nuiseyy / AmH aixig PY YyaInyy / AmH aixia INV 25:12:0t 2202/8/2) SN JNpYy UoIssassod  £8+0000-¢¢-+9

2096 SLL# 3 ‘uosuey IS playuad 1L 1S HITIN 8€S INd ¥5-95:2 220e/L/cL sjealy] eploing ¢8+0000-¢c-18

016 6LL# 19ugen ‘zoAwg V 1dy 8AY euelpu] M 00S OAY euelpu| M\ 00S NV ZL:EL: LI 220e/L/2l Apadoid o} ebeweq |8¥0000-22-19

8v99

L9¥2

29v2

08v2 GLl# sawep “YoooueH 1S PIBMPOOAA /1S Y00id PiemMpooAA / euelpu| Nd OL:EE: L | 2202/G/gt STMA 08¥0000-c2-19

LELL

lELL G/l# sewer »oooueH AmH aixia 6v8 AmH aix10 6¥8 Wd 21:15:8 2202/S/2t yayl Amwusp| 6.£0000-22-19
LLL# mojzsAzly ‘qemzsg 1S 8uld /¢g Wd £2:20:6 220¢e/¥/cl Juapiody  8/+0000-¢2- 14

G816 8L14# SNy ‘welbu) 1q Aemueq zz2 1q Aemured 2.2 INV 82'€S'E 2202/b/2 | asopianQ Brug  £/¥0000-22-19

0.8¥ LLL# mozsAziy ‘qemzs 1S 8|delN v6¢2 1S e|deN v62 Nd 61:€2: 1| 2202/E/3) ajndsig onsewoq  9/¥0000-22-1 9
LLL# mojzsAzly ‘qemzs JQ uwniny § 9€10€ WNd 2£:91:0) 2202/E/C| 8Py  §/1¥0000-¢2-19

1099

280S 8LL# smny ‘weibuy AmH aix1 082 AmH 81x10 Mg 00062 Wd L5:6v:6 2202/5/3} juelie \ 81e1S-JO-In0  ¥#.¥#0000-22-19

2916

0Lve 6L14# [Bugen ‘zoAwg 3AY eudpesed / AMH aIxIg sebpoH / AMH 81XId NV 00:05:8 2202/5/2 1 1d PllBA ON  £2¥0000-22-19

SHZ9 uonensibay

S9v2 6LL# [suqen ‘zoAwg  py Buiwion M/ AMH aixig S euelpuj / AMH aix1Q S NV 61:0S: | 2202/2/2) jo esn tedosdw  2/#0000-22-1 9

2916

0.9

LLLE

5144

08¥e €LL# uely ‘maig U7 MojilA /40 XeO 1@ uspur / AMH 8x1Q INV 90:25:01 2202/4/2t Auojeg STMA  12#0000-22-19

9po) asuafio 183130 Aeuiiig UuoNed07 adJjAlaS 10} [[e) auj/ereq palgns Jaquinp ase)

Wd 65:6S:TT ¢C0C/TE/CT 03 WY 00:00:
Alewwing poday ased)

Juswedaq 921j0d 19yd939g




VYU JU VO COUL/T/

08v¢ LLL# mojzshzly ‘qemzs AmH axiq 0g2 1d s1euny / AmH 8ixid Wd $S:91:8 2202/0€/21 }inPY Jo UoIssassod / STMA 01S0000-22-19
/G l# uoley ‘suooeqg u7 8solsy €59 NV €€:55:9 2202/0¢c/2! luawyedaq a1 ISISSY  60S0000-22-19
9€ve
(A4
0202 €L1# uehy ‘meig  AmH eixig S/ pH Buiwion m AmH 2110 IF 00€ WY SS:bLiLL 2202/62/21 [el® SOd 8050000-2¢-19
09%0 614 I19Lgen ‘zohwg
09+0 /S l# uoiey ‘eyooe(q (1sod)eny euspeseq /|5 OAY BUBIDU| M 00S INd ¥L:61:€ 2202/92/2) Keyeg  £050000-2z-19
8099
0€99
(4 VA:)
192
08v2 6v1# ueug ‘janeiy 10 sieuny / AmH aixig s Ha SH3ILNNH / AMH 3IX13 S Wd 9S:€€:6 2202/52/21 lele SIMA 9050000-22-19
ELL# uehy ‘maig IS Jequnq /1S p|sluad NV S0:12:6 2202/52/2t w.._:on%o,x G050000-2¢-19
adoid
SOEl ELL# UehY ‘Maig 9 un idy any euspesed 029 9 Jun 1dv 8Ay euspesed 029 INd 9¥:+0:€ ¢c0c/ve/el JO juswiadesg [euiwld +$050000-22-19
€LL# uely ‘meiq 10 s19luny / AmH aixig S WV 61:9%:8 220¢/ee/e | Juapiddy  £050000-22-19
0682 Auadoig
SOEL 8/1# swny ‘weibu) S Jdy 8Ay euapesed 029 SAY euspesed 029 WNd 61:€1:9 2202/22/21 JO Juswadea [eulwl) goso000-ge-1g
LSl# Uoiey ‘spooeq u7 Agunog / AmH aixig WV +¥:20:8 ¢202/Le/elL JuapiddYy  L0S0000-22-19
99€6 CLL# U3 ‘uosueH PH yaInyd 3 101 PH Y2Inyd 3 101 Nd ¥ L 1Y€ 2202/08/21 Sleaiyl 00S0000-22-19
ELL# uely ‘maiq 9AY sweyy G/¢ NV 80:LL LL 220e/6L/2l juspiddy  66¥0000-22-19
0LEl LLL# moyzsAzly ‘qemzs 1S PINoY 2eg 1S PIN0Y 2eS NV S€:21:2 2202/8L/21 ddd 86+0000-¢2-19
6¥99 ia
S6ve 4G|# Uoley ‘aUode(q Jajusd UmMo] S / 8AY eueIpu| uspuri /8ixig INd 6€:22:v 220e/LL/21L Buipn|3 / buieal4  26+0000-22-19
0.¥2 4S}# uosey ‘spodeq  pY Buiog M/ AmH eixig S 9Ay eueipu] / AMH 8iXIQ N 2¥:SY'E 2202/L1/21 11d PlIlBA ON  96¥0000-22-19
LELL /Si# Uoley ‘apooe( 1S playusd 2L 1S TIIMXVIN ¥0F WV L1:52:6 2202/LL/21 zms._» b_ﬁmu_ S6¥0000-c2-19
EG ]
papoddng EmEEmSM
ovel ClL# U3 ‘uosueH PH yaIinyd 3 101 PH Y3INyd 3 101 INV ¥L:€S:Z 22028/91/2) 0} abeweq [eulwL) $6+0000-22-19
4 V4]
08ve 6vi# Ueug ‘leAeld  pY yainyd M /JQ Jesiewos PYH yaInyp M /.Q1esiawos Wd 80:L L2 2202/S1/2L €18 STIMA €6¥0000-22-19
2096 ELL# uely ‘maiqg € 1dy U7 esoujay £59 € 1dv u7 8sosje £59 Nd 90:+2:9 ¢cog/vL/gl  109lang [eploing /pajeoixoju]  26¥0000-22-19
‘0%
192
08v¢ LLL# mojzsAziy ‘qemzsg U7 pieyoiQ / Amy aixig PH Y2InyD / AMH 8iXid INd 01:Sv'8 2202/EL/2 L HIMa 16¥0000-22-19
ERVERIEE)]
G9el /G l# uoiey ‘apooe(q AmH aixia zogt AMH 81X1Q 2021 Wd 95:02:€ 2202/S L2l 0} ssedsay} [euiwWUD  06¥0000-22-19
PH nr
659 8LL# SNy ‘weibu|  axye ojfeg M / AMH aixig S AMH 81Xig S iF 00062 Wd £0:71:6 ¢c0c/el/el  18AQ Hd € - 92 Buipeeds  68+0000-22-19
2099
1099

9sve



Beecher Police Department

CAD Calls For Service Counts
12/1/2022 12:00:00 AM to 1/1/2023 12:00:00 AM

911 HANG UP CALL
Abandoned 911 Call
Accident
Administrative Duties
ALARM
Animal Complaints
Assaulit
Assist Fire Department
Assist Law Agency
BUILDING CHECK
CIVIL CALL
Criminal Damage to Property
Disturbance
Domestic
Driving Under the Influence
Escorts
Extra Patrol
FIGHT
Follow Up
FRAUD INVESTIGATION
HARASSMENT
Hazard
Information
Intoxicated Subject
Juvenile Complaints
Lock out or in
Loud
Motorist Assist
Neighbor Complaints
Open Door
Other Complaints
Public Service
Public Works
Railroad Call
Reckless Driving Complaints
Return Phone Messages

—h
o )
QoRNvosr~ani

= Q®oapoaann

-
o

= O = NO = H =2NWLRWADI=ONDN=NDN

Road
SCHOOL RELATED DUTIES
Sick
Special Assignment
Suicide
Suspicious 16
Traffic Complaint 1
Traffic Stop 304
Transport 1
Trespassing 1

1/3/2023 1:36:52 PM Page 1 of 2



1/3/2023 1:36:52 PM

Truancy Complaint
Unwanted
Vehicle Maintenance
Violation of Order of Protection
Walk in at Station
Welfare Check
Wires Down
Total

END OF REPORT

Page 2 of 2

- O = O W =

770



Beecher Emergency Management

Monthly Report
December, 2022
12/13/2022  Meeting
= EMA
= ] hours

* R.Heim, D. Murray, S. Giggey, L. Voss
12/14/2022  Funeral Escort

= Traffic Control
= 1 hour
= R.Heim

12/16/2022  Training

=  Emergency Operation Plan
®* 3 hours
= R. Heim, D. Murray

12/17/2022  Holiday with Heroes

= Gift distribution at Fire House
= 4.5 hours
= D. Murray, S. Murray, R. Heim, S. Giggey

12/20/2022  Food Pantry

= Traffic Control
= 2 hours
= S. Murray

12/23/2022  Maintenance

= Vehicles
= 2.5 hours
= R. Heim, D. Murray, S. Murray

Total Hours: 38.5 hours



2022 Code Enforcement Annual
Code Violations Addressed

lall Grass Weeds Notices Issued
Tall Grass Weeds Fines (C-ticket)*
Deposits in street

BB Hoop above ground structure
Boat Street/Driveway

Trailer Street/Driveway

Camper Street/Driveway
Motorhome Driveway
Abandon/Disabled Vehicle
Parking Tickets

Warning Notice Various

Vehicle on Parkway

Other Parkway Violations
Nuisance Letter

Dog Running at Large/Incidents
Dog Tags expired

Dog Increment

Construction Debris

Prohibited Generally

Swimming Pool Violations
Water Bills Final Notice
Sidewalk obstruction

Trash Recepticals left on curb
Non lisenced Contractors
Zoning Violations Notice

IPMC Violations Notice

IPMC Violations issued (c-ticket) *
C-Ticket total Violations issued*
C-Ticket notice to appear *

David
January

ON O NNOPOOORFRPRORFROONOON-MDMDMDMOORPR ORKRNOO

Harrison
February

O NOMNORRERNRPRPRRPRLOULOONOIRLRWOO

N
N

O = OO0 MO0 N

Code
March

O O 0O O O0OOONRER R AMAMNORAMENMNNDDMODO

[y
N NN

13

ON O

Enforcement Officer

April May
1 118
0 0
7 4
1 0
3 2
0 0
6 8
3 0
0 1
5 0
1 0
0 1
0 2
1 1
1 1
0 Email 175
0 1
0 1
3 2
0 0
64 0
6 2
3 1
0 0
6 2
9 12
0 0
0 0
1 0

June

[e)]
]

O N PFPF OORFR OREFEPFNNOOBMNDOWRW

6

o

=Y O B O O

10



Total

November December

Septembr October

August

July

211

14

17
26
10

16
19

16
18
10

10

34

292

60

66

22

24

35
53

15
44

11
70

YTD

C-Tickets



1/5/23, 3:25 PM

Pre-Owned 2021 Ford Explorer XLT 4 Door SUV in Wilmington #D22069A | D'Orazio Ford

D'ORAZIO FORD (/)
Holiday Hours:

January 2nd, Service & parts closed
Sales Open 10am-2pm

Value Your Trade

Enter Year Make Model Trim

N—
i1 & -
I A= :
L Jord 8

_ huuéi‘ﬂ 

Pre-Owned 2021 Ford Explorer XLT

VIN: IFMSK8DH5MGB23142

D'ORAZIO PRICE
@ Details

This Is getting yiteation.

STOCK: D22069A

$38 ;550 (https://www.dorazioford.com/inventory/used-2021-ford-explorer-xlt-4wd-4-door-suv-1fmsk8dhSmgb23142/)

Q Glovebox

. Contact (/glovebox/) &

https://www.dorazioford.com/inventory/used-2021-ford-explorer-xit-4wd-4-door-suv-1fmsk8dh5mgb23142/

1/8



1/56/23, 3:25 PM

44 people have recently viewed it.

SHOP FROM HOME

Pre-Owned 2021 Ford Explorer XLT 4 Door SUV in Wilmington #D22069A | D'Orazio Ford

Check Availability

Value Your Trade (/value-your-trade)

Welcome to Car Buying Made Simple

Buy From Home
nstant Pricing - No Hassle - Home Delivery

Basic Info

EXTERIOR:
DRIVETRAIN:
TRANSMISSION:
ENGINE:

FUEL EFFICIENCY:

MILEAGE:

History Report

View Your Free Report (http://www.carfax.com/VehicleHistory/p/Report.cfx?

partner=FRD_2&vin=1FMSK8DH5MGB23142)

Q Search

(https://shop.dorazioford.com/inventory/used)

Atlas Blue

4WD

10-Speed Automatic

2.3L 1416V GDI DOHC Turbo
20 CITY /7 27 HWY

22,754

SHOW ME THE ) i
(http://www.carfax.com/VehicleHistory/p/Report.cfx?
partner=FRD_2&vin=1FMSK8DH5MGB23142)

Q Glovebox

. Contact (/glovebox/)

https://www.dorazioford.com/inventory/used-2021-ford-explorer-xit-4wd-4-door-suv-1fmsk8dh5mgb23142/ 2/8



1/5/23, 3:25 PM Pre-Owned 2021 Ford Explorer XLT 4 Door SUV in Wilmington #D22069A | D'Orazio Ford

Key Features

e B

AWD BACKUP
CAMERA
[ {
v *
INTERIOR
HEATED SEATS
ACCENTS

Description

<8

BLIND SPOT
MONITOR

K4
PARKING

SENSORS /
ASSIST

3

BLUETOOTH

o
o

SIDE-IMPACT
AIR BAGS

K

HANDS-FREE
LIFTGATE

Enjoy the heated seats in this Ford Explorer you will never buy a vehicle without them. Everyone loves the

comfort of having a warm seat on those cold winter days. See what's behind you with the back up camera on

this Ford Explorer. Bluetooth technology is built into this Ford Explorer, keeping your hands on the steering

wheel and your focus on the road. The rear parking assist technology on the Ford Explorer will put you at ease
when reversing. The system alerts you as you get closer to an obstruction. Expand the cargo capabilities of
this Ford Explorer by using the installed roof rack. Enjoy the convenience of the power liftgate on this vehicle.
This unit has a 2.3 liter 4 Cylinder Engine high output engine. Impresses the most discerning driver with the
deep polished blue exterior on it. When you encounter slick or muddy roads, you can engage the four wheel

drive on this model and drive with confidence.

Q, Search

L. Contact

https://www.dorazioford.com/inventory/used-2021-ford-explorer-xit-4wd-4-door-suv-1fmsk8dh5mgb23142/

Q Glovebox
(/glovebox/)

3/8



1/5/23, 3:25 PM Pre-Owned 2021 Ford Explorer XLT 4 Door SUV in Wilmington #D22069A | D'Orazio Ford
Vehicle Details

Details v

Engine: 2.3L EcoBoost |-4; auto start-stop technology
3.58 Non-Limited-Slip Rear Axle Ratio
GVWR: 6;160 lbs

50 State Emissions System Flexible Fuel Vehicle (FFV) system is standard equipment for vehicles with the 3.3L
Ti-VCT V6 FFV engine.

Transmission w/Driver Selectable Mode
Automatic Full-Time Four-Wheel Drive
Engine Oil Cooler

Battery w/Run Down Protection
Regenerative Alternator

Towing Equipment; Trailer Sway Control .
Gas-Pressurized Shock Absorbers

Front And Rear Anti-Roll Bars

Electric Power-Assist Speed-Sensing Steering
17.9 Gal. Fuel Tank

Quasi-Dual Stainless Steel Exhaust

Auto Locking Hubs

Strut Front Suspension w/Coil Springs
Multi-Link Rear Suspension w/Coil Springs

4-Wheel Disc Brakes w/4-Wheel ABS; Front And Rear Vented Discs; Brake Assist; Hill Descent Control; Hill Hold
Control and Electric Parking Brake

Steel Spare Wheel

Spare Tire Mounted Inside Under Cargo

Clearcoat Paint

Body-Colored Front Bumper

Body-Colored Rear Bumper w/Black Rub Strip/Fascia Accent

Black Side Windows Trim; Black Front Windshield Trim and Black Rear Window Trim
Chrome Bodyside Insert; Black Bodyside Cladding and Black Wheel Well Trim
Body-Colored Door Handles

Black Power Heated Side Mirrors w/Manual Folding

Fixed Rear Window w/Fixed Interval Wiper; Heated Wiper Park and Defroster

Q Glovebox

Q Search ¢, Contact (/glovebox/)

https://www.dorazioford.com/inventory/used-2021-ford-explorer-xit-4wd-4-door-suv-1fmsk8dh5mgb23142/ 4/8



1/6/23, 3:25 PM Pre-Owned 2021 Ford Explorer XLT 4 Door SUV in Wilmington #D22069A | D'Orazio Ford

Deep Tinted Glass

Speed Sensitive Variable Intermittent Wipers
Galvanized Steel/Aluminum Panels

Lip Spoiler

Grille w/Chrome Bar

Power Liftgate Rear Cargo Access

Roof Rack Rails Only

Autolamp Auto On/Off Aero-Composite Led Low/High Beam Auto High-Beam Daytime Running Lights Preference
Setting Headlamps w/Delay-Off

LED Brakelights

Headlights-Automatic Highbeams
Perimeter/Approach Lights

Streaming Audio

Integrated Roof Antenna

Bluetooth Wireless Phone Connectivity

2 LCD Monitors In The Front

8-Way Driver Seat

Passenger Seat

Front Center Armrest and Rear Seat Mounted Armrest Outboard Only
Manvual Tilt/Telescoping Steering Column
Leather/Metal-Look Steering Wheel

Front Cupholder

Rear Cupholder

Compass

Remote Releases -Inc: Power Cargo Access
Keypad

Cruise Control w/Steering Wheel Controls
HVAC; Underseat Ducts and Headliner/Pillar Ducts
Locking Glove Box

Driver Foot Rest

Interior Trim; Metal-Look/Piano Black Instrument Panel Insert; Metal-Look/Piano Black Door Panel Insert; Piano
Black Console Insert and Chrome/Metal-Look Interior Accents

Full Cloth Headliner

- Telcen lommmod
T LR nideiy

oo
Q, Search {, Contact Q Glovebox

(/glovebox/)

https://www.dorazioford.com/inventory/used-2021-ford-explorer-xlt-4wd-4-door-suv-1fmsk8dh5mgb23142/ 5/8



1/5/23, 3:25 PM Pre-Owned 2021 Ford Explorer XLT 4 Door SUV in Wilmington #D22069A | D'Orazio Ford

Day-Night Rearview Mirror

Driver And Passenger Visor Vanity Mirrors w/Driver And Passenger Illumination; Driver And Passenger Auxiliary
Mirror

Full Floor Console w/Covered Storage; Mini Overhead Console w/Storage; Rear Console w/Storage and 4 12V DC
Power Outlets

Front And Rear Map Lights
Fade-To-Off Interior Lighting
Carpet Floor Trim

Trunk/Hatch Auto-Latch

Cargo Area Concealed Storage
Cargo Space Lights

Driver / Passenger And Rear Door Bins
Delayed Accessory Power
Systems Monitor

Outside Temp Gauge

Analog Appearance

Redundant Digital Speedometer
Seats w/Cloth Back Material

Manual Adjustable Rear Head Restraints

Payment Options
CASH
$38,550
Get E-Price
Q Search {, Contact af)tv::xolx)

https://www.dorazioford.com/inventory/used-2021-ford-explorer-xit-4wd-4-door-suv-1fmsk8dh5mgb23142/ 6/8



1/5/23, 3:25 PM Pre-Owned 2021 Ford Explorer XLT 4 Door SUV in Wilmington #D22069A | D'Orazio Ford

Other Vehicles You May Like

( yORAZIp o 0RAZIp

< %
USTamEns FOR USToMERS FORLY

2022 Ford Explorer XLT 2022 Ford Explorer XLT 2022 Ford Explorer XLT

$44,040 $46,030 $46,030
(https://www.dorazioford.com/inventory/used- (https://www.dorazioford.com/inventory/used- (https://www.dorazioford.com/inventory/used-
2022-ford-explorer-xlt-4wd-4-door-suv- 2022-ford-explorer-xit-4wd-4-door-suv- 2022-ford-explorer-xit-4wd-4-door-suv-
1fmsk8dhingb82870/) 1fmsk8dh8ngc01432/) 1fmsk8dhingb99698/)

Get Directions

to 1135 South Water Street - Wilmington, IL 60481

Get Directions

Contact Us

o/ (815) 476-5205 (tel:+18154765205)
£ adorazio@dorazioford.com

Message Us

Disclaimer:

New vehicle pricing includes all offers and incentives. Tax, Title and Tags not included in vehicle
prices shown and must be paid by the purchaser. While great effort is made to ensure the
accuracy of the information on this site, errors do occur so please verify information with a
customer service rep. This is easily done by callinq us at or by visiting us at the deabarabip.

Q, Search &, Contact (/glovebox/)

https://www.dorazioford.com/inventory/used-2021-ford-explorer-xlt-4wd-4-door-suv-1fmsk8dh5mgb23142/ 7/8



1/5/23, 3:25 PM Pre-Owned 2021 Ford Explorer XLT 4 Door SUV in Wilmington #D22069A | D'Orazio Ford

**With approved credit. Terms may vary. Monthly payments are only estimates derived from the
vehicle price with a 72 month term, 5.9% interest and 20% downpayment.

INVENTORY

SERVICE

FINANCE

SPECIALS

EXTRAS

AdChoices [> i

Copyright © 2023 -

Although every reasonable effort has been made to ensure the accuracy of the information contained on this site, absolute accuracy cannot be guaranteed. This site, and
all information and materials appearing on it, are presented to the user "as is" without warranty of any kind, either express or implied. All vehicles are subject to prior
sale. Price does not include applicable tax, title, and license charges. $Vehicles shown at different locations are not currently in our inventory (Not in Stock) but can be
made available to you at our location within a reasonable date from the time of your request, not to exceed one week. MSRP may not represent the actual price at which

vehicles are sold in this trade area.

Q Glovebox

Q Search % Contact (/glovebox/)

https://www.dorazioford.com/inventory/used-2021-ford-explorer-xit-4wd-4-door-suv-1fmsk8dh5mgb23142/ 8/8



BEECHER PUBLIC WORKS — DECEMBER 2022 MONTHLY REPORT

WEEK OF DECEMBER 5™, 2022
DAILY WELL CHECKS — LIFT STATION CHECKS & SEWER PLANT TRAINING T &TH — WEEKLY PARK INSPECTIONS ~
DAILY VILLAGE HALL CHECKS — MONTHLY E.P.A. WATER SAMPLES — CLEAN OUT INSIDE OF LEAF TRUCKS
INCLUDING REMOVAL OF BLOWER MOTORS — REPAIR SALT SPREADER ON 95 INTERNATIONAL — INSTALL SALT
SPREADER ON 2011 INTERNATIONAL — LOCK OUT/TAG OUT CLASS — REPAIR HYDRANTS ON ORCHARD EAST,
QUAIL HOLLOW, & REED & MILLER — REPLACE AUGER BEARINGS ON 03 INTERNATIONAL ~ 1 METER
APPOINTMENT — BEGIN HYDRANT REPLACEMENT ON HUNTERS (STRUCK UN-MARKED COMED LINE) -G.P.S.
LOCATE B-BOXES FOR G.1.S. SYSTEM ~ PLOW ROUTE & SALT RYUN MAPS CREATED — REPAIR MARKER LIGHT’S
ON 95 INTERNATIONAL

WEEK OF DECEMBER 12™, 2022
DAILY WELL CHECKS — LIFT STATION CHECKS & SEWER PLANT TRAINING M-W-F — WEEKLY PARK INSPECTIONS —
DAILY VILLAGE HALL CHECKS — INSTALL NEW SIGNAGE ON HUNTERS DRIVE — BUILD NEW STAIR CASE AT DEPOT
CABOOSE ~ GET ALL TRUCKS INSPECTED — REPAIR GLOBES IN NANTUCKET COVE — REMOVE ALL BRUSH AT
SEWER PLANT GROWING THROUGH FENCE LINE — WATER MAIN BREAK AT DIXIE & MILLER ~ MAKE SUPPLY LIST
FOR NEW POLES IN FIREMAN'’S PARK & AT NURSING HOME — PLOW ROUTE TRAINING WITH ALL EMPLOYEES —
HELP POLICE DEPARTMENT WITH GROW HOUSE (PUMP DOWN ALL WATER CONTAINERS WITH OUR PUMPS) - 1
METER APPOINTMENT —~ REPAIR STREET SIGNAGE AROUND TOWN - SEWER JET BACKED UP LINE NEAR DEJONG
— NEW VEHICLE LIFT ELECTRIC WORK COMPLETED

WEEK OF DECEMBER 19™, 2022
DAILY WELL CHECKS ~ LIFT STATION CHECKS & SEWER PLANT TRAINING M&W — WEEKLY PARK INSPECTIONS ~
DAILY VILLAGE HALL CHECKS — REPAIR TRAILER JACK FOR TRAILER — DO ALL MOWER MAINTENANCE (OIL
CHANGES, FILTERS, SHARPEN BLADES) — CREATE SIDEWALK LIST ON INDIANA FOR 2023 COUNTY PROJECT (THIS
WILL BE AN UPCOMING COST FOR US PER I.G.A.) — PREPARE ALL TRUCKS FOR UPCOMING WINTER STORM
(PLOWS ON, FUELED UP, SALT LOADED — SNOWMAGEDDON (MEDIA HYPE) OVER CHRISTMAS WEEKEND

WEEK OF DECEMBER 26™, 2022
DAILY WELL CHECKS — LIFT STATION CHECKS & SEWER PLANT TRAINING T & TH — WEEKLY PARK INSPECTIONS —
DAILY VILLAGE HALL CHECKS — DUMP OUT ALL REMAINING SALT IN TRUCKS & CLEAN — TAKE OFF ALL PLOWS

AND CLEAN ALL SMALL TRUCKS — 100 TONS OF SALT DELIVERED & MOVED INSIDE OF DOME — REPAIR 2011 SALT

SPREADER - MOVE GENERATOR FROM PD BACK TO SEWER PLANT — TAKE PICNIC TABLED FROM AMVETS BACK
TO PARK — WORK ON HYDRANT MAP NUMBERING SYSTEM — REPAIR GATE AT HUT FOR P.D. IMPOUND - CREATE

METER REPLACEMENT LIST — REPAIR STREET LIGHT ON PASADENA — REMOVE 2 WASP NEST IN TREE ON
PASADENA - CLEAN UP PLOW DAMAGE ON SKYVIEW -




Village of Beecher

Monthly Water Department Report
DECEMBER 2022

System Pumping Data

Total Gallons Pumped: 12,016,000 Monthly Average: 388,000
Peak Day: 495,000 Gal. 12/12/2022

Well Pumping Data

Well #3 Total Gallons: 3,789,000 Daily Average 122,000
Well #4 Total Gallons: 4,762,000 Daily Average 154,000
Well #5 Total Gallons: 3,465,000 Daily Average 112,000

Chemical Usage

Total Pounds Chlorine used: 565.3 Well #3: 171.0 Well #4: 239.4

Well #5: 154.9

Total Pounds Aqua Mag used: 1,408.0 Well #3: 291.0 Waell #4: 806.0
Well #5: 311.0

Total Gallons Fluoride used :0 Well #3:0 Well #4: 0 Well #5:0



Village of Beecher Wastewater Treatment Plant

Monthly Report

Month : November 2022

Year: 2022
Total Gallons: MGD
Influent : 13.419 MGD

Daily Maximum: 0.8690 MGD / Minimum : 0.3740 MGD /Average Daily Flow: 0.4473
MGD

Effluent: 16.724 MGD
Daily Maximum: 1.0960 MGD

Minimum: 0.4600 MGD / Average Daily Flow : 0.5574 MGD

Excess Flow: 0.00 MGD

Chlorine Used: (Ibs) 0

Excess Treated: 0.00 MGD

Rainfall: 1.21 Inches

Return Sludge: 31.689 MGD

Dry Sludge Removed (Cubic Yards):

Liquid Sludge Hauled Gallons: 0 gals

*Laboratory Information: Effluent*




S Day CBOD Avg: 1.0 mg/l1 . (Daily max): 1.6 mg/1

Total Suspended Solids Avg: 0.6 mg/l (Daily Max): 3.0 mg/l
Ammonia Nitrogen Avg : N/D mg/l (Daily Max): N/D mg/l
Total Phosphorus Avg: 0.30 mg/l (Daily Max): 0.42 mg/1

*Laboratory Information: Influent*

Total Phosphorus Avg: 10.0 mg/1 (Daily Max) : 13.0 mg/l

Average S Day BOD: 130.0 mg/1 Average TSS: 160.0 mg/1

Ammonia Nitrogen Avg: 14.1 mg/I (Daily max): 33.8 mg/1
% Removal BOD: 99.8 % % Removal SS: 99.8 %

Equipment repairs , maintenance,

*OXIDATION DITCH monthly , weekly maintenance performed. * BLOWER monthly
maintenance performed, Clarifiers monthly maintenance performed: Kohler K 1000
emergency generator fuel topped of at 70.5 gallons.by Co-Alliance. Concentric

performed updates to the WWTP SCADA system.

*Monthly DMR lab analysis performed and completed, Up Stream/Down
Stream, and Monthly Monitoring samples collected, and analysis performed and
completed by Suburban Laboratories for the month of November 2022, NPDES DMRS

for the month of October 2022 completed and submitted to the LE.P.A

Continue implementing an activated sludge process control monitory analysis
consisting of monitoring daily , weekly, monthly aeration tanks solids inventory, mixed
liquor suspended solids, ,settling, ph analysis, dissolved oxygen ,analysis, flow

adjustments, return sludge monitoring and adjustments, secondary clarifier sludge blanket



monitoring ,sludge wasting rates adjustments and improvements, microscopic analysis of

micro biological activity in the system, balancing sludge digestion in aerobic digesters.

Sincerely,

John Hernandez

Wastewater Treatment Plant Manager



Village of Beecher
625 Dixie Highway
PO Box 1154
Beecher, Illinois 60401

Phone: 708-946-2261

President
Marcy Meyer

Clerk
Janett Conner

Administrator

Trustees

Jonathon Kypuros
Todd Kraus
Benjamin Juzeszyn
Joe Tieri

Fax: 708-946-3764 B F Robert 0. Barber ~ Roger Stacey
www.villageofbeecher.org ) P Treasurer Joseph Gianotti
k Donna Rooney
WATER BILLING REGISTER REPORT
Billing Period: November-December 2022
Gallons Pumped/
Gallons Pumped Accounted For Difference Accounted Ratio Water Loss
23,202,000 17,484,353 5,717,647 75.36% 24.64%
Gallons Pumped Gallons Billed Difference Pumped/Billed Ratio
23,202,000 17,300,000 5,902,000 74.56%

This compares to the pumped/billed ratio of 69.96% for the same period last year

and the 10 year average of 64%

# of water accounts: 1,742 (decrease of 13)
Amount billed for water: $151,446.49

# of sewer accounts: 1722 (increase of 3)
Amount billed for sewer: $93,883.73
Amount billed for sewer debt: $18,692.81

# of accounts on lift station: 335 (decrease of 1)
Amount billed for lift station: $2,365.04

# of refuse accounts: 1622 (decrease of 4)
Amount billed for refuse: $66,508.10

New account charges: $350.00

Mosquito charges: $3,462.51

Total amount billed this period: $336,708.68

BREAKDOWN OF WATER CHARGES

Watermain Replacement Flat Charge: $6,968.00
Watermain Replacement $2 Rate: $34,600.00
School Ball Fields $4.29/1,000 (WM Replace): SO
Over 30,000g!| $1/1,000g! surcharge: $1,770.00
(1,770,000 gl billed this period over 30,000)

Water Rate for Operations: $108,108.49



-»‘% Roblnsan

December 15 2022
Project 19-R0571.04

Ellen Perry, Manager

linois Environmental Protection Agency (via email EPA.loanmgmt@illinois.gov)
Infrastructure Financial Assistance Section, Post-Construction Unit

PO Box 19276

1021 North Grand Avenue, East

Springfield, IL 62794-9276

RE: IEPA Loan L17-5759
Village of Beecher
Lead Service Line Replacement
Loan Disbursement Request 7

Dear Ms. Perry:

On behalf of the Village of Beecher, we are submitting the enclosed Loan Disbursement Request for IEPA Loan L17-
5759.

Enclosed please find Brandt Excavating Draw #6 for retention reduction to zero. This is the final disbursement
request for this project, and also includes a final balancing change order.

We request that the Village receive a disbursement for the amount of Twenty Seven Thousand Eight Hundred Forty
Four Dollars and Ninety Six Cents ($27,844.96).

If there are any questions, please do not hesitate to call.

Sincerely,

ROBINSON ENGINEERING, LTD.

Sl

Jonathan D. Flowers
Project Engineer

Direct Line: (815) 412-2015
Email: jflowers@RELtd.com

R:\2015-2019\2019\19-R0571.BE\19-R0571.04\Payouts\IEPA  Disbursement Requests\Disbursement Request 7\Disbursement Cover Letter to
IEPA\Disbursement Request 7 Cover Letter.docx

Encl.

127 North Walnut Street, Suite 200, Itasca, IL 60143 | (847) 250-5635 | www.reltd.com



lllinois Environmental Protection Agency

Rev. 3/2021

1021 North Grand Avenue East * P.O. Box 19276 e Springfield e lllinois ¢ 62794-9276 e (217) 782-3397

lllinois Water Revolving Loan Fund
Request for Loan Disbursement

Loan#. L17-5759
Request #: 7
Date: 12/15/2022

Loan Recipient: Village of Beecher
Service Dates for this Request: From: 11/2/2022
To: 11/30/2022

Complete this form for each request for disbursement from the State Water Revolving Fund pursuant to
the executed loan agreement. Report total cumulative costs incurred to date and submit copies of all
supporting invoices. Submit cost allocation if there are other funding sources.

Please complete, print, sign, scan, and email to EPA.LoanMgmt@illinois.gov

Eligible Budget

(per loan agreement
+/- IEPA approved
change orders)

Total Cumulative
Costs
Incurred to Date

Total Cumulative
Eligible Costs
Incurred to Date

Legal/Administrative

$150,000.00
$180,050.00

$1,113,798.44

$150,000.00
$180,050.00

$1,113,798.44

$150,000.00
$277,000.00

$2,118,650.00

Design Engineering

Construction Engineering

Construction (before retainage)
- List each contractor separately

Other:

TOTAL COSTS TO DATE

Less Retainage
- List each contractor separately

$1,443,848.44 $1,443,848 .44

Brandt Excavating

Less Paid with Other Funding Sources

Less Total Interest Earned
on Invested Funds

Less Total Disbursements to Date $1,416,003.50

Less Rounding adjustment for bonds
(if necessary)

NET DISBURSEMENT REQUESTED $27,844.94

FOR AGENCY USE ONLY
Date:
Date:

Prepared by:

Approved by:

Request for Loan Disbursement Page 1 of 2



Request# 7 Loan # L17-5759

Please indicate compliance with the following by marking the checkbox:

This disbursement request constitutes a report in accordance with Section 4(b)(2) of the lilinois Grant
Funds Recovery Act (30 ILCS 705/4(b)(2)) and is intended to describe the progress of the project and
the expenditure of the loan funds related thereto.

The loan recipient is in compliance with all Standard and Special Conditions of the Loan Agreement
and any subsequent Amendments executed for this loan project.

No refunds, rebates, or credits have been received by the loan recipient.

The loan recipient is in compliance with the wage rate requirements established in rules issued by the
U.S. Department of Labor to implement the Davis-Bacon Wage Act and other related acts (29 CFR
Parts 1, 3, and 5). Certified payroll records for the time period covered by the submitted
invoices are being maintained and are available for review.

If this disbursement contains construction costs, the lllinois Works Apprenticeship Initiative Periodic
Report is included with this request. Only applies to loans issued since May 8, 2020.

[/] Engineering charges have been reviewed, and are reasonable, supported, and separated with
documentation and in accordance with the approved engineering contract. The loan recipient
acknowledges that no construction observation charges after the approved final completion
date are eligible for loan reimbursement.

Each prime contractor has current and appropriate insurance coverage including workman's
compensation, public liability and property damage, fire, and extended coverage inciuding "All Risk"
type of Builder's Risk Insurance.

Flood insurance has been acquired and maintained on eligible insurable structures under construction
pursuant to the National Flood Insurance Act of 1968, as amended; or official exclusion from flood
insurance requirements has been received from the Federal Emergency Management Agency; or
there are no insurable structures located within a flood plain.

[ ] This is a first or final disbursement request and the additional checklist has been completed and
submitted.

Please complete, print, sign, scan, and email to EPA.LoanMgmt@illinois.gov

| hereby certify that this request for disbursement is, to the best of my knowledge and belief, a true and
accurate request for disbursement, that it is made in accordance with the conditions of the loan for the
project, and that | am authorized to request disbursement on behalf of the borrower.

Robert O. Barber Village Administrator
Authorized Representative (Printed Name) Title
M 14/iflosa

Signature Date

Rev. 3/2021 Request for Loan Disbursement Page 2 of 2

el



Rev. 3/12021

lllinois Water Revolving Loan Fund
Request for Loan Disbursement

Loan Recipient Village of Beecher Loan # L17-5759

FIRST DISBURSEMENT CHECKLIST

Please indicate compliance with the following by marking the checkbox:

[ ] Executed construction contract documents have been submitted to lllinois EPA and include the non-
discrimination clause, Davis-Bacon language, and Davis-Bacon wage rate tables.

[} Performance and payment bonds (dated not earlier than the date of the executed contract), certificate
of insurance with the loan recipient as an additional insured, and notice to proceed have been
submitted to the lllinois EPA.

[ ] Copies of agreements or grants providing other funding for this project have been submitted to the
Ilinois EPA. An allocation of funds from the other funding sources will be provided with each loan
disbursement request.

[_] The public notification/signage requirement has been met and the Certificate of Completion has been
submitted to the lllinois EPA.

[ ] The lllinois Works Jobs Program Act Apprenticeship Initiative Budget Supplement form has been

submitted to the lilinois EPA with 90 days of the loan agreement.

FINAL DISBURSEMENT CHECKLIST

Please indicate compliance with the following by marking the checkbox:

If construction has been completed, the newly-constructed facility is being operated in accordance
with the provisions of the Clean Water Act or Safe Drinking Water Act, lllinois Environmental
Protection Act and all regulations adopted thereunder.

Change orders for final quantities have been submitted to the lllinois EPA and match the contractor's
final costs.

The appropriate lllinois EPA regional field office has been notified in writing of the completion of
construction, plans of record have been forwarded to that office, and a final inspection has been
requested. A copy of the request for inspection has already been provided to the Post-Construction
Unit or is included with the final disbursement request.

Proof of flood insurance has been submitted to the lllinois EPA pursuant to the National Flood
Insurance Act of 1968, as amended; or official exclusion from fiood insurance requirements has been
received from the Federal Emergency Management Agency, or there are no insurable structures
located within a flood plain.

The Certification of Compliance with Public Works Project Apprenticeship Goals has been submitted

to the lllinois EPA. Only applies to loans issued since May 8, 2020.

AFTER FINAL DISBURSEMENT

Within 30 days after the warrant (check) from the State Comptroller has been issued, the recipient wifl
submit to the Illinois EPA (forms may be found on the lllinois EPA web site):

Final lien waivers from all primary contractors.

Certification by the recipient that all bilis have been paid.

Certification by the recipient of training and operation and maintenance documents.

Release discharging the State of Wlinois, its officers, agents, and employees from all liabilities,
obligations, and claims arising out of the project work.

if the loan application for a treatment works (WPC) project was received after September 30, 2014,
certification by the recipient that a Fiscal Sustainability Plan has been developed and implemented in

accordance with the Water Resources Reform and Development Act (WRRDA) of 2014.

Authorized Representative: M Date: /J/A‘Avaz
7/

Request for Loan Disbursement

Page 1 of 1



To: Village of Beecher
625 Dixie Hwy
Beecher, IL 60401

Attn: Bob Barber, Administrator

RE: Lead Water Service Replacements

Estimate # 6- Final

Dear Mr. Barber:

<== Robinson

ENGINE!

December 15, 2022
19-R0571.04

Enclosed herewith please find Invoice #6 (dated 11/30/22) from Brandt Excavating, Inc. for work completed through
11/30/22 for the above referenced project. We have reviewed the work and find that, in our best judgment, it is in

substantial compliance with the plans and specifications.

We, therefore, recommend that Brandt Excavating Inc. is entitled to payment of Twenty Seven Thousand Eight Hundred
and Forty Four Dollars and Ninety Six Cents ($27,844.96) as summarized below, contingent upon receipt of these funds

from the IEPA:

Total Loan Eligible Earned to Date

Less previous payments

Amount Due this Pay Request #6 — Final

Very truly yours,

%""‘"

Jonathan Flowers, PE
Project Engineer
(815) 412-2015
jflowers@reltd.com

e-cc: Matt Conner, DPW

$1,113,798.44

$1,085,953.48
$§27,844.96



(' Page 31 of 70

Change Order No. 4
Date of Issuance: 12/15/22 Effective Date: __12/15/22
Project: er: Owner's Conlract No.:
Lead Water Service Replacements | Village of Beecher 19-R0571.04
Contract: Date of Contract:
July 20th, 2021
Contractor: Engineer’s Project No.:
Brandt Excavating and Boring. Inc..
The Contract Documents are modified as follows upon execution of this Change Order:
Description: ——h " I I .
eSCTPM Reduction in quantities from less actual lead services than predicted lead services.
Altachments: (List documents supporting change):
s bmitted final invoi
CHANGE IN CONTRACT PRICE: CHANGE IN CONTRACT TIMES:
Original Contract Price: Original Contract Times: [] Workingdays [ Calendar days
Substantial completion {days or date):
( s_ 2,777,865 Ready for final payment (days or date):

—finerense] [Decrease] from previously approved Change {increase] [Decrease] from prevuously approved Change Orders
Orders No._N/A to No. No. to No.
Substantial completion (days):
; 650215 el

Ready for final payment (days):

Contract Price prior to this Change Order: Contract Times prior to this Change Order:
Substantial completion (days or date):
$ 2,159,008.44

Ready for final payment (days or date):

~{inerease} [Decrease] of this Change Order: [Increase] [Decrease)] of this Change Order:
Substantial completion (days or date):
$ 1,045,210.00 Ready for final payment (days or date):
Contract Price incorporating this Change Order: Contract Times with all approved Change Orders:

Substantial completion (days or date):

S, 1.113,798.44 Ready for final payment (days or date):

RECOMMENDED: ACCEPTER: % ACCEPTED:
8y: gm”\ﬂx-tu By: B

" Engineer (Authorized Signature) Owner (Authorized Signature) Contractor (Authorized Signature)
Fa one: 12115022 SV 7 oue__ 1 2-15-2022
Approved by Funding Agency (if applicable): Dale:
k\ FICPC No. C-941 (2002 Fdition)

Copyright £ 2002 National Society of Professional Engincers for E3CDC. All rights reserved.
Prepared by the Engincers” Joint Contract | C ittee and endorsed by the A iated Ciencral of America and the Construction Specifications Instinne,




%AIA Document G702" - 1992

Application and Certificate for Payment

- : 13 i - -
TWECHER PBBEEEIER 2021 LEAD SERVICES APPLICATION N°'11/30/2022 Distribution to:
2(2)5535(“1151’514“" PERIOD TO: OWNER O
BEECHER. IL 60401 CONTRACT FOR: BEECHER 2021 LEAD SERVICES ARCHITECT O
FROM CONTRACTOR: VIA ARCHITECT:. ) .
Brandt Excavating Inc Robinson Engineering CONTRACT DATE‘19—R057 CONTRACTOR O
385 E. Hoover Street PROJECT NQS: L] / FIELD 0O
Morris, IL 60450 INVOICE NO: 916 OTHERND)
CONTRACTOR’S APPLICATION FOR PAYMENT The undersigned Contractor certifies that to the best of the Contractor's knowledge, information

PN . . . . and belief the Work covered by this Application for Payment has been completed in accordance
Application is made fg{lpayrm:nt, - Sh‘):" betlow. mhconnecllon With the Centiact with the Contract Documents, that all amounts have been paid by the Contractor for Work for
AIA Document G703™, Continuation Sheet, is attached. 2777.865.00  Wwhich previous Certificates for Payment were issued and payments received from the Owner, and
1. ORIGINAL CONTRACT SUM ......ocoviiniiiiiiiiiiiiiineniiiiicieeniiiniae $ 1 2o that current paynEnt sh, herei| |s n

2. NET CHANGE BY CHANGE ORDERS . . CONTRACTOR: vating The" o
3. CONTRACT SUM TO DATE (Litte 7 % 2) .o, 113, By: Z‘__zgfa—’ pae: 11-D0-2022

—1,113,798.44
4. TOTAL COMPLETED & STORED TO DATE (Column G on G703) ... $ 1t State of: T\ \O'S

5. RETAINAGE: County of: G(»ANN'\’
a0 %ofCompleted Work Subscribed and sworn to before
(C %umns D + Eon G703) $ 0.00 me this Soway of WQ(\\OQ( 110’2'2
b. % of Stored Material
(Column F on G703) S 0.00 Notary Public: AN Ejd \> & M%Fgms%ﬁ
My commission expires: q
Tota! Retainage (Lines Sa + 5b. or Total in Column I of G703)...... $ e -235-07S Notary Public, State of ifinots =
6. TOTAL EARNED LESS RETAINAGE .................coo..rrvrrrrnenns., s L113798.44  ARCHITECT'S CERTIFICATE FOR PA ki
(Line 4 minus Line S Total) In accordance with the Contract Documents, based on on-site observations and the data comprising
7. LESS PREVIOUS CERTIFICATES FOR PAYMENT $ 1,085,953.48 this application, the Architect certifies 1o the Owner that to the best of the Architect’s knowledge,
i i ) i e e —————— information and belief the Work has progressed as indicated, the quality of the Work is in
(Line 6 from prior Certificate) monso.  Aaccordance with the Contract Documents, and the Contractor is entitled to payment of the
8. CURRENT PAYMENT DUE .......oveeeeeeeeeerereeereeees e [ &//51.357] [AMOUNE CERTIFIED.
9. BALANCE TO FINISH, INCLUDING RETAINAGE 0.00 AMOUNT CERTIFIED $
(Line 3 minus Line 6) $ i (Attach explanation if amount certified differs from the amount applied. Initial all figures on this
Application and on the Continuation Sheet that are changed to conform with the amount certified.)
ICHANGE ORDER SUMMARY ADDITIONS DEDUCTIONS ARCHITECT:
[Total changes approved in previous months by Owner | $ bl Pt By: Date:
[Total approved this month $ L ! 5’ ) : This Certificate is not ncgotiable. The AMOUNT CERTIFIED is payable only to the Contractor
TOTAL |§ 40,358.44 [, 70332500 named herein. Issuance, payment and acceptance of payment are without prejudice to any rights of
INET CHANGES by Change Order $1,064,066.56 the Owner or Contractor under this Contract.

CAUTION: You should sign an original AlA Contract Document, on which this text appears in RED. An original assures that changes will not be obscured.

AIA Documont G702™ —~ 1992 Copyrlght © 1953 1963 1955 1971 1978, 1983 and 1992 by The American Institute of Architects. All rights reserved. WARNING: This AIA” Document is protected by U.S. Copyright Law
| Treatios. 4 lon of this AIA® Document, or any portion of it, may result in severe civil and cri les, and wili be p d to the i extent

posslbls undar the law. Purchasers are permmed to reproduce ten (10) coples of this document when completed. To report copyright violations of AIA Contract D e-matl The Ameri 1 Institute of Archi * legal

counsel, copyright@aia.org. 0107$1ACO44.




SATA Document G703" - 1992

Continuation Sheet Page 2
AIA Document G702™-1992, Application and Certificate for Payment, or G732™-2009, APPLICATION NO:
Application and Certificate for Payment, Construction Manager as Adviser Edition, :
containing Contractor’s signed certification is attached. APPLICATION DATE 11/29/2022
In tabulations below, amounts are in US dollars. PERIOD TO: 11/30/2022
Use Column | on Contracts where variable retainage for linc items may apply. ARCHITECT’S PROJECT NO: 19.p0571
A B c D [ E F G H 1
WORK COMPLETED
MATERIALS TOTAL BALANCE TO
ITEM SCHEDULED PRESENTLY COMPLETEDAND | ~ % RETAINAGE
NO. DESCRIFHON OF WORS VALUE o | reus PERIOD STORED STORED TODATE | (G +C) By (If variable rate)
3 Yol i c-G
(D+E) (Not in D or E) (D+E+F)
Uabor & Materials 1,113,798 1,113,798 0 0 1,113,798 100 0 0
GRAND TOTAL 1,113,798 1,113,798 0 0 1,113,798 100 ) 0 0
CAUTION: You should sign an original AlA Contract Document, on which this text appears in RED. An original that changes will not be ob d.
AlIA Document G703™ ~ 1992. Copyright ® 1963, 1965 1966 1967 1970 1978, 1983 and 1992 by The American Institute of Archil All rights reserved. WARNING: This AIA°Document is protected by U.S. Copyright
Law and Intarnational Treaties. Unauthorized lon of this AIA®D. or any portion of it, may rvsutl in sovere civil and criminal penaittes, and will be prosecuted to the maximum extant
possible under the law. Purchasers are permitied to reproduce ten (10) coples of this d when To report copyrig of AlA Contract D e-mail The Institute of A " legal

counsel, copyright@ala.org. 101210ACOM



Brandt Excavating,inc Thru 11/29/2022
385 E Hoover Street, Morris IL 60450 Date 11/29/2022
Oraw 6/Final

Village of Beecher Lead Water Service Replacements

# | item!Description’” QTy. Qtyithis'Draw " Qty'toDate’ 7 Unit'Cost 71 |
1 INLET FILTERS EACH 10 $ 125.00 | $ b
2 PARTIAL LEAD WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT, 3/4" 5 $ 4,000.00 | $ -
3 FULL LEAD WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT, 3/4" (SHORT) EACH 5 $ 4,000.00 | $ -
4 FULL LEAD WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT, 3/4" (LONG) EACH 5 $ 4,000.00 | $ N
5 PARTIAL LEAD WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT, 1" EACH 80 44] $ 7,500.00 | $ 330,000.00
6 FULL LEAD WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT, 1" (SHORT) EACH 80 52| $ 6,500.00 | $ 338,000.00
7 FULL LEAD WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT, 1" (LONG) EACH 80 38] $ 6,500.00 | $ 247,000.00
8 PARTIAL LEAD WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT, 1-1/2" EACH 5 $ 6,200.00 | $ -
9 FULL LEAD WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT, 1-1/2" (SHORT) |EACH 5 $ 6,200.00 | $ N
10 |FULL LEAD WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT, 1-1/2" (LONG) EACH 5 $ 6,300.00 | $ -
11 PARTIAL LEAD WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT, 2" EACH 5 $ 6,800.00 | $ N
12 |FULL LEAD WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT, 2" (SHORT) EACH 5 $ 6,800.00 | $ -
13 |FULL LEAD WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT, 2" (LONG) EACH 5 $ 6,900.00 | $ N
14 |SANITARY SEWER SERVICE ADJUSTMENT EACH 5 4 3 700.00 | $ 2,800.00
15 |EXPLORATORY EXCAVATION EACH 35 30| $ 20000 | $ 6,000.00
16 |NON-SPECIAL WASTE DISPOSAL CUYD 30 $ 9000 | $ -
17 |CORPORATION STOP TERMINATION EACH 190 103 § 380.00 | $ 39,140.00
18 |SERVICE LINE MATERIAL DETERMINATION EXCAVATION EACH 275 2501 $ 400.00 | $ 100,000.00
19 |3 MONTH WATER FILTERS EACH 600 140| $ 2500 | $ 3,500.00
20 |WATER PITCHERS WITH FILTERS EACH 220 140| $ 50.00 | 7,000.00 |
$ 1,073,440.00
Draw 6/Final
Villag of Beecher {Signature) Totat Oniginal Contract Completed to Date = $§ 1,073,440 00
Total Change Orders Completed to Date = $ 40,358 44
. __)___\— Total Work Completedto Date= $ 1,113,798 44
Brandt Excavating, Inc (Signature) Less Retainage at0% = §

Total Previous Payments = $ (1,085,953.48)
Subscribed And Sworn To Before Me This 30th Day Of

November, 2022 Total Pay Request= § 27,844.96
(Notary Pubjid)
OFFICIAL SEAL
MEGHAN E FEHR

Notary Public, State of Hiinois
My Commission Expires 9-23-2025




(

SWORN STATEMENT FOR CONTRACTOR AND SUBCONTRACTOR TO OWNER

State of Hlinois Estimate No.___6 )
j }
County of __ Grundy Date: November 30th, 2022
The affiant, : Chad Brandt
i {Name)
and says that he/she is President
. (Position)

Brandt Excavating, Inc., 385 E Hoover Street, Morris, IL 60450 * 815.942.4488

being first duly sworn, on oath deposes

contract with

(Firm Name, Address and Phone Numbar)
Village of Beecher

Lead Water Service Replacements

(Kind of Work)

on the following described premises in said County, to-which:

Village of Beecher

County of Will

That, for the purpose of said contract, the following persons have been contracted with, and have fumished, or are
furnishing and preparing materials for, and have done or are doing labor on said improvement. That there is due and to become
due them, respectively, the amounts set opposite their names for materials or labor as stated. That this statement is a full, true

and complete statement of all such persons, and of the amounts paid.

RS

1 2 3 4 5 6 7
Name and Address Kind of Work Adjusted Tota! Total Retained Net 5mviously Net Amount of this |Balance To Become
Contract incl. Including this Paid Payment Due (Incl. Retention)
|Extras and Credits application
Brand! Excavating Inc. GC $729,383.74 $701,538.78 $27,844.96] $0.00
Underground Pipe & Vaive Pipe/Fitlings $128,272.88 $128,272.88 $0.00) $0.00
TMR Services, Inc Trucking $15,434.98 $15,434.98 $0.00 $0.00
LaFarge Stone $1.101.81 $1,101.61 $0.00 $0.00
United Meters, Inc Plumbing/Services $62,605.00 $62,605.00 $0.00 $0.00
Generator Technologies Electrican $5,505.00] $5,505.00 $0.00 $0.00
Superior Excavating Chilorinating/Line Stops $5,080.00 $5,060.00 $0.00 $0.00
Leeps Supply Supplies $7,861.35 $7,861.35 $0.00 $0.00
Conley Excavating Vac Truck $10,790.00 $10,790.00 $0.00 $0.00
Construction Transport | Trucking $8,268.88 $8,268.88 $0.00 $0.00
Matthew Paving Ashphait $78,680.00 $78,690.00 $0.00 $0.00
Schollmeyer LandscapelLandscape $60,825.00 $60,825.00 $0.00
TOTAL $1,113,798.44 $0.00{ $1,085,953 .48 $27,844.96 $0.00
AMOUNT OF ORIGINAL CONTRACT $2,118,650.00| WORK COMPLETED TO DATE $1,073,440.00
EXTRAS TO CONTRACT $40,358.44|EXTRAS TO CONTRACT 0,368.44
TOTAL CONTRACT AND EXTRAS $2,159,008.44| TOTAL WORK COMPLETED TO DATE $1,113,798.44
CREDITS TO CONTRACT -$1,045.210.00]LESS 0% RETAINED $0.00
ADJUSTED TOTAL CONTRACT $1,113,798.44|NET AMOUNT EARNED $1,113,798.44
NET PREVIOUSLY PAID -$1,085,953.48

NET AMOUNT OF THIS PAYMENT $27,844.96

B Cl C! E {Inc. Retention|

It is understood that the total amount paid to date plus the amount requested in this application shall not

EXCEED % of the cost of work completed to date.

| agree to furnish Waivers of Lien for all materials under my contract when demanded.

Signed M

Chad Brandt, President

My Commi

{Position)
Subscribed and sworn to before me this  30th day of
November 2022
3
(Nofaf Pubtic)
OFFICIAL SEAL
MEGHAN E FEHR
The above swom statement should be obtained by the owner before each and dvery/SatafeRublic, State of lilinols

ssion Explres 9-23-2025




FINAL WAIVER OF LIEN
» STATE OF ILLINOIS Gty #

COUNTY OF Grundy Escrow #
TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN:
WHEREAS the undersigned has been employed by Village of Beecher
to furnish ___Lead Water Service Replacements
for the premises known as Various Locations
of which Village of Beecher is the owner.

THE undersigned, for and in consideration of Seventy thousand four hundred ninety eight dollars & 61/100
($27,844.96) Dollars, and other good and valuable considerations, the receipt whereof is hereby acknowledged, do(es)
hereby waive and release any and all lien or claim of, or right to, lien, under the statutes of the State of lllinois, relating to mechanics’
liens, with respect to and on said above-described premises, and the improvements thereon, and on the material, fixtures, apparatus or
machinery furnished, and on the moneys, funds or other considerations due or to become due from the owner, on account of all labor,
services, material, fixtures, apparatus or machinery, heretofore furnished, or which may be furnished at any time hereafter, by the
undersigned for the above-described premises, INCLUDING EXTRAS.*
DATE 11-30-2022 COMPANY NAME ____Brandt Excavataing, Inc

ADDRESS ___ 385 E. Hoover Street, Morris  1E~00450___,
SIGNATURE AND TITLE

*EXTRAS INCLUDE BUT ARE NOT LIMITED TO CHANGE ORDERS, BOTH ORAL AND WRITTEN, TO THE CONTRACT

CONTRACTOR’S AFFIDAVIT
STATE OF ILLINOIS

COUNTY OF _Grundy_

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN:

THE UNDERSIGNED, (NAME)
AND SAYS THAT HE OR SHE IS (POSITION)
(COMPANY NAME) Brandt Excavating, Inc
CONTRACTOR FURNISHING _Lead Water Service Replacements
LOCATED AT Various Locations
OWNED BY ___Village of Beecher
That the total amount of the contract including extras* is $1,113,798.44* on which he or she has received payment of
$1,085,953.48 prior to this payment. That all waivers are true, correct and genuine and delivered unconditionally and that
there is no claim either legal or equitable to defeat the validity of said waivers. That the following are the names and addresses of all
parties who have furnished material or labor, or both, for said work and all parties having contracts or sub contracts for specific
portions of said work or for material entering into the construction thereof and the amount due or to become due to each, and that the
items mentioned include all labor and material required to complete said work according to plans and specifications:

Chad Brandt BEING DULY SWORN, DEPOSES

President OF
WHO IS THE

WORK ON THE BUILDING

NAMES AND ADDRESSES WHAT FOR eyl o] et SRS st

Brandt Excavating, Inc GC $729,383.74 | $701,538.78 | $27,844.96 | $0.00
Underground Pipe & Valve Pipe/Fittings $128,272.88 | $128,272.88 [ $0.00 $0.00
TMR Services Inc Trucking $15,434.98 $15,434.98 | $0.00 $0.00
LaFarge Stone $1,101.61 $1,101.61 $0.00 $0.00
United Meters Plumbing/Services $62,605.00 $62,605.00 $0.00 $0.00
Generator Technologies Electrician $5,505.00 $5,505.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL LABOR AND MATERIAL INCLUDING EXTRAS* TO COMPLETE. Cont to Pg 2

That there are no other contracts for said work outstanding, and that there is nothing due or to become due to any person for material,
labor or other work of any kind done or to be done upon or in connection with said work other than above stated.

paTE \\-20-202°2

SUBSCRIBED AND SWORN TO BEFORE ME THIS

SIGNATURE:

A

Ma0R00ef | 2007

DAY OF

*EXTRAS INCLUDE BUT ARE NOT LIMITED TO CHANGE

\AL%\A/\ é‘:’—ﬂf/\‘
OTARY PUBLIC

pany OFFICIAL SEAL
MEGHAN E FEI-:I?‘“ i
Notary Public, State of Wiino
My Commission Expires 9-23-2025

ORDERS, BOTH ORAL AND WRITTEN, TO THE CONTRACT.

F.3870 R5/96 Provided by Chicago Title Insurance C




FINAL WAIVER OF LIEN

+ STATE OF ILLINOIS Gty #

COUNTY OF Grundy Escrow #
TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN:
WHEREAS the undersigned has been employed by Village of Beecher
to furnish ____Lead Water Service Replacements
for the premises known as Various Locations
of which Village of Beecher is the owner.

THE undersigned, for and in consideration of Seventy thousand four hundred ninety eight dollars & 61/100
($27,844.96) Dollars, and other good and valuable considerations, the receipt whereof is hereby acknowledged, do(es)
hereby waive and release any and all lien or claim of, or right to, lien, under the statutes of the State of lllinois, relating to mechanics’
liens, with respect to and on said above-described premises, and the improvements thereon, and on the material, fixtures, apparatus or
machinery fumished, and on the moneys, funds or other considerations due or to become due from the owner, on account of all labor,
services, material, fixtures, apparatus or machinery, heretofore fumished, or which may be furnished at any time hereafter, by the
undersigned for the above-described premises, INCLUDING EXTRAS.*
DATE 11-30-2022 COMPANY NAME ____ Brandt Excavataing, Inc
ADDRESS __ 385 E. Hoover Street, Morris IL 60450

SIGNATURE AND TITLE

*EXTRAS INCLUDE BUT ARE NOT LIMITED TO CHANGE ORDERS, BOTH ORAL AND WRITTEN, TO THE CONTRACT

CONTRACTOR’S AFFIDAVIT
STATE OF ILLINOIS

COUNTY OF _Grundy_

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN:

THE UNDERSIGNED, (NAME) Chad Brandt BEING DULY SWORN, DEPOSES
AND SAYS THAT HE OR SHE IS (POSITION) President OF
(COMPANY NAME) Brandt Excavating, Inc WHO IS THE
CONTRACTOR FURNISHING _Lead Water Service Replacements WORK ON THE BUILDING

LOCATED AT Various Locations
OWNED BY ___Village of Beecher
That the total amount of the contract including extras* is $1,113,798.44* on which he or she has received payment of

$1,085,953.48 prior to this payment. That all waivers are true, correct and genuine and delivered unconditionally and that

there is no claim either legal or equitable to defeat the validity of said waivers. That the following are the names and addresses of all
parties who have furnished material or labor, or both, for said work and all parties having contracts or sub contracts for specific
portions of said work or for material entering into the construction thereof and the amount due or to become due to each, and that the
items mentioned include all labor and material required to complete said work according to plans and specifications:

CONTRACT PRICE THIS BALANCE
NAMES AND ADDRESSES WHAT FOR NCLDG Extasce | AMOUNTPAID | o\ ol o e
Superior Excavating gl;:;nnatmg/ e $5,060.00 $5,060.00 $0.00 $0.00
Leeps Supply Materials $7,861.35 $7.861.35 $0.00 $£0.00
Conley Excavating Vac Truck $10,790.00 $10,790.00 $0.00 $0.00
Construction Transport Trucking $8,268.88 $8,268.88 $0.00 $0.00
Matthew Paving Asphalt $78,690.00 $78,690.00 $0.00 $0.00
Schollmeyer Landscaping Landscape $60,825.00 $60,825.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL LABOR AND MATERIAL INCLUDING EXTRAS* TO COMPLETE. $1,113,798.44 | $1,085,953.48 | $27,844.96 $0.00

That there are no other contracts for said work outstanding, and that there is nothing due or to become due to any person for material,
labor or other work of any kind done or to be done upon or in connection with said work other than above stated.

DATE

20,2072

SIGNATURE: %_‘

DAY OF MG\J@(\\\DOJ 222
Mghrons EJen.

~rrigEp VAL SEAL
MEGHAN E FEH{I?“‘ o,
Public, State of lllinot
MyNgmmssion Explres 9-23-2025

SUBSCRIBED AND SWORN TO BEFORE ME THIS 30“‘

*EXTRAS INCLUDE BUT ARE NOT LIMITED TO CHANGE
ORDERS, BOTH ORAL AND WRITTEN, TO THE CONTRACT.

F.3870 R5/96 Provided by Chicago Title Insurance Company




JENNIFER BERTINO-TARRANT
WILL COUNTY EXECUTIVE

WILL COUNTY ILLINOIS

JEFF L. RONALDSON, P.E.

DIVISION OF TRANSPORTATION DIRECTOR OF TRANSPORTATION,
COUNTY ENGINEER

P. (815) 727-8476 Division of Transportation
F. (815) 727-9806 16841 W. Laraway Road
E. highways@uwillcountyillinois.com Joliet, IL 60433

December 13, 2022

Mr. Matthew Conner
Public Works Superintendent

Village of Beecher
30251 Cardinal Creek Boulevard
Beecher, IL 60401
Subject: County Highway 24 (Peotone-Beecher Road)
IL Route 50 to IL Route 1
Roadway Resurfacing
Will County
Dear Mr. Conner:
( The Will County Division of Transportation (WCDOT) is preparing their 2023 general maintenance
program which will include the resurfacing of Peotone-Beecher Road from IL Route 50 to IL Route 1. To

be in compliance with the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA), the existing crosswalks and curb
ramps within the limits of the project will need to be brought into compliance. Based on the WCDOT’s
database, the Village owns the pedestrian facilities from Oak Park Avenue to IL Route 1.

It is the intention of the WCDOT to have these pedestrian facilities upgraded as necessary. The cost to
construct these improvements will be the responsibility of the Village based on existing IGAs. Once a
cost estimate has been developed, the WCDOT will share this information and enter into a cost sharing
agreement. Prior to January 13, 2023, please inform this office of the Village’s concurrence with cost
sharing or inform this office of the Village’s plans to improve these facilities.

Thank you for your cooperation, if you have any questions or need additional information, please call me
at 815-727-8476 or e-mail to ewesel@willcountyillinois.com.

Sincerely,

Vel Revabdin

Jeff L. Ronaldson, P.E.
Director of Transportation
County Engineer

Crpmemekeses NRadal




I.HI

*sadA} 4an03 pup|
Se 0] paJlJajal aq ||Im siaAe| UaAas 9say3 ‘Jaye alaH (T 8i4) s10| Bunjied
pue syjemapis ayi| sasepns paned J3ylo pue |leJ pue speod ‘s8ulp|ing
Suipnpoul ainynuiseyul Aes8 pue {Jsiem pue [los 3Jeq ‘||e} 133} OT

"dew JaA0D pue| 8y} ul 8Je ainjdnJiseljul uaals pue
Aeu3 jo sadA) uanas ‘dew Jan03 pue| pue 38ew) 331||91es Jo uosuedwo) :T ‘Si4
; /| - r ¥

— ~—= - paned ;310 [0 R
lles/speoy

s3uipjing . | 4 . . Japun uoneladaa Sulpnjpul ainionJiseljul uaaus Jayjo osje Ing ‘Adoued
__o“wm” ool ) _ 9aJ) saynuap! Ajuo jou 303fosd syl -uoiSay o8ediy) Aunod-udAdS
uoneyasan , 91 SsoJde JaA0D pue| paddew JUOWIBA JO ANSISAMUN BY) pue ‘S1Sa404

Adoues 3311 P §  uedLIBWY ‘DJIAISS 153404 YASN ‘@A1RIIU| $334] uoISay oSediy) syl

‘Adoued ayy
Suipuedxa Joj saiSajedys pue
saiysond dojaasp 01 pue
Pedw! 31so1eau8 a8yl aaey
pjnom sSunjueld mau ausym
Ajiauapi ‘spincud ssaul a19y)
leyy smysuaq 3yl Ajuenb
03 pasn aq ued sdew Adoue)
‘Suluuejd uequn J10j |EIIUID
s Adoued 3313 jOo JuaXd
9yl Buipueisiapun ‘Adoued

J13Y3 JO UOI1EIO0| PUB 3JNIDNJIS ‘BZIS Y] YUM S1e|a.l0d aplaoid saaul 1eyl suyauaq jo apnyusew ayl

*SpooyJoqsiau ul uoisayod |e1dos 3uilsooq pue anjea Auadoud Suiseasoul ‘sajed sawld
Sunpas Ag a4 Jo Ayjenb siuapisas anosdwi pue aypiim Joy lenqey apiaoad saal] ‘sduipjing Suipeys Aq
asn AS1aus 2onpaJ pue 1299 pue|si 13y ueqtn ay3 pue Suipooyj} onpaJ ‘Ajijenb Ja1em pue e anosdwi Asy)
‘'uo puadsp sanijedidiunw eyl suysuaq apiaoad |je Ayl asnedsaq ‘1s8J404 ueqan 3y} Ul papnjaul |je aJe s34}
953y ‘spJeA yoeq s,Juspisal Ul S93J1 Y] USAD pue Seale |einjeu palsaloy ‘saaJ} 19335 Jo dn apew S| 3| “way}
sogeuew 10 SUMO OYM JO ss9|pJeBaJ ‘Su11as ueqsn ue uj s394l 3y} Jo ||e jo pasudwod s 3sajof ungin ayl

MmNy NG | JAILVILINI

. AJewwing 1saJ104 ueqin Jaydaag




(7 "814) %€8 03 Adoued
JI9Yy aseasoul Ajjenuslod pnod  pue
‘19A03 Adoued %g sey Ajpuasind uaydraag
"3|eds |edpiunw 3y} 1e Adoued aquIIsap
OS|e ued elep J9A0D pue| 3saYy]

‘Adoued 15310} ay) puedxa
0} S9}IS |eap] aJe 3say} jey) aau8e pjnom
M3} 1nq ,‘aoeds ajgejueld, se papnjoul
2Je spuowelp |eqaseq pue sp|ay
jedn)ndu8y 'a|qe.ayald Ajuessadau jou s
U ‘Adoued yum pasanod aq Ajjesnaloayy
pinod saoepns 9sayl ajym ieyy ‘ajou
0} juenodwl si 3| 'S93J) 0} P3UIAUOI
949M 22BJNS 3S3Y) JO ||B JI %88 O}
pasies aq Ajjenuajod p|nod yanod Adoued
1eyy Suiuesw ‘ease s,Aunod a3y} Jo %0/
dn a)ew sadA} 1aA00 pue| asayl ‘||e uj
"HOYd [ewiuiw yim Adoued 0} papaAuod
8¢ pnod sadA} J4saA0d pue| 3sayl
se ‘sadA} 4an0d pue| ddepns paned Jaylo
pue |l0s aJeq ‘uonelason 3yl Jayiasoy
Suippe Aq pojugd 8q Ajenuayod
pinod saaJl asaym saoeds Ajjuapr ued
9M "Alunod 3y} ssosde ymous 1o} woold
J0 10] e s) asay] *(z '814) Adoued dau3 Aq
pa1aA0d s| AJuno) |IIM JO %bT ‘lI_ISA0

asming ing
saunwWIED O
s no NOIOZY | &
09VIIHD

a|qeuns
10N
aoeds

3|qeue|d i

Adoues m

paaed J3yio
|ley/speoy m
s3ulp|ing m
121 E

|loS aJeg m
uoljelasap
Adouenr m

*(a) Adoued 03 papaauod aq Ajjennuazod
PINO2 43A02 pue| 3y} Jo %€/ pue ‘(D) Janod Adoued %g sey Ajjuasind Jaydaag *(g) Suppue|d Joy ajgemns

s1 AJunod ay1 Jo %0/ |euonippe uy ‘1aA0d Adoued %pT Suipnjdul ‘(y) 412400 pue| Jualind s,Auno) [jIM 7 Si4

%L

%6
J

Jayoaag

%L

%9

9|geuns
10N
9oedg
djqejueid

AdoueH m

paned Jay10
lley/speoy m
sduip|ing m
e mE
jlos aleg m
uoneasaA m
Adouenr m

%L

%P %%V %t

v
Awno) |im

Alewwng 159404 ueq.n J13Yd33g

aoeds Sunue|d 9|qissod

13A0) puen




's9dA} asn pue| SsoJde JaA0I pue| Ul suoljelseA € 814

asn pue

*S|ie1ap aJow Joy podau siyy

JO pua 3y} ie T 3|qel 9as 'sSuipjing jo duepunqe  Adoued saiim >
ue aAey sadA) asn puej |e]2JoWIWOD pue |eIIUBPISAI uonelasaA m 3
pue ‘speoJ jo uojuodoid 3sasie| ayl aAey sease [0S eieg W w
suesy ‘padxa 1ySiw auo sy 'JaA0d Adoueds 1samoj °EmE g
3yl aAey sAem Jajem pue sajuadod |elasaWWO] _wmm“\_”_m_”m" 5
(€ '814) saipadoisd Ayjian pue sasunod §o8 ul A 2

punoy si Adoued jo a8ejuadiad 3saysiy ayl ‘4ayosaag
u] ‘saiuadosd ded o |elDJWWOI  ‘|elIUDPISDI
M| ‘sadAy asn pue| ssoloe way3 aJedwod ued am
‘AdeA suianied JoA0D pue| MOY puelsiapun Janaq
0] ‘sanjedpiunw ulyum Jou ‘uoi8as dyj ssoloe 9sn pue| Aq J9A02 puej Juddiad
Ajuana painquisip jou si Jan0d Adoue)

amnyg NG | JAILVILING

iy L (Y Ajewwing 1sa1o4 uequn Jaydsag




(v "814)
sysed ul pue ‘saiuadosd jeuonnnyiisul pue |einynouse
ul punoj aJe adeds 3jqejueld jo suoipodoid 3saysiy
ay3 ‘4ayd9aag u| 'ymmous 10) wood Jsow ay) aney sadAy
asn puej yoym Ajjuspi ued am sal08d1ed ddepns
paaed Jayjo pue |i0s aieq ‘uone}a8an Sujuiquiod Ag

imIng N0 | JALLVILINI
S3NUNLWOY IO $3331

IO 0ovsIHD

‘'sadAy asn pue| ssosoe aseds Sujjue|d ajqissod pue Adoued jualin) ¢y Si4

asn puel
X N SRR
/ﬁ»@ A/.I.Y /VV/VV \V/.v
9@47 ,v@o@7 Z.//?O %@vv yooo R /@,voo. N /@/ov@ R
%0
%01
%0C
AdoueH m s
aoeds aodd
a|qeue|d i %05
10N %0L
%08
%06
%0071

93ejudduad doeds s|gejueld

duepunge juadiad

Alewwng 159104 ueg.in Jaydaag




‘ainynou8e Aq pamoj|oj ‘9sn pue| [eljuapisad si pue| Jo Aysofew ay] :g 814

asn pue’

CAN
D
W

@.@1/

Adoue) saul m
uone28ap m
|loS aled m
191\l
s3ulp|ing m
|ley/pecy m
paned Jayio

(sauoe) BPALY

‘a4nyndLi8e Aq pamoj|oy ‘|eryuapisad s
pue| sy jo Ayuofew ayj ‘(s '814) 1aydaag u) ease
llews AjaAne|as e dn sayew sadAl asn pue| asayl
‘(t ‘814) adeds sjqeiueld jo uonodosd ysiy e 3sn pue| Aq eaJe J9A0D pue]
aAey sysed pue sajnuadoud [euoinsul 3jIYM

009

X T

aining o
SaURWWO3 G
soon o _NOIDIY | \o]

09VDIHD Y

AJewwing 152104 ueq.n Jaydaag




%S9  TITT %P8  9'8ST %0'L LTET %6'T 898 %80 ¥'ST %199 TTSIT %E'6  0Q'SLT  dduepunqge |ejo]

%TOT €0 %00 00 %IZ TO %I'SS PT %00 00 %I8 L0 %8E 10 =EM
%0'S Ss9 %S0 90 %9°0 L0 %S €'e %6°S 9L %IVL 896 %60T TYT juedepn
%L TT %S0 00 %08 L0 %BLYT €1 %00 00 %6°1S 9V %L TT Ann
%STT  LTZE€  %6TS 66VT %90 9T %00 00 %L0 6T %IUE tv'S9  %TTIT LIE wsues|
%S9 T'9¢ %8°0 (474 %T'8T ©00T %9'¢ €07 %L0 194 %885 697¢ %STT T'H9 |euapisay
%S't 60 %00 00 %V'T €0 %V'v 60 %9°S 1 %108 79T %0V 80 jied
%6'LT 90T %9'T 60 %TET 8L %00 (] %0'T 90 %619  L9€ %EV 9T |euonnlsu|
%60 81 %00 00 %E0 9'0 %S't S'6 %00 00 %L'T8 T'SLT %L'TT 8L 309
%9'9E 667 %v'T 6T %vIT €8T %00 00 %00 00 %SSE 067 %LE 9T |e12s2WwW0)
%v0 TT %0 0T %y0 TT %00 TO %00 00 %86 9T0S %I'9 TEE 2imnousy
UB2Idd Saldy JUIAJ SAINNY QA SAIIY UIIIAY SAIIY AU SAIdY UG S3IIY JUIIIdY Saldy
paned J2y30 |les puespeoy  s3uipjing 138 M l0s a.eq uonejsdap  Adoued adu) ‘|elyuapisal Aq pamojjo} ‘Adoued ay3 Suiseassul
‘sadAy ash pue| Ssosoe 13A0d pue| jo Alewwns :T d|gel J0j |ernualod 35318343 3y} sey ainyndusy :9 Si4
ash pue’
» d
"s30| Supjaed uj 10 ‘sajoy usamiaq ‘sasnoy gnd punode ssujjue|d NS N N o%,.ma s /%%.
N \3 N\ S N \
3aJ) Joj adeds aney Ajjuanbaly sasinod jjoo "saiuadosd juedea RENT R e R
Jo wawdojaaap 3y} Suimojjo} auop aq osje pinod siyl ‘sadAy e 0
asn pue| 13yjo 0} papaAuod ase sajpadoud asayy H sSuijue|d = 001
Lo E e R
934} 38eunodua p|nod  sadueulpto  ‘saipuadoid  jeunynouSe Adoues m e : =
uo 3jqisea} aq 1ou 31w saaJ) Sunueld apym ‘Adoued aauy asow soeds 1 n— . ooz v
e | ? o4 [\
aAey 1ey) saiuadoud 10j s)easq Xe) J31eMWwI0lS JO ‘uoijentasald sjqeweldm i = - g
9941 38eunodoud jeyy sadueulpto  ‘shemeaniS 2313 ysSnouyy 3|qeuns | g <
s9as) aJow jueid 03 paSesnodus aq pInod siaumo Auadoud 1N ~ oov
|ennuapisay ‘Adoued aseasou 0} sa1833e.1S JUIIPYIP dJINbAI [|IM el X
sadA} asn pue| 9say3 O yoea ‘1anamoH ‘Adoued ay1 Suipuedxa i 00S
ul 1oedwi 15918348 31 aAey p|nod seaue 3say) Suyasie] ‘(9 ‘Bi4) 009

Adoued 01 papaau0d 3q Ajgissod p|nod jeyl eale }Sow 3y} aAey
sadA] asn pue| 3s4n0d }|08 pue jJuedeA ‘|eljuUaPISAI ‘B1nYNd1ISY

eaJe 2deds ajqelue|d

amng ang

S . Alewwns 353104 ueqgJdn J3ydaag




‘aJjaydsowne ay3 wouy uoqJed Suinowad pue Ayjenb

Jie Sujaoadwi ‘a93emuuiols Supndsaualul Suipnjdul ‘syyauaq periAw Jayo saad) i/ aindiy

Y20 TES ‘191eMuloIS

2uming inQ | JALLVILING

SIUUMWIOD N0
saa11 InQ

GGT'9$ ‘palalsanbas uogred

O9VIIHD

618'T¥$ ‘Anenb ay

"000°€8T$ |eUOHIPPE UE jB Pan|eA S| YdIym ‘uogJed
JO 10| & 310)s Os|e $33J) IS3aY] S}J2U3q JO YLOM 000°6LS
yum Apjedidiunw ayy apiaoad saad) sdaydasg ‘4eah yoeg
‘adedspue 934]-1 YIM pale|ndjed 319m SanjeA assy| "Ja40
Jayosag ul (Auadoud sjeaud pue dignd sasuy Suipnjoul)
S93J) 9yl JO {|e 1eyy suyauaq ayy smoys / aunsi4
*810°sj003193.] | }sIA ASojopoyiaw
pue sj00} @a1]-1 UO uoljewJojul iow 104 ‘A3ojoipAy
pue Adoued jo sjuawssasse ajeds adeaspue| 03 ‘S91J0IUBAUI
99.] 341U 0] ‘9941 |ENPIAIPUI UB WO} ‘S3|eds Jo AlalleA e je
S11Jouaq 93J] 31ejNJJeD 0] SIASN MO||e ASY] 'SDIAIDS 159404
SN 9yl Aq padojaAap sem S|00} O dUNS 3a4]-1 YL

‘san|jea Apadoud
95E240U| S93J3 1Y) Bulueaw ‘s3943 d10W dAey
1ey3 saiadoud Ang Ajjeniuasasald sjuapisay e
"3uipooyy
9onpaJ djay pue Ja1emuiiols 3dadJaiul Ay] e
"Jle 9yl wouy
sjueln|jod sAOwWaJ pue 3pIxolp uogled 3103s Aay] e
*s8uip|ing Suipeys pue sainjesadway
22ejuns udnpas Agq ASiaud anes saau) ueqin e

:9|dwexa Jo4 ‘paziudodal Ajipeal
aJe 1ey) sanayisae ayl puoAaq Jej o8 sanjea asayl pue
‘apinosd saa41 eyl sanjea ayy Ajauenb o) o) sn pamojje
SBY Ydieasay ‘d|gen|eA Ajpwasixa aie sa94) uequn

Alewwing 152104 uegin Jaydaag




|wl

'sainjesadwial Jamo| aney o031 pua) Adoued 93Ul Jaysiy aAey 1eyl sealy "$T0g Joquaidas wouy a8ew
1espue| e Suisn paje[najes sem 232823 9Je4INS m._Bm._mQEwu 9dejuns smoys s wﬁ uo pue Adoued 834} smoys Y| ay3 uo adewi ay] :g aInsi4

25,

e § oy
0/ wm _ W ﬂ( w T o Adoued mm

07| .
ainesadwal 4

"9](e1404W0D 310w S3111D Supjew pue sainjesadwa) ueqsn Supnpad ul jnydjRy
Ajjedadsa aq ued s3uip|ing punose pue s3o| Supjled ul saaay aiow Bunue|d (8 94n814) saunjesadwia) 3deHNS JaMO| SARY 0} puad) Adoued 33.3 aJow 3Aey

ey} sease ueq ‘Sujood aAijelodeAs ySnolayl pue saoeuns 3ing Sulpeys Aq sainlesadwa) uequn Jamo| djay saaJ] "Yieap asned UIAS URD 1By WX
pue ‘syuapisaJ 0} sanssi Yijeay jo AjalieA e asned os|e ued 3| ‘s3ulp|ing ulyim AB1aua Jo asn ay} asealdu) saunjesadwal ueqn ysiH "1994a puelsi jeay
ueqJn 3yl se umouy si siy] ‘}eay se )| asea|al pue A31aua s,uns ayj qiosqe JuswaAed pue s3ulp|ing asnedIsq seaJe [ednJ Uey) 49110y 3q 0} pual SN

aiming o
sanmnuAwe g
soamo | NOIO3Y ]

Q9VDIIHD - -

AJewwing 1sa104 ueg.n Jaydaag




'sloqyS|au s}l pue Jaydaag JO JaA0I pue| Jo uosiiedwo) g 34nSi4

Allunwwo)

%0
%07
Adouenr m %0t o
1]
uopelaap\ m %0€ m
jlos alegm >
OO Q
ST | AN
sBupjing M %S o
|ley/speoy B 2
! %09 °
paned
1Yo %0L
%08
%06
%8 %01 %9 %9
%001
SaIUNWWOD 3UIPUNOJINS Ul JOAOD pue] ‘(6 "814) s1oqysiau

S} jo ||e ueyl Adoued ss9| sey J4ayd33g

amngng | JAILVILING

(S AJewwng 159104 uegin Jaydaag




|OH|

"0T0Z PUB 6EGT Ul paulewal j|13s SWaisAs0da asay JO Yoiym smoys dew siy|
"JUBWI|}3S UBJIIBWY-04nJ 0} Jolud Juepunge aJam swalsAsoda yeQ :0T a4nSi4

*JOARIPU? SIY} ul d|3y pjnoad 1ey) syusawndop uneald si |1y syeo Sunue|d
JO s|JauUaq 3yl aquIsap eyl sinopuey Jo ‘sheme-aAl8 9aJ) 3Y1| swesSosd ysnoayy
auop 3q p|nod siyl ‘sadAl asn pue| || SSOJoE dduepuUNge SHEO ISedIIU] 0} SIDUMO
pue| [elpJowWWod pue SjudpIsas yum Supjiom uapisuod osje ysiw sanyijedounpy
‘pasn 3q ued syeo asaym 3ejd Ajuo ayl jou ase sSunueld jedpiunpy
‘uol8aJ uno uj syeo jo Adeda| ay3 anunuod pue ‘AsIaAlp sa123ds aseasdu) djay
ued s)eo Jo asn papuedxa ayj ‘seale ueqdn ul A|DAI103))9 pasn 3Q ued SHeo Moy
$4915910} Yoea)} 0} pue ‘saselq 9say) [2dsip 03 SSAIIIS |1YD 'S93J) 193J3s se Ajood
op Asy) 1Y) 2A31|9q S4315340) 3snedaq s)eo ploAe sajyjeddiunw Auepy ‘sSupueld
jedpiunw Ul asn 419y} SuiSeinodus pue ‘sease |einjeu ul judwaseuew eo
Suinosdwi apnjpul suoYs S,3 °|LYD JO SN0y Jofew e S| swIsAs003 yeo Suliolisay
‘way} uo puadap
JBY3 3IP|IM pue s3I3sul ‘spaiq 3y} 1o} jenqey anosdwi 03 pue ‘AsiaAlp saads
aseaJldul 01 aAI9s p|nod ‘sayse SulAp aoe|das 03 s)eo Suisn 1o ‘saai] dyeo |euoippe
8uippy ‘%5 9 s s3unueld dqnd ui syec oy a8esdAe |edpiunw Y3y ‘Apuann)
‘Adoued suoi8as 3y} Jo %09 dn apew SHEO ‘JUBWI|}ISS UBDIIAWY-04nT 0} JOLd
‘up|d A19n023Y WalsAs023 YDO S,5S3UIBP|IM 08eary) aas ‘uoidas o8edyd
3yl Ul SwI1SAS0Id }eo UO uoljewJojul dJo0Ww 404 ‘uoi8as oSedly) 3yl ul ulewal
SWI1SsAs029 )eo Jo %/T AjuQ "uoi83J JNO WoOJj SHEO Y} JO Auew parowal sey
udwdolaAap pue 3aunyndii8e 0] seale [eJNjeu JO UOISIDAUOD ‘JIDASMOH "uoi8al ay}
ul sa19ads 3343 Juepunge 3sow 3yl dJoM ASYl ‘JUDWDIIBS UBDLIBWY-04NT 0} IOl
‘wayy punode mol8 sjuejd yoiym asuanjul Aayl pue ‘sjewiue sS3|3uNod Joj pooy
pue jenqey apinoid Asy) "A80|029 s,uoidas 1no uj sa129ds duolIsAd)Y e ale syeQ

aming g 5 - o .
SonUNLALOD NG
soasg inQ NOIO3Y | \» o \—
P ]

O9OVIIHD

A
SYEO JuawWaes-ald dew 15 s z L 0
|dojssims *(Bud a1 M S—
syeo 6g6L [ der us3 ‘Aanins
28039 ‘NVOMN
$3e0 0102 I 10D d Juawaioul

H ‘uUs3 :s82in0S
fuepunog jediduny D

: puaban

[

]
5100 pre] [EXTRE
Apeys

SIONIT

b3
Bm

~

esan.
Ho

3&ds

1880 vy A
PP Se

-y -

3

AJewwing 152104 ueq.n Jayoaag




I.HHI

.wt_gnco_mmh Ajunop
lealyi e siing \ww_uCDOU uot3ay M AusHpoiy e jlepuay aue)| adednq %003
AJluapow pue ayeq ul |- %0
juepunge jsow ayl ale %S
Aay] "saipunoo ||e ssoioe %01 .
3ouepunge aAISeAU] %St &
0, 3
Apoop :ZT a4ndi4 %0C m-..,
%ST €
a
%0¢ 9
3
%S€
%0V
Adouey m
Swais W %Sy

%05
‘uioyanqg sy yieauaq suimoud ale salnads
19410 OU JeY] 30N “13I1Y] UIOYPING V 1T T 34nS14 "9WOH @ UOo11eAIaSUOD) 31| sweadoud Jo uoisuedxa Jo ‘Ajadoud a1jgnd uo [eAowaa aAISeAul
- R : 8uluiejdxa a8eu8is apnjoul p|nod Siy] "p40IIE UMO JI1DY} JO }I SAOWSI 0} Wway) 98einodua ued
sjuapisal Sunesnpa Ing ‘Ajsadoud ajealud uo sBuijue|d 21e101p 0} }NJLHP SI ) 'Seale jeunieu
0] [9AeJ] AjIsea ued spaas 9y} se ‘sasn pue| |je woJsy uioypPpng aAowdl 0} aAiresadwl st 3
‘Auadoud a1eand uo 3sixa A1 $93J3 9say) ‘saaJ) paseuew s Ayjedidjunw Suowe apjansAauoy
pue ujoyppng may AJSA ale auayl IIIYM “(ZT '814) apmm-uoi8alr dnewsjqold Buiwodaq
aJe Asy1 Inq ‘sainuno) e pue adedng 00D U] JUBpUNCE 1SOW Y3 d4e SIAISBAU] APOO
‘uoljesauasau yeo pasnpas
0} SJ01nqi4luod Suiped] ay) Jo duo aue Asy] ‘sease |eanjeu u| (TT Si4) wayl punose Suimols
wouj s9123ds JaYylo juanaad pue ‘s19yd1yl asuap 1eatd Aayl ‘sjewlue pue sjuejd sAileu o}
aAindnus|p AjawaJixe aJe ei1aual yjog ‘seale jeanjeu olul passadsip aq 03 spass ayy Sumoje
‘apjonsAsuoy pue uioypdng Aq padnpoud salsuaq ay)l 1ea spaig "uolleAlnd padeasa aaey Aayy
1Nq ‘sudwidads |BJUSWERUIO SB PaJNPOJIUI 3JIM SNIYS 3SaY] ‘UOoISaJ By} Ul $23J4) 934Y3 Ul duo
1sowje dn axew sappPnsAsuoy ysng pue uioyppng ueadouny ayl| saads aaiseaul Apoop

= * = € -1
£ .

Alewwng 1sa104 ueq.n Jaydaag




